
to be considered in 1981, nominations 
must be submitted no later than 6 March. 
Nomination forms should be requested 
from the Executive Office at the AAAS 
address. 

A Fellow is defined as "a member 
whose efforts on behalf of the advance­
ment of science or its applications are 
scientifically or socially distinguished." 
Examples of areas in which nominees 
may have made significant contributions 
are research; teaching; technology; serv­
ices to professional societies; adminis­
tration in academia, industry, govern­
ment, and other institutions; and com­
municating and interpreting science to 
the public. 

Responsibility for reviewing and ap­
proving fellowship nominations is as­
signed to the Nominating Committees of 
the 21 Section Committees. Each Nomi­
nating Committee consists of the four 
Section officers (Retiring Chairperson, 
Chairperson, Chairperson-Elect, and 
Secretary) and four members-at-large. 
An affirmative vote of at least five of the 
eight members is required for approval, 
but sponsors of a rejected nomination 
may appeal to the Committee on Council 
Affairs for possible reversal of the Nomi­
nating Committee's decision. 

Nominations are also subject to chal­
lenge by any member of the AAAS 
Council, upon receipt of a preliminary 
list of nominees in late summer. A chal­
lenged nomination, if not withdrawn by 
its sponsors, will be reviewed by the 
Committee on Council Affairs; the Com­
mittee may either put it on the slate to be 
presented to the Council for possible 
election at the 1982 Annual Meeting in 
Washington, D.C., or defer its presenta­
tion for 1 year. Following the 1982 meet­
ing, new Fellows will receive fellowship 
certificates, and a list of their names will 
be published in the Proceedings Issue of 
Science. 

A Directory of AAAS Fellows is avail­
able from the AAAS Product Sales Of­
fice, 1515 Massachusetts Avenue, NW, 
Washington, D.C. 20005. The price to 
AAAS members is $5.40 prepaid. 

Filmstrips Added to 
SB&F Reviews 

Reviews of science filmstrips will be­
come a regular feature of Science Books 
& Films (SB&F), beginning in the cur­
rent issue (September/October). 

Through a recent survey of sub­
scribers, SB&F editor Michele M. New­
man confirmed that many teachers and 

librarians feel a strong need for critical 
reviews of science filmstrips to assist 
them in selecting these materials for 
classroom use. The first series of science 
filmstrip reviews covers a wide range of 
topics—from killer whales to solar ener­
gy-

Calling upon AAAS members as well 
as the magazine's corps of regular 
reviewers, SB&F staff have in recent 
months assembled a group of scientists 
in all fields who have experience using 
filmstrips. Staff have also contacted all 
major filmstrip distributors. Future is­
sues of SB&F will provide reviews of 
filmstrips in all fields of science for view­
ers at all grade levels, from elementary 
and junior and senior high school to the 
first 2 years of college. 

SB&F, which has been published by 
the AAAS for the last 15 years, regularly 
supplies book and film reviews to more 
than 4000 schools and libraries through­
out the United States and the world. 

Members who have suggestions about 
materials which should be reviewed, 
who would like to serve as reviewers, or 
who have comments about the reviews 
themselves, should write to Michele M. 
Newman, editor, SB&F, at the AAAS 
address. 

Fellows Participate in 
Orientation Program 
and Begin Work 

Thirty-eight men and women started 
year-long assignments in Washington, 
D.C, on 2 September, with a 2-week ori­
entation program organized by the 
AAAS. The group includes 28 Congres­
sional Science and Engineering Fellows; 
three Science, Engineering, and Diplo­
macy Fellows; and one Nutrition and 
Food Safety Fellow with the Congres­
sional Research Service. In addition, six 
congressional fellows sponsored by the 
Office of Technology Assessment (OTA) 
participated in the AAAS orientation 
program. 

The Congressional Science and Engi­
neering Fellows Program, which began 
in 1973 with four participating societies 
and seven fellows, now involves nearly 
30 fellows and 20 participating profes­
sional societies. In its eighth year, the 
program provides the opportunity for 
competitively selected scientists and en­
gineers to make practical contributions 
toward the more effective use of scien­
tific knowledge in the legislative process. 
It also helps broaden the perspective of 

both the technical and the congressional 
communities. 

The Science, Engineering, and Diplo­
macy Fellows Program, initiated in col­
laboration with the U.S. Department of 
State, is new this year, as is the Nutrition 
and Food Safety Fellowship at the Con­
gressional Research Service. This is the 
third year of the OTA-sponsored Con­
gressional Fellows Program. 

The AAAS-organized orientation pro­
gram includes broad exposure to Wash­
ington—the members, committees, and 
staff of Congress; the Executive Branch, 
including specific agencies and groups 
within the White House such as the Of­
fice of Management and Budget; and nu­
merous presentations by nongovernment 
groups designed to give the group of fel­
lows the best possible introduction to the 
setting in which they will be working for 
the next year. 

For the more than two dozen Congres­
sional Science and Engineering Fellows, 
the 2 weeks following the orientation 
program—the placement period—are a 
time of both great growth and great anx­
iety. Responsible for finding their own 
places within the Congress, and guided 
by the information they have received in 
the orientation as well as assistance from 
the AAAS and their sponsoring so­
cieties, the fellows knock on many doors 
and talk to many members of Congress 
and staff before making a decision. By 
the first week in October each of the 24 
fellows whose fellowships actually begin 
in September has found a position for the 
year. (Four of the fellows will begin their 
work in January.) The fellows will work 
on such issues as energy, health, child 
and family policy, education, foreign af­
fairs, small business issues, and food. 

AAAS not only serves as the coor­
dinator for the overall program in its var­
ious announcement and selection stages 
but also organizes the orientation, devel­
ops a year-long seminar program, and 
helps to provide general coherence to the 
entire experience. The OTA fellows pro­
gram is administered by that agency. 
OTA fellows do, however, participate in 
both the orientation and seminar pro­
gram run by the AAAS. 

Along with the nearly two dozen other 
societies, AAAS selects and sponsors 
one or more fellows each year. 

This year's Congressional Science and 
Engineering Fellows, their sponsoring 
organizations, and congressional sites 
are: Samuel F. Baldwin, American Phys­
ical Society (APS), office of Senator Paul 
E. Tsongas (D-Mass.); Jonathan Bloom-
Feshbach, Society for Research in Child 
Development (SRCD), office of Senator 
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