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The U.S. defensive policy with 
regard to chemical warfare has been 
marked by indecision for some years, 
with the Administration repeatedly 
resisting Defense Department pres- 
sure to modernize the country's stocks 
of nerve gas. There now appears 
to be momentum building in favor 
of a decision to replace these stocks 
with binary weapons, which mix to 
form lethal nerve gas only after a 
projectile has been launched. 

The Defense Science Board last 
month convened a panel that met for 
2 weeks in San Diego to take a com- 
prehensive-and, some say, long 
overdue-look at America's posture 
with regard to chemical weapons. Ac- 
cording to John Deutch of the Massa- 
chusetts Institute of Technology, who 
headed the meeting, the group came 
to a threefold conclusion; they agreed 
that it is time to deactivate existing 
unitary nerve gas weapons, to replace 
them with limited stocks of binary 
weapons, and to upgrade protection 
and training for troops. 

The government has not been able 
to decide what to do about chemical 
weapons stockpiles in Colorado and 
Utah, but Deutch says there was a 
"strong feeling" among members of 
the panel that "the government face 
up to its responsibility," which would 
entail spending perhaps $4 billion to 
demilitarize the stocks. 

The panel believes the United 
States cannot rely either on its supply 
of nuclear weapons or on convention- 
al armaments to deter Soviet use of 
chemical weapons. The members 
concluded that if the Soviets decide 
on first use of such weapons, the 
means must be at hand to compel 
their troops to bundle up in protective 
gear too, and also to pose a threat to 
their airports and other rearguard sup- 
port operations. 

The group, which will be issuing a 
report within a month, also wants a 
good deal more attention paid to anti- 
chemical warfare equipment and 
training and to research on effects of 
nerve agents and antidotes. 

Deutch says the group did not 
agree with the objections of chemical 
weapons expert Matthew Meselson of 
Harvard, who fears that replacing 
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existing stocks with binary weapons 
will make them appear to be more pal- 
atable. Nor did the group think that the 
increased safety in handling of bi- 
naries would make their use more at- 
tractive to terrorists and other sub- 
national groups, since these groups 
do not have much of a hang-up about 
safety anyway. 

The panel also disagreed with Me- 
selson's contention that U.S. entry in- 
to production of binary weapons will 
make the Soviets more suspicious of 
us and cause them to drop whatever 
res,iaints they have been exercising 
on their production and use. Deutch 
says the panel believes there is "sub- 
stantial evidence of Soviet activity 
with chemical weapons now" and 
that, if anything, a decision to go bi- 
nary is likely to make them more ea- 
ger to arrive at an anti-chemical war- 
fare accord, for which negotiations are 
now under way in Geneva. 

The National Security Council is 
currently engaged in a study which 
will recommend on whether existing 
weapons should be replaced by bi- 
nary weapons. No doubt the unani- 
mous conclusion of the recent meet- 
ing will carry considerable influence in 
these deliberations. 
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Ivory from elephant tusks is com- 
monly known as the "bullion" of the 
wildlife products trade. With world- 
wide inflation climbing, ivory now 
competes as an investment with jew- 
els, art, and antiques. The price of 
ivory reached $34 a pound this year, 
up from $2.30 in 1970. 

The poaching and smuggling of Af- 
rican elephants has, not unsurprising- 
ly, reached massive proportions. In 
fact, most ivory now entering world 
trade comes from poached elephants. 
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An important stage in the French 
breeder reactor program was marked 
on 21 August when the 700-metric ton 
steel cauldron that will hold the core of 
the Super-Ph6nix reactor was swung 
into position at Creys-Malville, 60 ki- 
lometers east of Lyon. 

The 1200-megawatt reactor is a Eu- 
ropean project under French leader- 
ship. Last month France decided to in- 
crease the European character of her 
breeder program by inviting Britain to 
participate in the development of the 
next breeder, a 1500-megawatt reactor 
with better production costs. 

The partnership would make sense, 
not least because the two countries' 
breeder technologies are very similar. 
But France is asking for a $50-million 
entry fee. If the British government 
pays, it will face furious criticism from 
those who believe British breeder 
technology is on the same level with 
that of France. 
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The World Wildlife Fund, which re- 
cently helped sponsor a 3-year survey 
of African elephants, has just an- 
nounced a $1.1 million fund-raising 
campaign to combat the illegal ivory 
trade. In announcing its "African ele- 
phant action plan," the organization 
said that 50,000 to 150,000 elephants 
are being killed illegally each year 
from a total African population of 
about 1.3 million elephants. Zaire, al- 
though it is a signatory to the Conven- 
tion on International Trade in Endan- 
gered Species, is the principal of- 
fender. 

The elephant campaign will include 
direct measures for conservation and 
habitat protection, lobbying of govern- 
ments to strengthen enforcement of 
wildlife laws, and attempts to in- 
troduce conservation education pro- 
grams into African schools. Some 
money will also go for protection of 
Asian elephants, of which no more 
than 20,000 remain. 

Constance Holden. 

vvuliu vviiuiilc ruilu ivIpUV 

The World Wildlife Fund, which re- 
cently helped sponsor a 3-year survey 
of African elephants, has just an- 
nounced a $1.1 million fund-raising 
campaign to combat the illegal ivory 
trade. In announcing its "African ele- 
phant action plan," the organization 
said that 50,000 to 150,000 elephants 
are being killed illegally each year 
from a total African population of 
about 1.3 million elephants. Zaire, al- 
though it is a signatory to the Conven- 
tion on International Trade in Endan- 
gered Species, is the principal of- 
fender. 

The elephant campaign will include 
direct measures for conservation and 
habitat protection, lobbying of govern- 
ments to strengthen enforcement of 
wildlife laws, and attempts to in- 
troduce conservation education pro- 
grams into African schools. Some 
money will also go for protection of 
Asian elephants, of which no more 
than 20,000 remain. 

Constance Holden. 

vvuliu vviiuiilc ruilu ivIpUV 

The World Wildlife Fund, which re- 
cently helped sponsor a 3-year survey 
of African elephants, has just an- 
nounced a $1.1 million fund-raising 
campaign to combat the illegal ivory 
trade. In announcing its "African ele- 
phant action plan," the organization 
said that 50,000 to 150,000 elephants 
are being killed illegally each year 
from a total African population of 
about 1.3 million elephants. Zaire, al- 
though it is a signatory to the Conven- 
tion on International Trade in Endan- 
gered Species, is the principal of- 
fender. 

The elephant campaign will include 
direct measures for conservation and 
habitat protection, lobbying of govern- 
ments to strengthen enforcement of 
wildlife laws, and attempts to in- 
troduce conservation education pro- 
grams into African schools. Some 
money will also go for protection of 
Asian elephants, of which no more 
than 20,000 remain. 

Constance Holden. 
12 SEPTEMBER 1980 12 SEPTEMBER 1980 12 SEPTEMBER 1980 1215 1215 1215 


	Article Contents
	p. 1215

	Issue Table of Contents
	Science, Vol. 209, No. 4462, Sep. 12, 1980, pp. 1161-1284
	Front Matter [pp. 1161-1188]
	Letters
	Nucleic Acid Sequence Bank [p. 1182]
	Dismissed Australian Scientist [p. 1182]
	Cocoa, not Cocaine [p. 1182]

	Erratum: Cell Variants Showing Differential Susceptibility to Ultraviolet Light-Induced Transformation [p. 1182]
	Karl Marx was a City Boy [p. 1187]
	High-Frequency Skywave Radar Measurements of Hurricane Anita [pp. 1189-1196]
	Estimating Cancer Risks from Low Doses of Ionizing Radiation [pp. 1197-1203]
	Federal Funding in Materials Research [pp. 1203-1207]
	News and Comment
	DOE Leads Synfuels Crusade without a Map [pp. 1208-1210]
	Carter Plan: Dividend for R & D [p. 1210]
	Los Alamos--Coming to Terms with the 1980's [pp. 1211-1214]

	Briefing
	Republican Candidate Picks Fight with Darwin [p. 1214]
	Chemical Warfare: Panel Promotes Binaries [p. 1215]
	France Seeks European Team to Develop Breeder [p. 1215]
	Remember the Elephant [p. 1215]

	Research News
	Prenatal Diagnosis of Neural Tube Defects [pp. 1216-1218]
	Jovian Weather: Like Earth's or a Star's? [pp. 1219-1220]

	Annual Meeting
	Science and Technology: Bridging the Frontiers [p. 1221]
	Meeting Information [pp. 1222-1233]
	Preliminary Program [pp. 1223-1229]

	Book Reviews
	Theoretical Physics [p. 1234]
	Stellar Associations [pp. 1234-1235]
	Mesolithic Europe [pp. 1235-1236]
	Developmental Biology [p. 1236]

	Reports
	Voyager Detection of Nonthermal Radio Emission from Saturn [pp. 1238-1240]
	Human Cutaneous Leishmania in a Mouse Macrophage Line: Propagation and Isolation of Intracellular Parasites [pp. 1240-1242]
	Cerebral Arteriolar Damage by Arachidonic Acid and Prostaglandin G$_{2}$ [pp. 1242-1245]
	2-Aminoethylphosphonic Acid Metabolism during Embryonic Development of the Planorbid Snail Helisoma [pp. 1245-1247]
	1α,25-Dihydroxyvitamin D$_{3}$ Nuclear Receptors in the Pituitary [pp. 1247-1249]
	Cultivation in vitro of the Quartan Malaria Parasite Plasmodium inui [pp. 1249-1251]
	Electrophoretic Injection of a Fluorescent Dye into Giant Mitochondria and Mitoplasts [pp. 1251-1252]
	Auditory Brainstem Anomalies in Human Albinos [pp. 1253-1255]
	Human Aging and Spatial Vision [pp. 1255-1256]
	Tumoricidal Response Induced by Cytosine Arabinoside after Plasma Perfusion over Protein A [pp. 1257-1259]
	Stress-Induced Eating is Mediated through Endogenous Opiates [pp. 1259-1261]
	The Spinal Frog Takes into Account the Scheme of its Body during the Wiping Reflex [pp. 1261-1263]
	Biological and Sociocultural Effects on Handedness: Comparison between Biological and Adoptive Families [pp. 1263-1265]

	Back Matter [pp. 1230-1284]





