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Peut-On Prevoir les Catastrophes Natu- 
relles? MARCEL ROUBAULT. Presses Uni- 
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Marcel Roubault is a distinguished 
French geologist and member of the 
French Academy of Sciences who has 
participated in several committees of 
investigation following natural catas- 

trophes. His book was prompted by the 
fact that the actions of state and local 
authorities and of the affected popula- 
tion subsequent to a "natural catastro- 

phe" in many cases invite its renewal. 
Roubault examines in detail five 

types of disasters, namely, floods, earth- 
quakes, landslides, avalanches, and the 
rupture of dams; most of his examples 
are from France. 

The outcome of his investigation is 
that although the causes of the catas- 
trophes may not be foreseeable at any 
given instant, enough is known of their 
effects to permit measures to prevent 
or minimize destruction of property and 
life. Among the obstacles to such mea- 
sures are public ignorance and inertia 
and the cupidity of speculators. Fur- 
thermore, many elected officials have 
appealed to the supposed inevitability 
of natural disasters to exonerate them- 
selves for not having taken preventive 
measures. 

In France, floods have been among 
the most destructive of natural phe- 
nomena. The authorities of some river 
basins, notably the Rhone, have taken 
united action in flood control, but 
others are only now beginning. Warn- 
ings of impending floods can be given 
but often are not, owing to the diffi- 
culty of allocating responsibility be- 
tween local and departmental govern- 
ments. 

The area of France most likely to be 
affected by destructive earthquakes is 
the Mediterranean coast. This area has 
also been the scene of rapid develop- 
ment to profit from tourism. Most 
buildings have been erected without 
regard for possible earthquakes. The 
effects of the recent San Gabriel earth- 
quake in California are evidence that 
this is not a uniquely French phenome- 
non. 

Roubault treats the other three phe- 
nomena in like manner, and again hu- 
man fallibility is seen to be the root of 
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As with the natural phenomena, these 
problems are not peculiar to France, 
and their examination is pertinent. Fol- 
lowing the numerous natural catastro- 
phes that have occurred recently, Rou- 
bault's book is very timely, and its 
perusal by the inhabitants of the dis- 
tressed areas would no doubt clarify 
the reasons for their distress. As popu- 
lations grow and more and more land 
basically unsuitable for building, such 
as flood plains and unstable hillsides, 
is utilized, more "natural catastrophes" 
can b2 expected. 

This book deserves to be read by 
the general audience for which it was 
written, for the author presents facts 
that are inaccessible to most. The style 
is simple and direct and the vocabulary 
is such that readers with a limited 
knowledge of the French language 
should not hesitate to undertake read- 
ing the book. 
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