
Letters Letters 

Computer Costs: Two Alternatives 

In his letter (12 Jan.) Bastable offered 
a suggestion to help deal with the prob- 
lems associated with the costing of com- 
puters at academic institutions. He pro- 
posed that the cost be recovered in part 
by setting a rate which apportions a 
fraction of total operating cost by use, 
and that the remaining fraction of cost 
be recovered through a pool of indirect 
costs. Such a system is one among many 
which have been under study by federal 
agencies. A broader discussion of the 
subject of computer costs may be of 
general interest. 

Among the purposes which systems 
of rate charges may serve are: (i) to 
effect a procedure to fully recover the 
costs of operating equipment; (ii) to 
effect a priority system for the use of 
equipment; and (iii) to provide a deci- 
sion mechanism for choosing the most 
economical vendor of equivalent serv- 
ices. The procedure followed at uni- 
versities and colleges, insofar as charges 
are made to federally sponsored activi- 
ties, follows the Bureau of the Budget 
Circular A-21 and is intended to serve 
the first of these purposes. Under this 
procedure, total costs for the operation 
of computers are distributed to all users 
at a rate proportional to their use of the 
equipment, but investment decisions 
about equipment needs are left to each 
institution. 

Some view the operation of this 
policy in terms of a two-person game 
between "the institution" and "the spon- 
sored users." It is instructive to consider 
two common situations from this view- 
point. 

Case A: The objective of institution 
A is to maximize the utilization of 
equipment by its students and faculty. 
By prior agreement the sponsored users' 
strategy is fixed; they share in the total 
cost of operation until their funds are 
exhausted. Institution A adopts the 
strategy of permitting its students and 
faculty to fully utilize the equipment 
without regard to their sponsorship, a 
strategy which requires that the institu- 
tion bear any resulting difference be- 
tween the total fixed operating cost and 
the income recovered from sponsored 
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users. As a consequence, no time re- 
mains unutilized for the purposes which 
the institution had in mind in acquiring 
the equipment, and the rate charged is 
as low as is consistent with the institu- 
tion's total needs. 

Case B: Institution B seeks to max- 
imize the utilization of equipment by its 
students and faculty with the added 
constraint that its share of total oper- 
ating costs not be greater than a fixed, 
predetermined fraction. The users' strat- 
egy being fixed as in Case A, institution 
B follows a strategy which results in 
limiting its utilization of equipment to 
a fixed fraction of that of its sponsored 
users. Thus, both players must accept 
the fact that, under this strategy, each 
may pay a fixed price for an arbitrarily 
small utilization of equipment and that 
substantial time can remain unavailable 
for use by either. This strategy is feas- 
ible, moreover, only if the income from 
users will cover the fraction of costs 
assigned to them at the outset. 

The decisions which lead different in- 
stitutions to adopt either of these poli- 
cies are complex. Academic investment 
decisions stem from each institution's 
evaluation of its future academic re- 
quirements and the availability of funds 
to meet these requirements. Thus, some 
institutions invest in large, comprehen- 
sive libraries, whereas others content 
themselves with smaller, more select 
holdings and invest the differential 
funds elsewhere. Today, all institutions 
face difficult decisions in attempting to 
accommodate the rapidly increased re- 
quirements for costly computers within 
severely limited budgets. Some of these, 
however, have already decided to em- 
phasize their computer investments at 
the expense of other requirements, 
hoping to develop their leadership in 
newer areas which are, or may become, 
heavily computer-dependent. Such insti- 
tutions tend to reflect the situation de- 
scribed in Case A. Other institutions, 
having already committed themselves to 
major investments in other areas, now 
face a decision either to reduce expendi- 
tures in these investments in order to 
accommodate computer costs or to 
await new sources of funds to help ac- 
commodate this need. A small number 
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of these institutions reflect the situation 
in Case B. 

At a time when the rate of increase 
in sponsored income to all institutions 
is insufficient to cover the rate of in- 
creased costs of computer investments, 
institutions following either strategy 
must expect to bear greater costs to 
maintain this rate of investment. Clearly, 
no simple adjustment in the rate pro- 
cedure described in Circular A-21 can 
provide a global solution to this prob- 
lem. 

MILTON E. ROSE 

Office of Computing Activities, National 
Science Foundation, Washington, D.C. 

Census: A Probe into Privacy? 

The proposed legislative curbs on the 
scope of the decennial census should be 
of serious concern to anyone committed 
to the social responsibility of science 
("Privacy: Curb sought on census," 5 
April, p. 51). The type of information 
that would be excluded would make it 
impossible to conduct secondary anal- 
yses of census data by economists, soci- 
ologists, urban planners, and demog- 
raphers. Just at a time when, hopefully, 
the political climate may finally become 
receptive to the need for social planning 
to solve basic socioeconomic and urban 
problems, the factual foundation for 
such planning will disappear. 

There can be no question as to the 
need to preserve the anonymity of indi- 
viduals, but this should not be achieved 
by denying social scientists and social 
planners the richness of data they have 
had access to through census. Reason- 
able safeguards can be, and have been, 
maintained by census. Further protec- 
tion may be needed, but not along the 
lines proposed by Representative Betts. 

IRVING CRESPI 

Gallup Organization, Inc., 
53 Bank Street, Princeton, New Jersey 

Some users of decennial census data 
express alarm over my efforts to remove 
the penalty ($100 fine or 60 days in jail) 
from most proposed questions and 
otherwise shorten the questionnaire. I 
suggest that statistical users should 
worry instead about the efficacy and ef- 
fectiveness of 1970 census plans. Here 
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is why: 

1) Reputable market and opinion re- 
search leaders have indicated that the 
present 120 questions on the census 
long form exhaust the tolerance of the 
respondent and will likely result in a 
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Not Nalge . . . the innovator 

in plastic labware. We also 

make space-saving SQUARE 
bottles. Wide-mouth for con- 

venience, popular 6-8-16-32 

oz. sizes, molded of unbreak- 

able linear polyethylene. 
Also, polypropylene wide- 

mouth square jar with hand- 

grips in 1 gal. size. Specify 
Nalgene? Labware from your 
lab supply dealer. Ask for our 
1968 Catalog or write to Dept. 
21172, Nalgene Labware Di- 

vision, Rochester, N.Y. 14602. 
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vast undercount. According to figures 
quoted in a House hearing, pretests for 
the 1970 census show a declining re- 
sponse to the questionnaire: Louisville 
(1964), 84 percent; Cleveland (1965), 
75 percent; New Haven (1967), 72 per- 
cent; and North Philadelphia, under 40 
percent. This form requires an 8th- 
grade education and a minimum of 33 
minutes to complete, provided the re- 
spondents have the information and 
willingness to cooperate. 

2) Among many Americans there is 
growing resistance to the built-in harass- 
ment of the proposed 1970 census. I 
predict refusals to answer the utility 
questions and those of a very personal 
nature will be high if the threat of fine 
and jail is not removed. That all ques- 
tions justify mandatory response is 
wholly unjustifiable. 

3) The crux of the issue is: Which is 
more important, the number of toilets, 
and so forth, in America or a complete 
headcount? I suggest that the Census 
Bureau will get a hodgepodge on both 
unless alternative ways to get detailed 
population, household, and employment 
data are developed. May I advance this 
proposal for your readers' considera- 
tion: defer many of the questions to a 
sample household survey to be con- 
ducted every 2 years, leaving the decen- 
nial census to serve its constitutional 
function-a headcount of the popula- 
tion for apportionment purposes. 

Census policy has concerned itself 
exclusively with the user community 
which, over the years, has caused the 
decennial questionnaire to grow like 
topsy. I represent more than a trivial 
group in Congress and the nation when 
I urge reform on behalf of the statistical 
givers, their privacy, and their toler- 
ance. 

JACKSON E. BETTS 

House of Representatives, 
Washington, D.C. 20515 

Who Stages Military Coups? 

Scott (Letters, 29 Mar.) mars an 
otherwise thoughtful discussion of draft 
policy by saying "One alternative, a 
large professional army, is so potentially 
dangerous from the viewpoint of a 
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possible military coup and dictatorship 
that it should not even be considered." 
Is there any reason to believe this? Has 
any correlation been shown between the 
absence of conscription and the inci- 
dence of coups? I think not. Nor is this 
surprising. After all, coups are usually 
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staged by colonels and generals, who 
are nearly always professionals even in 
conscript armies. 

For that matter, why should we as- 
sume that professional soldiers are any 
less committed to their nation's institu- 
tions than are civilians or conscripts? 
We might more easily suppose the re- 
verse, since they have chosen to risk 
their lives in their nation's service. The 
occurrence of a military coup is no 
evidence that the military are any more 
disaffected or megalomaniacal than 
other elements of the society; the ob- 
vious explanation is that they are the 
element with the best chance of suc- 
ceeding in a coup, and therefore the 
most likely to try. I suggest that the 
military coup is a symptom of a sick- 
ness of the whole society, and not of 
anything peculiar to military profes- 
sionalism. 

GEORGE W. PRICE 
1439 West North Shore Avenue, 
Chicago, Illinois 60626 

Fireflies of Thailand 

My thanks to Science and the Bucks 
for the very interesting report on fire- 
flies ("Mechanism of rhythmic syn- 
chronous flashing of fireflies," 22 Mar., 
p. 1319). How resourceful are the male 
fireflies of Thailand thus to enhance 
the signal-to-noise ratio for reception 
of the female response! 

STANLEY M. SEIDMAN 
3470 Norwood Road, 
Shaker Heights, Ohio 44122 

Buchanan at St. John's College 

The announcement of the death of 
Scott Buchanan (12 Apr., p. 174) in- 
correctly identified him with St. John's 
University; it should have read St. 
John's College, in Annapolis, Maryland. 
Buchanan was dean of St. John's and 
Stringfellow Barr was its president in 
1937 when they introduced its "radi- 
cally traditional" curriculum involving 
the "great books." During recent years 
these men have been fellows of the 
Center for the Study of Democratic 
Institutions in Santa Barbara, Califor- 
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The announcement of the death of 
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correctly identified him with St. John's 
University; it should have read St. 
John's College, in Annapolis, Maryland. 
Buchanan was dean of St. John's and 
Stringfellow Barr was its president in 
1937 when they introduced its "radi- 
cally traditional" curriculum involving 
the "great books." During recent years 
these men have been fellows of the 
Center for the Study of Democratic 
Institutions in Santa Barbara, Califor- 
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verse, since they have chosen to risk 
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