
K. M. Jack; Joseph Koelreuter, 1733- 
1806, and William Herschel, 1738- 
1823, both by R. C. Olby; Antoine 
Lavoisier, 1743-1794, by D. J. Knight; 
Henry Cavendish, 1731-1810, by D. C. 
Goodman; Alessandro Volta, 1745- 
1827, by C. G. Vosa; and James Watt, 
1736-1819, by J. D. North. Although 
these subjects were chosen as "repre- 
sentative" of their age, the book is not 
an epitome of late-18th-century sci- 
ence. There is no effort to show the 
group to be representative, or indeed, 
to suggest what that might entail, and 
there is no indication of the reader to 
whom this uneven collection of essays 
is addressed. In short, the collection has 
no meaning beyond the fortuitous asso- 
ciation of biographies which may have 
independent interest. 

We turn, therefore, to consideration 
of the individual essays. Three of these 
must be welcomed as filling the gaps in 
accessible science-biography. The study 
of Lamarck is, however, disappointing 
in its failure to fit this French botanist 
and zoologist, notorious for his evolu- 
tionary speculations, squarely within 
the "romantic" metaphysical trends of 
the turn of the century. The Koelreuter 
biography is more successful, though 
its descriptive approach does not quite 
justify the selection of the German 
plant-hybridizer, neglected in his own 
day, as representative of 18th-century 
botany. The sketch of Volta is disap- 
pointing in the frame of an inadequate 
summary history of electricity. 

The remaining essays have the ad- 
vantage of continuing studies by histo- 
rians. That on the French chemist La- 
voisier is the most successful, for it 
admirably summarizes the recent work 
of Henry Guerlac. As recent work on 
Cavendish is primarily the rewriting of 
an unsatisfactory work nearly a cen- 
tury old, this essay on the English na- 
tural philosopher can only retail the 
current myths. The essay on Watts adds 
to plethora. It is marred by frequent 
minor errors but is graced with a con- 
cern for economics and with a detailed 
analysis of the inventor's favorite de- 
vice, the "parallel-motion" linkage. Fi- 
nally, the study of Herschel uses the 
recent investigations of Michael Hoskin 
but remains pedestrian and descriptive 
and fails to justify the choice of the 
British astronomical observer over some 
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