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This English translation of Reiter's 
Meteorologie der Strahlstrime (1961) 
is a monograph on many aspects of 
atmospheric motions; its extensive de- 
scriptive discussions are supplemented 
by brief summaries of certain related 
theoretical material. The total body of 
fact and interpretation collected here 
is impressive, but the wisdom of its 
organization and the significance of 
many points are open to serious ques- 
tion. 

The book serves a useful purpose in 
that it incorporates in a single volume 
coherent summaries of a great many 
recent research papers. The bibliogra- 
phy is 74 pages in length, the text 433 

pages; this ratio of one to six gives a 
fair impression of the exhaustive scope 
of the work and. of the necessarily 
limited depth of the discussion. In con- 
trast to the bibliography, the index is 
only seven pages, and this too gives a 
fair impression of my reaction to the 
book-the names of the authors stand 
out more strongly than the physical 
concepts with which they were con- 
cerned. 

Reiter's account of the results of 

Project Jet Stream is well organized and 

clearly presented; for many readers it 
is probably the best part of the book. 
Other topics of which Reiter has made 
useful summaries include wind mea- 
surement, model experiments, and the 
influence of mountains. 

In my opinion, "jet stream meteorol- 

ogy" no more exists than does "polar 
front meteorology" or "south wind me- 
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with the atmospheric field of motion, 
and he obviously knows that jet streams 
are descriptive abstractions of certain 
detectable features of the field. But the 
title leads to arbitrary choices: the in- 
version wind maximum passes the test, 
the convection cell does not, the mon- 
soon is accepted, the sea breeze is not. 
And the title leads to distortions in 
emphasis and in interpretation-for ex- 
ample, "The second jet maximum . . . 
draws its energy from an anticyclone 
. . ." (p. 239)-so that it would be 
dangerous to recommend this book to 
readers not already fairly sophisticated 
in meteorology. 

ROBERT G. FLEAGLE 
Office of Science and Technology, 
Washington, D.C. 

Theoretical Models 

Luminescence in Crystals. D. Curie. 
Translated from the French edition 
(1960) by G. F. J. Garlick. Methuen, 
London; Wiley, New York, 1963. xii 
+ 332 pp. Illus. $8.50. 

Scientists who desire to know more 
about luminescence in crystals are for- 
tunate in having a book on the sub- 

ject written by an expert, D. Curie, 
and translated by another expert, G. 
F. J. Garlick. The "treatment is mainly 
theoretical," and its chief emphasis is 
on theoretical models for explaining 
the many interesting and important 
phenomena that involve the emission 
of light from crystals. With a few brief 
exceptions at the end of the book, 
there are no descriptions of experi- 
mental apparatus and measurements or 
discussions of practical applications. 
There are careful definitions of terms 
and thorough descriptions and explana- 
tions of all the phenomena connected 
with luminescense in crystals. There 
is a comprehensive bibliography with 
about 1400 references. The book is 

clearly written. It is especially helpful 
in that it gives mechanisms and models 
to explain and predict the emission of 
light under widely varying types 'of 
stimulation. 

The material covered includes spec- 
tra and probabilities of emission and 
absorption, configurational coordinate 
diagrams, optical transitions in photo- 
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