
ing summer to help in-service teachers 
who are taking summer work for ad- 
vanced degrees. Awards were made to 
institutions in which curricula for mas- 
ter's degrees in tcaching include sub-
stantial emphasis on subject content in 
scicnce and mathematics. 

I n  addition to its grant to improve 
teaching, the company will give $290,000 
to universities for fundamental research 
and $165,000 for postgraduate fellow-
ships in scicnce and engineering, includ- 
ing grants-in-aid of $15,000 cacll to ten 
universities and $10,000 cach to nine 
others. There arc also summer research 
grants of $1500 each to 20 universities. 
These are to cnablc younger stag mem- 
bers of university chcmistry department.; 
to undertake research of thcir own during 
thc summer months. 

Finally, the company is awarding 43 
fellowships for the next academic year, 
13 in chemistry, 16 in chemical cngineer- 
ing, six in biochemistry, four in mcchani- 
cal engineering, and two each in physics 
and metallurgy. As in previous ycars, Dn 
Pont is making the awards to the collcges 
and universities, with the dctailcd usc of 
the funds lcft up to them. 

Lafayette's Olin Hall 

Lafayettc College's ncw Olin Hall of 
Engincering Scicnce, built with a $1,-
250,000 grant from the Olin Foundation, 
was dedicated recentlv. It  will house thc 
physics, chemistry, and mathematics dc- 
partmcnts. The buildlnq contains 15 
offices for 36 faculty members; two draft- 
ing rooms for 90 students; 15 laboratories 
for 295 students: tcn classrooms for 340 
studcnts; a chemistry lecture room for 
200 students, and a physics lecture room 
for 100 students. 

Laryngoscope in Music 

'l'he laryngoscope has apparently 
found a useful place in the ficld of 
music. William A. C. Zrrffi, a voice and 
speech tcachcr at  the New School for 
Social Research, has reported that he 
uscs the instrument to drtcrmine a sing- 
er's voicc typc. 

Voicc identification is risually left to 
the teacl~er's jndgmcnt. Rut bccause of 
bad singing habits or because of the hu- 
man ability to imitate valious sounds, a 
voicc is sometimes misidentified. This 
can lead to improper training, bad sing- 
ing habits, or even the shortening of a 
singer's career. These difticulties can be 
avoided by using the laryngoscope. Thc 
teacher simply looks at the length of thc 
vocal cords. Thc shorter the cord$, tht. 
higher the voice; thus a soprano has 
shorter cords than a contralto, and a 
tenor has shorter cords than a bass. 
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Technical Publication Index 

A new Index  of Technical Publzcatzons 
has been published by thc National Ad- 
visory Committee for Aeronautics, 1512 
EI St., NW, Washington 25, D.C. 'l'hc 
222-page volume is the fifth supplement 
to the basic 1919-49 indcx. 

The new index covers NACA research 
rcports issued from June 1955 through 
Junc 1956, and reports published prc-
viously but declassified in thc same pc- 
riod. The arrangement lists reports in 
numerical and cl~ronological order of 
subjects, and includes alphabetical in-
dcxcs of subjects and authors. 

Aerojet Reactor Training Program 

Acrojct-Gcncral Nucleonics, San Ra- 
mon, Calif., reactor manufacturer, has 
announced that it is establishing a reac- 
tor training proqranl that will bc avail- 
able to industry, cc,!leqcs and universitics, 
thc medical ficld, and power utilities. 
Thc new I-week coursc will allow the 
participant to handle nuclear controls 
and reactor hardware, such as control 
rods and fuel elmlcnts, in addition to 
receiving instruction in nuclcar rcactor 
thcory, operations, and licensing requirc- 
ments. Students will participatr in as-
sembling a rcactor and secing it go 
critical. 

G.E. Summer Fellowships 
at Stanford 

The General Electric Educational and 
Charitable Fund for high-school teach- 
c.rs of mathematics, chemistry, or phyq- 
ics will establish a summcr fellowship 
proqram a t  Stanford University. Fifty 
high-school mathematics teachers, to be 
selected by the university from high-
school faculties in 14 western states, tvill 
have an opportunity to study new aspect.; 
of thcir subject as wcll as thc applica- 
tion of nlathematics to science and in- 
dustry. 

Paul W. Rcrq of Stanford's mathemat- 
ics department will direct the program, 
which will consist of three courscs: the 
first will survey number theory, projec- 
tive geometry, and other ficlds bordering 
on high-scl~ool subjects; the second will 
deal with the fundamental concepts of 
the calculus; the third will be a seminar 
on the methods of problcm solving. The 
seminar will attempt to help the teach- 
ers in their twofold job of challcnqing 
the curiosity of high-school studcnts and 
dcvelopinq in them a scientific temper 

In  addition to classroom work, the 
fellows will take field trips to Gcneral 
Electric laboratory and manufacturin? 
facilities in the San Francisco Bay area. 
Special lectures will be ~ i v e n  by mem-

bers of the company's management, sci- 
entific, and cngincering staffs. 

Instruction will bcgin late in June and 
last 6 weeks, with the company paying 
all expenses, including transportation. 
This is the firm's sixth summer fellow-
ship program and the first in a westcrr 
university. 

Drop in Shock Therapy 

The Veterans Administration rcports 
that electric and insulin shock treatment 
for mental illness has been reduced by 
an estimated 90 percent a t  V11 mental 
hospitals through usc of thc ncw tran-
quilizing drugs. Ivan F. Ecnnett, chicf 
of psychiatric research in the VA cm-
tral olfice at  Washington, D.C., nladc 
the estimate from a representative sam-
pling of VA neuropsychiatric hospitals 
throughout tllc nation. 

Microbiologists Join 
IGY in Antarctica 

The U.S. National Conlmittcc for the 
International Geophysical Ycar has ap- 
proved the Society of American Bac-
teriologists' project for a rnicrobiological 
survey in Antarctica to be undertaken 
during 1957-58 in conjunction with the 
IGY program that is already planned for 
the region. This is thc first oficially 
recognizcd biological program to be in- 
cluded in this country's IGY plans. T h e  
National Committcc considers that t h ~  
project, "while nongeophysical in nature, 
offers the prospect of providing vcry im- 
portant and significant scientific infor- 
mation concerning the microbiological 
aspects of Antarctica." 

The SAR participation in the Ant-
arctic program is being formulated by a 
committee composcd of Claude E. Zo-
Bcll (chairman), Richard 11. McRce, 
and Frederick D. Sislcr. Inquiries should 
be directed to Dr. Claude B. ZoBell. 
Scripps Institution of Oceanography, La 
Jolla, Calif. 

RCA Special Systems Department 

The Radio Corporation of America 
has cstablishcd a special systems and dc- 
velopment department that will be dc- 
voted to the planning and devclopment 
of electronic systems for future military 
needs. C. B. Jolliffe, vice president and 
technical director of R.C.A., has beer1 
appointed manager of the new depart-
ment. Other exccutivc posts in the de- 
partment are as follows: A. W. Vauce, 
chief systems engineer; G. L. Dimmick, 
chief development engineer; A. C. Gay, 
manager, projects engineering; and E. W. 
Pritchard, administrative engineer. 



The new department will embrace the 
systems engineering groups of the David 
Sarnoff Research Center, the general en- 
gineering development section of the de- 
fense electronic products organization, 
and an R.C.A. advanced development 
engineering group which for more than 
a decade has concentrated on new elec- 
tronic techniques and on mechanical and 
optical devices associated with elec-
tronics. 

ONR Mathematics Associateships 

Five universities have been selected to 
participate in a program sponsored by 
the Office of Naval Research that will 
provide research associateships in mathe- 
matics to postdoctoral candidates. Those 
taking part are the universities of Cor-
nell, Tulane, Michigan, Washington, and 
Wisconsin. 

Proposed Legislation 

Of the many bills introduced in Con- 
gress, some have a special relevance to 
science and education. A list of such 
bills introduced recently follows: 

S 200. Provide for control and eradi- 
cation of water hyacinth and certain 
other aquatic plant growths. Long ( D  
La.),  Ellender ( D  La.) Senate Agricul- 
ture and Forestry. 

H R  294. Amend Agricultural Act of 
1949 and Agricultural Act of 1954 re 
brucellosis eradication program for fiscal 
year ending 30 June 1958. Laird ( R  
Wis.) House Agriculture. 

H R  347. Establish public use of na-
tional forest as policy of Congress. Met- 
calf ( D  Mont.) House Agriculture. 

H R  377. Provide for compulsory in- 
spection by U.S. Department of Agricul- 
ture of poultry and poultry products. 
Polk ( D  Ohio) House Agriculture. 

S 19 1. Provide for loans to individuals 
for purpose of enabling them to obtain 
a college or university education. Langer 
( R  N.D.) Senate Labor and Public Wel- 
fare. 

S 197. Authorize an emergency 2-year 
program of federal financial assistance in 
school construction to states and local 
communities. McNamara ( D  Mich.) 
Senate Labor and Public Welfare. 

H R  306. Provide program of grants 
and scholarships to encourage education 
and training in field of nursing. Lane 
( D  Mass.) House Interstate and Foreign 
Commerce. 

H R  390. Provide for loans to enable 
needy and scholastically qualified stu-
dents to continue post-high-school edu- 
cation. Rodino ( D  N.J.) House Educa- 
tion and Labor. 

H R  397. Encourage expansion of 
teaching and research in education of 

mentally retarded children through 
grants to institutions of higher learning 
and to state educational agencies. Rodino 
( D  N.J.) House Education and Labor. 

S 201. Authorize comprehensive proj- 
ect for control and progressive eradica- 
tion of salt-marsh and other injurious 
mosquitoes in coastal area of southwest 
Louisiana. Long ( D  La.) ,  Ellender ( D  
La.) Senate Public Works. 

S 230. Amend title V I  of Public 
Health Service Act, as amended, to make 
certain nonprofit corporations and asso- 
ciations eligible for federal aid under 
such title. Mundt ( R  S.D.) Senate Labor 
and Public Welfare. 

H R  366. Amend Federal Food, D r ~ l g  
and Cosmetic Act for protection of pub- 
lic health, by prohibiting new food addi- 
tives not adequately pretested to estab- 
lish safe use under conditions of intended 
use. O'Hara ( R  Minn.) House Inter-
state and Foreign Commerce. 

H R  383. Provide for establishment of 
Bureau of Older Persons within Depart- 
ment of Health, Education and Welfare; 
authorize federal grants to assist in de- 
velopment of operation of studies and 
projects to help older persons. Rhodes 
( D  Pa.) House Education and Labor. 

H R  483. Authorize comprehensive 
project for control and progressive eradi- 
cation of salt-marsh and other injurious 
mosquitoes in coastal area of southwest 
Louisiana. Thompson ( D  La.) House 
Public Works. 

H R  373. Establish Commission on the 
Aging. Ostertag ( R  N.Y.) House Educa- 
tion and Labor. 

H R  307. Provide for establishment of 
U.S. Foreign Service Academy. Lane ( D  
Mass.) House Foreign Affairs. 

H R  491. Provide for appointment of 
an Assistant Secretary of State for Inter- 
national Cultural Relations. Thompson 
( D  N.J.) House Foreign Affairs. 

S. 84. Establish Defense Cloud Modi- 
fication Act of 1957. Case ( R  S.D.) 
Senate Armed Services. 

H R  453. Amend Veterans' Readjust-
ment Assistance Act of 1952 to provide 
education and training rights for persons 
enlisted in armed forces of U.S. during 
January 1955, but who were not on ac- 
tive duty on 31 Jan. 1955. Smith ( D  
Miss.) House Veterans' Affairs. 

S 37. Protect security of U.S. by pre- 
venting employment by U.S. of persons 
found to be disloyal to U.S. Malone ( R  
Nev.) Senate Post Office and Civil 
Service. 

S 195. Amend first section of act en- 
titled "An act to prohibit payment of 
annuities to officers and employees of 
U.S. convicted of certain offenses," ap-
proved 1 Sept. 1954, to limit its applica- 
tion to cases involving national security. 
Langer ( R  N.D.) Senate Post Office and 
Civil Service. 

H R  399. Authorize and direct Civil 

Service Commission to make study of 
classification of and rates of basic com- 
pensation payable re technical, scientific 
and engineering positions in classified 
civil service. Rogers ( D  Colo.) House 
Post Office and Civil Service. 

S 67. Provide for issuance of special 
postage stamp in honor of those leaders 
who pioneered in field of mental health. 
Carlson ( R  Kan.) Senate Post Office and 
Civil Service. 

S 68. Provide for issuance of special 
postage stamp in honor of Dr. Samuel J. 
Crumbine, who pioneered in field of pub- 
lic health education. Carlson (R  Kan.) 
Senate Post Ofice and Civil Service. 

S 77. Establish Chesapeake and Ohio 
Canal National Historical Park and pro- 
vide for administration and maintenance 
of a parkway in Maryland. Beall (K 
Md.) Senate Interior and Insular Affairs. 

H R  392. Designate building to be con- 
structed as principal office of Atomic 
Energy Commission under act of 6 May 
1955 as Enrico Fermi Building, provide 
for establishment therein of appropriate 
memorial to Fermi. Rodino ( D  N.J.) 
Atomic Energy. 

H R  435. Prohibit discrimination be- 
cause of race, color, religion, national 
origin or ancestry. Roosevelt ( D  Calif.) 
House Education and Labor. 

S 32. Direct Secretary of Interior to 
convey certain public lands in Nevada 
to Colorado River Commission of Ne-
vada, acting for Nevada. Malone ( R  
Nev.) Senate Interior and Insular Af- 
fairs.. 

S 258. Establish U.S. Commission on 
Aging and Aged. Potter ( R  Mich.) Sen- 
ate Labor and Public Welfare. 

H R  424. Establish Commission on 
Civil Rights in executive branch of gov- 
ernment. Roosevelt ( D  Calif.) House 
Judiciary. 

S 86. Provide for experimental re-
search program in cloud modification. 
Case ( R  S.D.) Senate Interstate and 
Foreign Commerce. 

H R  370. Provide that standard time 
be measure of time for transaction of 
business in interstate and foreign com-
merce. O'Hara ( R  Minn.) House Inter- 
state and Foreign Commerce. 

H R  478. Provide that one floating 
ocean station be maintained at  all times 
in Gulf of Mexico to provide storm 
warnings for states bordering on Gulf of 
Mexico. Thompson ( D  La.) House Mer- 
chant Marine and Fisheries. 

H R  48 1. Authorize comprehensive 
project for control and pregressive eradi- 
cation of obnoxious aquatic plant 
growths from navigable waters. Thomp- 
son ( D  La.) House Public Works. 

S 7. Provide for establishment and op- 
eration of laboratory for study of utiliza- 
tion of soil and water resources of south- 
eastern U.S. Thurmond ( D  S.C.) Senatc 
Agriculture and Forestry. 
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