
The publicity alarmed consumer groups and 
prompted several members of the British 
Parliament to call for a moratorium on ge- 
netically engineered foods. Biotech compa- 
nies staged a defense. 

Facing "a megacrisis that we didn't re- 
motely anticipate," Rowett director Philip 
James decided to look into the details of 
Pusztai's experiments himself-nly to dis- 
cover that these were, he says, a "total mud- 
dle." The data presented on the TV show 
were from a trial in which the rats had been 
fed nontransgenic potatoes, with Con A 
added later, instead of transgenic potatoes. "I 
couldn't believe what I was suddenly being 

$ told," says James. He says F'usztai's team had 
f also canied out some experiments with trans- 
a genic potatoes, but these contained GNA-a 

different lectin found in snowdrops. 
After the discovery, James suspended 

Pusztai indefinitely. "We immediately sealed 
the laboratories and took the data, according 
to the guidelines of the Medical Research 
Council," says James. He ordered Rowett se- 
nior scientist Andrew Chesson, a member of 
the European Union work group on trans- 
genic food safety, to analyze the data and re- 
port to the British Ministry of Agriculture, 
Fisheries, and Food and to the European 
Union. James says Pusztai, 68, will retire; he 
was unavailable for comment. "He's totally 
overwhelmed, the poor guy," says James. 

The incident has left a bitter taste in the 
mouths of biotech boosters. It "caused a 
tremendous amount of confusion among 
consumers, which will take years to undo," 
claims Anthony Arke of EuropaBio, a Brus- 
sels-based biotech association. Even if the 
studies show that lectin-containing potatoes 
are harmful to rats, says Arke, that would be 
little reason for concern, because detecting 
hazards early on is exactly what experiments 
like the ones carried out at Rowett are for. 
Says Arke: "This only proves that the safety 
assessment procedures are fine." 

-MARTIN ENSERINK 

Martin Enserink is a science writer in Amsterdam. 

leading role is likely to be more controvaial. 
Last week, the President's Information 

Technology Advisory Committee (PITAC), 
a 26-member panel of prominent computer 
scientists and industry executives, recom- 
mended that the government add $1 billion 
over 5 years to the estimated $1.5 billion it's 
now spending each year on information 
technology (IT) research. The new money 
would go to revitalize basic research on 
software, hardware, and computer net- 
works. The committee's interim report also 
called on the government to revive the 
large, long-term projects that proved so pro- 

Scaling up Computer scientists say more basic re- 
search is needed to build a bigger, faster Internet 

ductive in the 1970s and '80s. 'The future 
great ideas that are not going to pan out for 
15 years aren't getting enough support 
now," says computer scientist Ken Kennedy 
of Rice University in Houston, Texas, 
cochair of the panel, the latest of several to 
call for more federal IT spending (Science, 
7 August, p. 762). 

Economists have estimated that one-third 
of U.S. economic growth since 1992 has 
come from the blossoming of the Internet 
and other computer-related businesses. But 
the basic research that spawned these prof- 

ment of larger, longer term basic studies. 
The panel estimates that the government 
spends as little as 5 percent of its IT budget 
on basic studies lasting more than 5 years. 
To bolster basic research, committee mem- 
bers would like to see a return to grant-mak- 
ing strategies that once allowed funders, 
such as the Pentagon's Defense Advanced 
Research Projects Agency (DARPA), to put 
dozens of researchers on problems for 
decades at a time. The DARPA strategy, says 
the report, gave researchers "enough re- 
sources and &e to concentrate on the prob- 
lem rather than on their next proposal. . . . It 
is this spirit that the Committee would like 
to see reborn and replicated." 

In particular, the panel wants to see more 
research into robust software, faster super- 
computers, and "scalable" communications 
networks able to shoulder the burden of a 
billion users-a number the Internet is ex- 
pected to hit by 2005. Private companies, it 
says, simply aren't able to make the neces- 
sary long-term commitments. The commit- 
tee also wants social scientists to study how 
the new technologies will shape society. 

Whether NSF, the preeminent supporter 
of single-investigator studies in the non- 
biomedical sciences, is up to orchestrating 
such a revival of large-scale basic research, 
however, is an open question. Kennedy and 
others say that the panel picked NSF to dole 
out up to half of any new funds and to coor- 
dinate the overall effort because it was not 
feasible to create a new agency and because 
NSF has a broad perspective. "But commit- 
tee members have a lot of reservations 
about whether NSF can fulfill this role," 
Kennedy admits. To succeed, the panel says, 
NSF must elevate the influence of IT re- 
searchers within its ranks and add more 
computer scientists to its policy-setting Na- 
tional Science Board. 

New NSF director Rita Colwell says the 
agency is ready and willing "to take up the 
challenge. We are used to looking at the big 
picture." Juris Hartmanis, who heads the 

itable technologies was conducted decades foundation's $295 million computer sci- 
1-1 ago. Reacting to concerns that govenunent ences directorate, agrees that "adjustments 

Report Urges U.S. to 
Take the Long View 
A White House advisory panel on informa- 
tion technology is urging President Clinton to 
turn back the clock and recreate the funding 
strategies that nurtured the Internet and other 
developments that now fuel the U.S. econo- 
my. The panel's overall message, that the 
United States needs to do more to retain its 
lead in the field, is expected to prompt top 
Administration officials to push for more 
funding in the upcoming 2000 budget re- 
quest. But its suggestion that the National 
Science Foundation (NSF) should play the 

isn't doing enough to keep the country on 
top, President Clinton last June asked his 
new science adviser, Neal Lane, to prepare 
an IT funding plan. The PITAC's recom- 
mendations, says panel member Larry 
Smarr, director of the National Center for 
Supercomputing Applications at the Univer- 
sity of Illinois, Urbana-Champaign, should 
allow Lane 'Yo hit the ground running" by 
providing a framework for Lane's report, ex- 
pected later this year. 

In its report, the PITAC warns against a 
dangerous trend among federal agencies: the 
funding of small, short-term projects, such 
as building deadlier missiles or writing bet- 
ter flood-forecasting software, to the detri- 

may have to be made, but NSF is already 
managing large projects." 

The next step for the committee is a se- 
ries of meetings with community and feder- 
al leaders to flesh out specific funding pro- 
posals for a final report to be delivered early 
next year. While those meetings will come 
late in the Administration's 2000 budget- 
making process, Smarr and others hope that 
they will still influence the president's bud- 
get request to Congress next February. "We 
burned some midnight oil to get [the re- 
port] out," he says. "We wanted the budget- 
makers to hear what the leaders in IT think 
needs to happen." 

-DAVID MALAKOFF 
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