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Cattell Relinquishes Psychology Award 

Psychologist Raymond B. Cat- 
tell last month asked that his 
name be withdrawn from consid- 
eration for a major award that 
was put on hold after after a his- 
torian alleged that Cattell's be- 
liefs about eugenics align him 
with racists and anti-Semites. 

Cattell, 92, is a towering fig- 
ure in 20th century psychology, 
having made important contri- 
butions to measurement of per- 
sonality and IQ. Last year, the 
American Psychological Asso- 
ciation (APA), in what many 
psychologists saw as a long- 
overdue gesture, decided to give 

him the 1997 Gold Medal Award 
for Life Achievement in Psy- 
chological Science at its annual 
meeting in August. 

But the award was shelved at 
the last minute in response to 
concerns raised publicly by histo- 
rian Barry Mehler, who runs the 
Institute for the Study of Aca- 
demic Racism at Ferris State Uni- 
versity in Big Rapids, Michigan. 
Mehler accused Cattell of being 
aligned with "fascist and eugenics 
causes," and cited writings es- 
pousing "Beyondism," a philoso- 
phy that calls on societies to use 
eugenic strategies to promote an 

evolutionary leap in human 
brainpower. Awards committee 
chair Joseph Matarazzo of the 
Oregon Health Sciences Uni- 
versity in Portland appointed a 
five-person panel to investigate 
Mehler's charges. 

Cattell's daughter, Heather, a 
psychologist in Walnut Creek, 
California, says her father "did 
write some pretty terrible stuff' 
before World War I1 but that his 
views have since been modified. 
Cattell himselfwrote APA that he 
"abhors" racism and wants only 
"voluntary eugenics." 

Heather Cattell says her fa- 
ther has long wanted to with- 
draw from the controversy and 

that his family finally went along 
with his wishes as he is ill and has 
little time to live. There will be 
no final report on the matter as 
the panel has been disbanded. 

Former APA President Charles 
Spielberger of the University of 
South Florida in Tampa defends 
the decision to appoint a panel, 
saying that because "this is a life- 
time award," Cattell's politics 
were relevant. But other psy- 
chologists are saddened by the 
affair. Asserts a former Cattell 
graduate student, psychologist Ri- 
chard Gorsuch of Fuller Theologi- 
cal Seminary in Pasadena, Califor- 
nia, "This is going to give an inter- 
national black eye to psychology." 
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