
Space Science in . , 
Political m*Rt 

Space science d get some , 
high-level attention next week, 
when two dopea eminent pe- 
searchers gather in WashingtE~ 
D.C., at the request of the White s h  Space Agency chief Yuri 
House to assess what new go& . . h t e v  has been hcqitalized, 
they should set for their field. says Joseph Belitdry, NASA's 
Presidential science adviser J"dCS. -?; chief veterinarian. The d c i a i  
Gibbons has called for the a- 

Academy of Sciences, to con- 
sider a r&amped direction in l&t 
of recent Hubble Space Tele- 
scope discoveries and possible 
evidence of ancient We on Mars. 

Gibbets told NASA Ahin- 
istrator Dan Goldin in a recent 
letter that he wants the ~FOUP to 
focus on four tapirs. large-scale 
structure and evolution of the 
universe,exploration ofthe solar 
system, the search for planets 
beyond this mlar system, and the 
possible e x i s t e a  of life else- 
where. Bur to the consternation 
of some, that charier leaves out 
life and micragcavity sciences 
and Earth observation. 

The panel's fmibgs will be 
used to set an aggnda for a White 
House symposium in d y  De- 
cember led by Vice President A1 
Gore on the future of space sci- 
ence. After that, + calf for 
President Clinton to host aspace 
summit later in the month at- 
tended by senior lawmakers. 

Launcher Shottalgs 
days Dim G'fojsd 

space biology pzoject known as 
Bion dodged heavy fire from 
U.S. animal-nghts activists and 
congress this year, but now faces 
a new question: Can it survive 
b i a n  budgetary trmbles? The 
mission was .shed ta send two 
monkeys into orbit for 
ments in September, k i t8  now 
on hold because of problems 
with booking a S o p  launchve- 
hide. "The fate 04 Bion is hang- 
ing in midair," says one Russian 
company official. 

Launchers are a precious 
commodity in this cash-strapped 
country that, because of its reli- 
ance on space-based telecom- 
munications, needs to keep 
placing satellites in orbit. It also 
needs rockets to keep the Mir 
space station supplied. But vari- 
ous agencies are competing for 

pose a launch after ~ e ~ t e m b k r  
because the cold weather on the 
Kazalthstan steppes-where the 
capsule with the monkeys is to 
land-could hurt the animals. 
But Bielitzky says the Russians 
have rrow convinced the United 
States that frozen g ~ w n d  might 
aid recovery ofthempsule, mini- 
mizing the riskto ks cargo. Crit- 
ics et p.oPk .fbr the Ethical 
T m m e n r  dA&bls, however, 
which calls the met cruel and 
utrnecessary (Sdenee, 12 July, p. 
1751, say NASA's acceptanoe of 
the schedule change shows con- 
tempt for the monkeys' \ ~ t e h  

Cold weather isn't the only 
problem. After December, the 
growing monkeys may become 
too heavy for the ~psule .  That 
would mean Bion's managers 
will have to train a new pair of 
animals and do required surgery 
before the fllght could be re- 
scheduled. 
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Max Planck to 
Shutter Institutes? 

The prestigious Max Planck So 
ciety may close four of its re 
search institutes in western Ger 
many uder  a cost-cutting p h  
announced ear& this week by 
the society's president, Hubert 
Markl. The closure plan, which 
must still be approved by Max 
Phck ' s  governing board, comes 
in response to the government's 
demand chat the society reduce 
its pasarmel. a t s  in western 
Germany by 1 1% over the next 4 
years. That woukI require elimi 
mating about 740 positions. 

Under Markl's proposal, Ma: 
F'lanck eventually would close a 
least four research centers: &I 

Institute for Biology in Tiibingen 
the Institute for Aeronomy ir 
Lindau; the Institute for Behav 
ioral Phpsiobgy in Seewiesen nea 
Munich; and the Institute fo 
History bGiirtingenMaxPlancl 
&ids said those institutes wen 
singled out because their direc 
tors were nearing retirement, no 
because of any pmMem with thei 
scientific performance. 

The society is trimming cost 
in the west so it can open mom 
research centers in eastern Ger 
many, now home to 15 of Me: 
Planck's 70 institutes. Even sc 
the proposal to close four insti 
tutes surprised some German sci 
entists who had expected across 
the-board persome1 cuts. Origi 
nallv. Max P h d c  had ~ h e d  

cuts required by the federal gov 
emment, which provides a h  
half of the society's budget, Bu 

, Max Planck was forced to con 
sider closing institutes after &I 
government decreed this mond 
that the society should shave a11 
additional 5% of its staff costs, or 
740 jobs instead of 420. Closing 
the four institutes would achievr 
half these cuts: 

The institutes will have : 
chance to present their cases to 
Max Planck officials before next 
month, when Markl will give hi 
budget plan to Max Pbnek's gov 
ern@ board. A Anal vote on thc 
ckr%ures is expected in the spring 




