
Vignettes: On Philosophy 

In the class of people who are interested in facts and ideas, we have, of course, 
most scientists, and also a good number of nonscientists who think along the same 
lines even though they don't have scientific training. In the other class-those 
interested in words-we have some scientists and some philosophers, and many 
nonscientists. I remember reading a book on philosophy in which the author went 
on, page after page, on the question: If there is a leaf on a tree and you see that 
it is green in the springtime and red in fall, is that the same leaf or is it a different 
leaf? Is the essence of leafness still in it? Words, words, words, but "chlorophyll" 
and "xanthophylln--which are sensible in this connection of what has happened to 
that leaf-just don't appear at all. 

-Linus Pauling, as quoted in Linus Pauling i n  His O w n  W o r d s :  Selections from His 
Writings, Speeches, and Interviews (Barbara Marinacci, Ed.; Sinlon and Schuster) 

Many scientists, especially physicists, do not have a high opinion of philosophy. To 
them the fantastic amount of highly non-trivial knowledge that scientists have 
acquired over the last few hundred years bears no comparison with the seemingly 
endless squabbles about ever more subtle points of no practical importance that 
philosophers have spent their time on. Of course, this is being unfair to philoso- 
phers. Philosophical questions cannot be answered by empirical inquiry and the 
pace of progress in philosophy, therefore, is much slower than in physics. But 
anyone interested in what physics tells us about the world can hardly avoid asking 
philosophical questions. . . . Einstein said that physics without philosophy was not 
interesting enough to spend a lifetime on. 

-Jan Hilgevoord, in Physics and O u r  V i e w  of the World 
(Jan Hilgevoord, Ed.; Cambridge University Press) 
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