
Monte Verde 

In his report "Skepticism fades over pre- 
Clovis man" (Research News, 9 June, p. 
1140), Roger Lewin remarks that I have not 
been enthusiastic about C. Vance Havnes' 
idea that a team of outside investigators 
should visit the Monte Verde archeological 
site to assess it. Neither Haynes nor anyone 
else has approached me about such a visit. I 
am very much in favor of obtaining outside 
opinions about our research at Monte 
~ e r d e .  In fact, I have always encouraged 
other scientists to visit both the site and my 
laboratory at the University of Kentucky 
where most of the artifacts and site docu- 
mentation on loan from the Chilean govern- 
ment are housed. So far, only two archeolo- 
gists have visited the site and none has come 
to the university. 

Lewin also mentions that I have traveled 
across the country since 1976 trying to 
convince archeologists that Monte Verde 
was a valid site. I gave the first public talk on 
the site in 1982 at Cornell University. 

TOM D. DILLEHAY 
Department of Anthropology, 

University of Kentucky, 
Lexington, KY 40506 

Preventing Fraud 

Growing concern about the integrity of 
biomedical research and the publication in 
peer-reviewed journals of a few articles sub- 
sequently found to be fraudulent has 
prompted critics to demand that editors and 
reviewers assume more responsibility for the 
detection of fraud. 

Fraudulent research is best discovered by 
the miscreant's co-workers and supervisors 
in the laboratory before it is submitted for 
publication. I t  may also be suspected after 
publication, if other workers in the field are 
unable to confirm the results. Of course, the 
optimal solution is prevention, and this is 
the primary responsibility of sponsoring in- 
stitutions, which should insist that senior 
scientists pay more attention to the educa- 
tion and supervision of their junior co- 
workers. 

We believe, however, that scientific jour- 
nals could make a useful contribution to- 
ward the elimination of fraudulent manu- 
scripts by instituting a relatively simple 
change in editorial policy. We suggest that 
editors require all coauthors of multiauth- 

ored papers-which nowadays means virtu- 
ally all papers-to sign a covering letter 
stating that each coauthor has not only read 
and approved the submitted manuscript but 
is prepared to take responsibility for it. The 
known cases of fraud in science have been 
the work of one individual. If each co- 
author were made accountable for the in- 
tegrity of the work being submitted for 
publication, research teams would pay closer 
attention to each member's work, and the 
likelihood of individual fraud would be re- 
duced. Coauthors who are not willing to 
accept such responsibility should perhaps 
reconsider the appropriateness of their co- 
authorship. Although coauthors may legiti- 
mately make their greatest contributions in 
only one or another aspect of a study, they 
should be sufficiently familiar with the entire 
work to share not only in the credit for the 
published work but also in the responsibility 
for its honesty. 

KONRAD BLOCH 
Department of Chemistry, 

Harvard University, 
Cambridge, M A  02138 
ARNOLD S. RELMAN 

Editor-in-Chid 
New England Journal of Medicine, 

Boston, M A  02115 

Response: We print this letter because the 
opinion of two highly responsible scientists 
with regard to such an important matter 
deserves serious consideration. Science's poli- 
cy and its "Information for Contributors" 
already state that all authors are responsible 
for a manuscript that they coauthor. This 
editor, therefore, believes that a second 
statement essentially saying, "We mean what 
we said," dilutes the force of our instruc- 
tions and is not likely to deter those intent 
on ignoring the rules. 

-DANIEL E. KOSHLAND, JR. 

MIT's Industrial Liaison Program 

Mark Crawford, in his article "MIT-in- 
dustrial links draw congressional attention" 
(News & Comment, 9 June, p. 1136) com- 
ments on the behavior of the faculty of 
Massachusetts Institute of Technology 
(MIT) who participate in the Industrial 
Liaison Program (ILP). As one of those 
participants, I offer the following comment. 

Crawford suggests that the ILP provides 
an "advance look at key technologies." 
However, in approximately 40 industrial 
interactions per year over the past dozen 
years initiated through the ILP, I cannot 
remember ever giving any company, foreign 
or domestic, any data or information from 

my research that was not either (i) already 
published in the open literature or (ii) so 
general as to be totally separate from my 
research. Visits by companies, both foreign 
and domestic, tend to fall into several cate- 
gories. The first type of visitor is the "friend- 
ly colleague" who requests a tour of the 
laboratory and a general discussion of my 
research. I host such visitors equally whether 
their visit is arranged through the ILP or 
whether they contact me directly. I t  is sim- 
ply a matter of scientific courtesy that any 
researcher provides to another. I receive the 
same treatment when I visit another univer- 
sity or an industrial company's research lab- 
oratories. No amount of government regu- 
lation could or should prevent me from 
meeting with my colleagues in this manner. 

Another type of visitor is the research 
manager on a "fishing expedition." H e  is 
usually too far removed from science or 
engineering to know or even care about the 
details of my research. He is looking for 
general areas of mutual interest that might 
lead him to fund a research project, hire a 
consultant, or place a visiting scientist or 
student in our laboratory. Occasionally one 
receives a visit from the "salesman." This is a 
person who has a new idea or a new product 
and has come to advertise his development. 
Sometimes they are merely seeking approval 
and are asking for a professorial "blessing." 
In other instances they are looking for appli- 
cations or markets. In these cases the tech- 
nology transfer is primarily from industry to 
the university. Personally, I learn a great 
deal about the technological sophistication 
of different industries in different countries 
from these visits. The vast majority of inter- 
national visits fall into these three categories. 

The final category consists of companies 
looking for advice. These are mainly domes- 
tic companies who use the faculty member 
as a consultant during a 1-hour visit. These " 
"consulting visits" contain the greatest level 
of technical discussion, although they rarely 
fall directlv into mv area of research. The 
interaction here is no different from that of 
any faculty member doing normal consult- 
ing, except that I am "paid" by MIT rather 
than the company directly. If the consulta- 
tion exceeds 1 hour in duration, the compa- 
ny is usually asked to arrange a formal 
cbnsulting agreement directly with the pro- 
fessor. 

As can be seen. most of the ILP industw- 
faculty contacts of which I have knowledge 
have been identical to those that would be 
provided to any person who knows who to 
contact at MIT. In my experience, the ILP 
has not provided any privileged access to 
information, but has merely facilitated the 
flow in information already available. 

The scientific interactions that I have had 




