
Agassiz. The proceedings of a 1966 con- 
ference on environmental studies of the 
glacial Lake Agassiz region tied the bio- 
logical story of lake basin history to the 
geological story. This new volume pro- 
vides the Quaternary story as it was 
known in 1982. It is an excellent book 
that will stand as the definitive reference 
for the Quaternary of the heart of North 
America for many years. 

R. J. FULTON 
Geological Survey of Canada, 
Ottawa, Ontario K I A  OE8, Canada 
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This book is a collection of papers 
presented at a meeting of geologists 
many of whom have worked together on 
the International Geological Correlation 
Programme Project 27 to compile geolog- 
ic data from the Appalachian (eastern 
North America), Caledonian (British 
Isles and Scandinavia), Hercynian 
(France, Spain, and Portugal), and 
Mauritanide (West Africa) orogens and 
to combine these data to obtain a better 
understanding of the orogen as a whole. 
The book is divided into six sections. 
The first five are summaries concern- 
ing geophysics, stratigraphy and sed- 
imentology, volcanism and plutonism, 
metamorphism, and deformation. In- 
cluded in the sixth are studies of mineral- 
ization and tectonics in the Canadian 
Appalachians. 

Several thought-provoking interpreta- 
tions are made from maps of geophysical 
data (section I ) .  For example, in the 
U.S. Appalachians two bands of gravity 
highs apparent on residual Bouguer 
maps for wavelengths shorter than 250 
kilometers are interpreted by Kane to 
represent rifting environments, which is 
consistent with the presence of bimodal 
volcanic rocks reported by Fyffe et al. 
along the Blue Ridge and Green Moun- 
tains (section 3). In contrast to several 
papers published previously, both Roy et 
al. and Seguin and Fyffe conclude that 
paleomagnetic data do not support ex- 
tensive left-lateral faulting within the 
northern Appalachians during Carbonif- 
erous time. From gravity and magnetic 
data Lefort et al. identify structures be- 

neath the U.S. Atlantic Coastal Plain 
that they interpret to be the same as 
those in the Mauritanide orogen and pro- 
pose that a prong of the African plate has 
been left behind. Schenk (section 2) in- 
terprets the Meguma terrane in Canada 
as part of that plate. 

Poole et al. (section 2) give an ex- 
cellent overview of the stratigraphy of 
the orogen. Tables, schematic maps, 
and text speak to the distribution of 
rock type in the geologic record. Other 
papers in section 2 provide more details 
of the stratigraphy of Scandinavia, Mo- 
rocco, Nova Scotia, and Avalonian ter- 
ranes. An interesting suggestion made 
by Kennan and Kennedy (section 6) is 
that coticules (manganese garnet quartz- 
ites) may be used for long-range correla- 
tion. 

Succinct summaries of igneous rock 
type, age, intrusive morphology, distri- 
bution, and inferred tectonic setting are 
presented for the Appalachians, the Ca- 
ledonides, and France (section 3). How- 
ever, the lack of maps and, in several 
papers, references is frustrating. Meta- 
morphic rocks from these areas are dis- 
cussed in terms of metamorphic facies, 
grade, facies series, and age (section 4). 
Small-scale maps are extremely informa- 
tive; Robinson nicely distinguishes each 
metamorphic event in southern New En- 
gland on separate maps. Fisher suggests 
that a metamorphic facies series is corre- 
lated with the composition of magma 
formed during the same "event" and 
supports this hypothesis with data from 
New England. Tables and maps are used 
effectively in section 5 to summarize 
deformation type, plutonism, metamor- 
phism, isotopic data, and fossil occur- 
rences in time and space. Osberg sug- 
gests that plutonism continued beyond 
deformation in the Appalachians. 

The book is an important reference for 
anyone interested in the bedrock geology 
along the margin of the North Atlantic 
Ocean. Though it lacks an integrated 
overview of the orogen as a whole, it 
does, as is stated by Schenk, emphasize 
the importance of a multidisciplinary 
study. It is the only reference I know of 
that brings together summaries of so 
many aspects of the geology of the oro- 
gen. Most of the papers are well refer- 
enced for those wishing to delve into 
further details. The authors are well 
versed in the subjects they address, and 
the data compilations they present will 
save the reader countless time wading 
through the literature. 

Jo LAIRD 
Department of Earth Sciences, 
University of New Hampshire, 
Durham 03824 
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