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tion. It cited inaccurate detail in the 
instruct~ons that should enable others 
to duplicate the genetic product devel- 
oped by Stanley Cohen of Stanford 
and Herbert Boyer of the University of 
California. It notes that after the scien- 
tists filed the application, they revised 
their description of the technique. 

The patent office also asked wheth- 
er Robert Helling should be consid- 
ered a co-inventor with Cohen and 
Boyer. The three scientists were au- 
thors of a seminal paper on genetic 
engineermg which appeared in the 
Proceedings of the National Academy 
of Sciences. Subsequently, an article 
appeared in Nature in which Helling 
"is indicated as refusing to sign a 
disclaimer that he was not an inventor 
of the processes . . . ," according to 
the patent office. The office wants this 
"apparent dispute" resolved. 

On a separate point, the document 
dispels rumors that a 1973 article in 
the New Scientist, which roughly de- 
scribed Cohen's and Boyer's genetic 
engineering methods, constituted pri- 
or disclosure that would invalidate the 
Stanford application. 

The university, which has 3 months 
to respond to the patent office, sought 
to downplay predictions that approval 
of its application was in serious jeop- 
ardy. "None of the problems are insur- 
mountable," said Niels Reimers, 
Stanford's director of technology li- 
censing. "This is part of the routine 
back and forth. Our patent position will 
be strengthened because these is- 
sues will be aired." 

There are indications, however, that 
some of the 73 companies which have 
purchased a license to the original 
patent may later dispute its validity 
because questions have arisen about 
its counterpart.-Marjorie Sun 

Mathematical Magic 

The Reagan Administration has ap- 
parently engaged in mathematical 
magic to calculate the enormous sav- 
ings it expects to incur by dismantling 
the Department of Energy (DOE). The 
General Accounting Office (GAO) said 
in a report this month that it was 
unable to f~gure out how the Adminis- 
tration came up with its projected sav- 
ings of millions of dollars. 

The report was immediately seized 
upon by Representative Richard Ot- 
tinger (D-N.Y.) and others as confir- 

mation that the Administration does 
not know what it is domg in energy 
policy. Ottmger, chairman of the 
House subcomm~ttee on energy con- 
servation and power, said, "The Pres- 
ident's plan to dismantle the Depart- 
ment. . . ignores evidence of the na- 
tion's real energy needs." 

The Admmistrat~on has come up 
with three different estimates of reor- 
ganization savmgs but, the GAO was 
unconvinced about the validity of any 
of them. At first the Administration 
predicted that it could save $1.3 bdlion 
in 1 year by eliminating DOE and 
transferring some of its functions pri- 
marily to the Commerce Department. 
Then it est~mated $1 billion could be 
saved over a 3-year period. In its 
latest projection, it ventured that per- 
haps a more modest $250 million 
could be salvaged. The GAO could 
not even substantlate the last figure. 
". . . [Tlhe estimate is not adequately 
documented and does not reflect a full 
assessment of potential reorganiza- 
tion expenses," the report said. 

The agency found that the Adminis- 
tration would achieve most of the esti- 
mated savlngs by the eliminat~on of 
major programs (such as the synthetic 
fuels program) and the concom~tant 
cutbacks In personnel. These sav- 
ings, however, could be accrued with- 
out reorganization. "Consequently, 
we were unable to link the budget 
proposal d~rectly w~th the reorganiza- 
tion plan," the report sa~d. 

When the Admmistration did ven- 
ture an estimate based solely on reor- 
ganization, GAO still was critical. For 
example, the Commerce Department 
said it could ach~eve the biggest sav- 
ings-$200 million-by the integration 
of computer systems with DOE. The 
GAO said, "Commerce officials had 
no specific explanat~on in support of 
the estimate." 

Commerce authorities also said 
they could save $50 million by ~ntensi- 
fying the auditing of DOE contractors. 
But, the report said, "Commerce offi- 
cials agreed th~s estimate is specula- 
tive." The Commerce Department's 
suggestion seemed to ruffle energy 
officials who told GAO that their con- 
tractors were adequately momtored. 
They said they were concerned that 
"such a highly speculative estimate 
. . . could give the incorrect impres- 
sion that there IS a significant amount 
of serious fraud, waste and abuse" in 
the department-Marjorie Sun 

Genex to Go Public 

Genex Corporation, one of the larg- 
est biotechnology companies in the 
United States, is about to go public at 
a time when biotechnology stocks are 
out of favor on Wall Street. The com- 
pany, based in Rockville, Maryland, 
apparently needs an injection of capi- 
tal to finance a major expansion of its 
manufacturing capacity. 

According to a reg~stration state- 
ment filed with the Securities and Ex- 
change Commission on 28 July, the 
company is considering the sale of 
2.75 million shares at $12 apiece, an 
offering that would bring in $33 million. 
A company spokesperson said that 
the offering would be made "after La- 
bor Day," but declined further com- 
ment. 

Genex was launched in 1977 and 
has received about $15.5 million in 
capital contributions from Koppers 
Company and subsidiaries of Mon- 
santo and Emerson Electric. It cur- 
rently employs about 200 people and 
is engaged in a variety of research 
projects under contract from pharma- 
ceutical and manufacturmg compa- 
nies. Last year it reported an income 
of $5.6 million, mostly from research 
contracts, but st111 ended up w~th a 
small loss. Durmg the first 5 months of 
1982, the company reported a loss of 
about $2 million, largely as a result of 
an expansion of its research and de- 
velopment facil~ties; hence the need 
for capital. 

This IS, however, not a good time 
for biotechnology companies to go 
public. Ever since Genentech of 
South San Francisco tested the stock 
market in October 1979 and saw the 
price of its shares soar to $89 within a 
few minutes of opening, several other 
companies have tried to cash in on 
the boom but with less success. Wall 
Street has been taking an mcreasingly 
skeptical interest in biotechnology 
stocks lately and several companies 
have raised much less money from 
stock offerings than they originally an- 
ticipated. 

Genex at least has the advantage 
of having several products in develop- 
ment, connections with major corpo- 
rations, and a clutch of lucrative re- 
search contracts. Its stock offering will 
provide a clear indication of how far 
the biotechnology hoopla has subsid- 
ed .-Colin Norman 
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