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In these days of host-vector systems, 
expression vectors, and cutting and 
splicing, it is easy to forget that current 
advances in studies of microorganisms, 
in spite of recombinant DNA, rely on a 
verv substantial background of classical - 
genetics. As is pointed out in the preface 
to this book, it is 21 years since the 
Society for General Microbiology last 
held and published the proceedings of a 
symposium on the genetics of microorga- 
nisms; it is highly appropriate that a 
sequel should appear now, both as a 
reminder of the importance of studies in 
this field and as a summary of how the 
field has advanced. There is no question 
but that genetics is an indispensable tool 
in the analysis of microbes, as it is in 
studies of higher organisms. The old 
saying (attributed to  Luria) that "one 
mutant is better than no mutant" still has 
validity. 

This collection of vaDers is an ex- 

na. The review also emphasizes our fail- 
ure to  explain many of these effects in 
biochemical terms. In a similar vein, 
Shapiro, Nisen, and Ely summarize the 
state of affairs of genetic studies of Cau- 
lobacter crescentus. 

Most of the papers concentrate on 
specific aspects of the genetic analysis of 
interesting microorganisms, such as anti- 
biotics and secondary metabolites in Ac- 
tinomycetes (Hopwood), bacterial che- 
motaxis (Parkinson), bacterial virulence 
(Maas), nitrogen fixation (Dixon, Kenne- 
dy, and Merrick), photosynthesis (Barl- 
lett, Boynton, and Gillham), the cell cy- 
cle (Nurse), and the bacterial cell surface 
(Makela and Stocker). These papers 
vary in quality, but all provide valuable 
background information in their fields. 
Two subjects of interest in microbial 
biochemistry, translation and transcrip- 
tion. have been ignored. which is - 
strange, for there has been so much 
excellent genetic analysis of the ribo- 
some and RNA polymerase. A review of 
transcrtptional regulation (Travers, Kari, 
and Mace) is out of place, since it con- 
tains very little discussion of genetic 
analysis and pays only lip service to  
studies of nucleotide sequences involved 
in transcriptional control. 

Finally, the book contains two reviews 
of methodology, one on gene manipula- 
tion in vitro (Tinirnis), which gives as 
excellent an appraisal of recombinant 
DNA technology as one would want to  
find in 60 pages. This contrasts with the 
rather terse description of gcnetic ma- 
nivulation in vivo (Sherratt), in which, 
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