
The introductory chapters of this book 
present a valuable picture of Griffin the 
man and the archeologist and are signifi- 
cant contributions to our understanding 
of the development of archeology as a 
discipline. The first chapter, "James 
Bennett Griffin: Appreciation and remi- 
niscences," is written by George 
Quimby, who was a student of Griffin's 
at Michigan in the '30's, and Charles Cle- 
land, a student there in the early '60's. 
The second chapter, "James Bennett 
Griffin, archaeologist," is written by Vol- 
ney Jones, who was Griffin's colleague at 
the Museum of Anthropology for most of 
his tenure. In these chapters are signifi- 
cant discussions of Griffin's graduate 
school days at the University of Chicago 
and his transfer to the University of 
Michigan. From them one gains an in- 
sight into the ways in which archeology 
was developing in the 1930's. Quimby 
utilizes excerpts of correspondence to il- 
lustrate the kinds of research problems 
that were of concern as well as the sort 
of joking relationship that existed be- 
tween Griffin and his colleagues. 

The postwar era is discussed by Cle- 
land. Of particular significance is his in- 
sight into Griffin's sponsorship of field re- 
search in Michigan under the auspices of 
the National Science Foundation. Many 
archeologists were trained in these proj- 
ects. Among them was Lewis Binford, 
who has presented a controversial com- 
mentary on this period in his book An 
Archaeological Perspective (Seminar 
Press, 1972). Cleland's comments place 
the perspective in perspective. 

The remainder of the book is divided 
into five sections: Considerations of Vari- 
ability in the Archaeological Record; Pat- 
terns of Culture History; Patterns of 
Mesoamerican Urbanism; Biotic Consid- 
erations in Prehistoric Adaptation; and 
Ethnohistory, Historic Archaeology, 
and Ethnicity. The papers in these sec- 
tions are written by former students and 
former and present colleagues of Grif- 
fin's. 

The papers vary in content and quali- 
ty. The variation in content is character- 
istic of Griffin. Many persons have 
thought of Griffin as a pottery expert 
with a fine mind for ceramic detail. His 
interests have been broader than that, 
however, and, although he perhaps did 
not get directly involved in the research, 
he stimulated, encouraged, and got mon- 
ey for others to pursue avenues of signifi- 
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cant investigation. Examples of the re- 
sults are Albert Spaulding's "Multifactor 
analysis of association: An application to 
Owasco ceramics," Jeffrey Parsons's 
"The role of Chinampa agriculture in 
the food supply of Aztec Tenochtitlan," 
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and Carol Mason's "Historic identifica- 
tion and Lake Winnebago focus One- 
ota." 

One thing is lacking in most of the pa- 
pers, except for the introductory ones, 
and that is a clear depiction of the rela- 
tionship and contribution of Griffin to the 
writer and to the subject being dis- 
cussed. A notable exception is Richard 
MacNeish's contribution, "The in situ 
Iroquois revisited and rethought." This 
chapter outlines very clearly the relation- 
ship of Griffin and MacNeish and how 
the Iroquois project originated and was 
carried out. MacNeish goes on to update 
his research on the development of the 
Iroquois, outlining the influence the re- 
search, stimulated by Griffin and carried 
out by MacNeish, has had on more re- 
cent studies of the Iroquois. 

Most of the papers in this volume can 
best be evaluated by experts in the var- 
ied specialties they represent. They will 
be read and reread as contributions to 
their fields. The papers by Quimby and 
Cleland, Jones, and MacNeish will be 
read and reread for the insights they of- 
fer into the history and evolution of ar- 
cheology and particularly the nature of 
James B. Griffin's contribution to that 
discipline. 

MELVIN L. FOWLER 

Department of Anthropology, 
University of Wisconsin, Milwaukee 
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The spermatozoon is a cell highly spe- 
cialized for the transmission of paternal 
genes to the next generation, and all 
spermatozoa have species-specific struc- 
tural and biochemical properties. During 
the past three decades countless review 
articles and books dealing with sper- 
matozoa have been published, but from 
them readers could obtain only fragmen- 
tary information. The authors of this 
book have made an extensive survey of 
the literature and summarize current 
knowledge concerning the structure of 
the spermatozoon in relation to its func- 
tion and its phylogeny, the fine structure 
of the spermatozoon and its com- 
ponents, their biochemical composition 
and behavior, and the changes sper- 
matozoa undergo in the fertilization pro- 
cess. To make such a survey throughout 
the animal kingdom is a formidable task, 
and the authors have accomplished it 

The spermatozoon is a cell highly spe- 
cialized for the transmission of paternal 
genes to the next generation, and all 
spermatozoa have species-specific struc- 
tural and biochemical properties. During 
the past three decades countless review 
articles and books dealing with sper- 
matozoa have been published, but from 
them readers could obtain only fragmen- 
tary information. The authors of this 
book have made an extensive survey of 
the literature and summarize current 
knowledge concerning the structure of 
the spermatozoon in relation to its func- 
tion and its phylogeny, the fine structure 
of the spermatozoon and its com- 
ponents, their biochemical composition 
and behavior, and the changes sper- 
matozoa undergo in the fertilization pro- 
cess. To make such a survey throughout 
the animal kingdom is a formidable task, 
and the authors have accomplished it 

The spermatozoon is a cell highly spe- 
cialized for the transmission of paternal 
genes to the next generation, and all 
spermatozoa have species-specific struc- 
tural and biochemical properties. During 
the past three decades countless review 
articles and books dealing with sper- 
matozoa have been published, but from 
them readers could obtain only fragmen- 
tary information. The authors of this 
book have made an extensive survey of 
the literature and summarize current 
knowledge concerning the structure of 
the spermatozoon in relation to its func- 
tion and its phylogeny, the fine structure 
of the spermatozoon and its com- 
ponents, their biochemical composition 
and behavior, and the changes sper- 
matozoa undergo in the fertilization pro- 
cess. To make such a survey throughout 
the animal kingdom is a formidable task, 
and the authors have accomplished it 

successfully. Furthermore, they have 
unified the information in terms of basic 
principles as no collection of papers by 
many authors could have done. 

The book provides many interesting 
facts about spermatozoa. The reader will 
learn what a beautiful and astonishing 
cell the spermatozoon is. Among the 
many questions raised by the authors 
are: Why are so many spermatozoa nec- 
essary to fertilize one egg? How did inter- 
nal fertilization evolve? Does chemotax- 
is of spermatozoa play an important role 
in animal fertilization? Why are mouse 
spermatozoa far bigger than whale 
spermatozoa? What determines the size 
and shape of spermatozoa? What is the 
fate of sperm mitochondrial DNA incor- 
porated into the egg and what is its func- 
tion? Can X- and Y-bearing spermatozoa 
be separated in order to control the sex 
of offspring? It is interesting and informa- 
tive to read the authors' views regarding 
such questions and their discussion of 
the problems. 

The list of animal species (from Pro- 
tozoa to man) in which the fine structure 
of spermatozoa has been examined by 
electron microscopy and the list of more 
than 1500 references will be useful to 
those searching for details this book 
could not cover. The book will be of in- 
terest to students of human and veteri- 
nary reproductive biology, embryology, 
zoology, biochemistry, and cell biology 
in general. Its only weak point is its high 
price. 
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This book is an eclectic assortment of 
papers covering many fields in addition 
to ecology and identifying and address- 
ing a wide array of questions. That on 
every hand the reader runs into unan- 
swered ones is a reflection of the un- 
settled state of the field, beginning with 
its boundaries. J. J. Kohlmeyer, an im- 
portant contributor to the field, has 
stated that an organism, to be considered 
marine, must be proven to develop and 
reproduce in a marine habitat. S. Y. 
Newell, who writes here on the fungi on 
mangrove seedlings, rejects this view. Is 
the definition of aquatic fungus given by 
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