
Calvin, who says he practiced medita- 
tion long before he heard of TM, as- 
serts, "Maharishi's principal business 
is collecting money from new acolytes. 
He doesn't know anything about sci- 
ence," but does know that cloaking his 
dogma in scientific jargon is the only 
way to gain legitimacy. In the 1960's, 
says Calvin, Maharishi helped hun- 
dreds of students kick drugs-"if it 
weren't for the rescue job he did 
around here he'd have absolutely no 
sympathy from me at all." Mael 
Melvin, who teaches quantum mechan- 
ics at Temple University, used to give 
lectures at one of the IMS New York 
centers, but has since disassociated 
himself from the movement, saying, 
"Maharishi is flexible in what he con- 
siders truth." Harvey Brooks, dean of 
engineering at Harvard, also partici- 
pated in an SCI symposium. He thinks 
TM is fine but that it is being sur- 
rounded by a lot of mystical nonsense, 
and "all the scientists I know who have 
had some contact with SCI hold about 
the same view. Like virtually every 
scientist who has attended or spoken at 
SCI conferences, I was 'roped into it' 
by my children," Brooks wrote in a 
letter. Buckminster Fuller, whose name 
is also thrown around by the MIU 

people, related through his secretary 
that he had little knowledge and no 
opinions about the organization. 

None of those who question Maha- 
rishi deride TM. In fact, many of them 
do it. In the early days of scientific re- 
search on TM, Wallace worked for a 
while with Herbert Benson, a cardiol- 

ogist at Harvard who is perhaps the 
foremost TM researcher in the country. 
But Benson and Wallace haven't seen 
each other for a while. Benson will not 

speak for attribution but one of his 
professional acquaintances says he and 
his colleagues are disturbed at the 

mystical aura with which Maharishi 
and his followers have shrouded the 

practice. Anyone wanting to learn TM 
from IMS pays $130 for a series of 
three lectures, and several hours of 

personal instruction in meditation. 
There he is assigned his own mantra, 
custom fit to his personal nervous sys- 
tem. The mantra is very powerful, and 
therefore must be kept secret. 

It has been said this is just a cute 
way to elicit $130 from someone. 
Benson says TM is only one of many 
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he calls the "relaxation response." He 
has written papers in which he says he 
has found that silent repetition of the 
word "one" while a person is exhaling 
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achieves the same result. Maharishi's 
followers disagree. They say nothing 
achieves the same results as TM. As 
for the complaint that the religious 
overtones of TM impart an undesirable 
ideological tang to it, Lewis argues 
that Maharishi has taken meditation- 
practiced in many forms by many re- 
ligious-out of any particular philo- 
sophical or religious construct and has 
liberated it as a truly nonideological 
practice. Many would argue with that 
point, but certainly it is true that most 
people who learn TM don't give a hoot 
about the Rig-Veda or Oriental mysti- 
cism. 

The prospect of MIU, rising Phoe- 
nix-like from the ruins of old "flunk-out 
U" is certainly a sign of the times, and 
an indication of the scope of the relent- 
less pursuit of inner peace going on 
these days. 

But if MIU can become self-support- 
ing (it is starting up with income de- 
rived from TM learners) then, assum- 
ing it gains accreditation, it will have 
something on many institutions of 
higher learning in America today. 

-CONSTANCE HOLDEN 
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Harrison Brown, professor of geo- 
chemistry and science and government, 
California Institute of Technology, also 
to president, International Council of 
Scientific Unions. .. . Richard Trum- 

bull, deputy executive director, AAAS, 
to executive director, American Insti- 
tute of Biological Sciences. ... Robert 
E. Leestamper, president, Worcester 
State College, to president, Southeast 
Missouri State University. . . . Howard 
E. Petch, academic vice president, Uni- 

versity of Waterloo, to president, Uni- 
versity of Victoria, Canada ... Frederick 
S. Humphries, vice president, Institute 
for Services to Education, to president, 
Tennessee State University . . . War- 
ren W. Brandt, former president, Vir- 
ginia Commonwealth University, to 
president, Southern Illinois Univer- 
sity. . . . James A. Robinson, presi- 
dent, Macalester College, to presi- 
dent, University of West Florida. ... 
Douglas T. Kenny, dean of arts and sci- 
ences, University of British Columbia, 
to president of the university. ... Ron- 
ald G. Petrie, chairman, elementary 
education department, Utah State Uni- 
versity, to dean, School of Education, 
California State College, San Bernar- 
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sity. .... Edward C. Melby, director of 
laboratory animal medicine, Johns Hop- 
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State Veterinary College, Cornell Uni- 
versity.... Gordon A. Haaland, chair- 
man, psychology department, University 
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Medicine at the university .... Marshall 
Falk, medical director, George J. Lon- 
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A 120-meter gas cell is available for Affinity Chromatography-Principles Michigan State University, to dean, 
adaptation to many popular spectro- and Methods is a 72-page book that Graduate School, University of Wis- 
photometers. The three-mirror, multiple, also discusses some applications. Phar- consin-Oshkosh. ... Thomas E. Jordan, 
reflection, long path cell features a macia Fine Chemicals Incorporated. professor of behavioral studies and 
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fairs, University of Illinois College of 
Medicine, to dean, Mercer University 
School of Medicine.... C. Mel Adams, 
professor of materials engineering, Uni- 
versity of Wisconsin, Milwaukee, to 
dean, College of Engineering, Univer- 
sity of Cincinnati. . . . Donald F. Tap- 
ley, professor of medicine, Columbia 
University, to dean, Columbia Univer- 
sity Faculty of Medicine. ... Hia Shwe, 
chairman, physics department, East 
Stroudsburg State College, to dean of 
science at the college. . . . Roy B. Le- 
vow, assistant professor of mathematics, 
Florida Atlantic University, to chair- 
man, mathematics department at the 
university. . . . Robert N. Berk, asso- 
ciate professor of radiology, University 
of California, San Diego, to chairman, 
radiology department, University of 
Texas Health Science Center .... Louis 
Kriesberg, professor of sociology, Syra- 
cuse University, to chairman, sociology 
department at the university. ... Doug- 
las E. Kelly, chairman, biological struc- 
ture department, University of Miami 
School of Medicine, to chairman, anat- 
omy department, University of South- 
ern California School of Medicine. 
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dean, College of Engineering, Univer- 
sity of Cincinnati. . . . Donald F. Tap- 
ley, professor of medicine, Columbia 
University, to dean, Columbia Univer- 
sity Faculty of Medicine. ... Hia Shwe, 
chairman, physics department, East 
Stroudsburg State College, to dean of 
science at the college. . . . Roy B. Le- 
vow, assistant professor of mathematics, 
Florida Atlantic University, to chair- 
man, mathematics department at the 
university. . . . Robert N. Berk, asso- 
ciate professor of radiology, University 
of California, San Diego, to chairman, 
radiology department, University of 
Texas Health Science Center .... Louis 
Kriesberg, professor of sociology, Syra- 
cuse University, to chairman, sociology 
department at the university. ... Doug- 
las E. Kelly, chairman, biological struc- 
ture department, University of Miami 
School of Medicine, to chairman, anat- 
omy department, University of South- 
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Norma J. Adamo, 47; associate pro- 
fessor of anatomy, Louisiana State 
University; 25 October. 

Charles Aikin, 73; former chairman, 
political science department, University 
of California, Berkeley; 24 November. 

Carl B. Allendorfer, 63; professor of 
mathematics, University of Washington; 
29 September. 

Rupert S. Anderson, 76; former re- 
search physiologist, U.S. Army Biomed- 
ical Latboratory, Edgewood Arsenal; 16 
October. 

Wilfred H. Baker, 62; former pro- 
fessor of civil engineering, West Vir- 
ginia University; 5 November. 

Ralph Colp, 81; former clinical pro- 
fessor of surgery, College of Physicians 
and Surgeons, Columbia University; 
11 November. 

LeRoy L. Constantin, 39; professor 
of physiology and biophysics, Wash- 
ington University School of Medicine; 
7 November. 

George S. Counts, 84; professor 
emeritus of education, Columbia Uni- 
versity; 10 November. 

Rex Cox, 86; former professor of 
agricultural economics, University of 
Minnesota; 29 October. 
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Hunter Guthrie, 73; former presi- 
dent, Georgetown University; 11 No- 
vember. 

Jarvis B. Hadley, 65; research geolo- 
gist, U.S. Geological Survey; 14 
November. 

Conrad Hammar, 79; former pro- 
fessor of agricultural economics, Uni- 
versity of Minnesota; 5 November. 

Roger G. Hart, 46; biophysicist, 
bio-medical division, Lawrence Liver- 
more Laboratory; 10 November. 

L. Emmett Holt, Jr., 79; former 
chairman, pediatrics department, New 
York University School of Medicine; 
30 November. 

Myron R. Karon, 42; professor of 

pediatrics, University of Southern Cali- 
fornia School of Medicine; 16 Novem- 
ber. 

M. Gertrude Keckeissen, 65; profes- 
sor of psychology, College of Mount 
St. Vincent; 17 November. 

Robert C. Kinter, 74; professor 
emeritus of chemical engineering, 
Illinois Institute of Technology; 15 
October. 

Erich Lindemann, 74; visiting pro- 
fessor of psychiatry, Stanford Univer- 
sity School of Medicine; 16 November. 

Gerald MacCarthy, 77; former pro- 
fessor of geology, University of North 
Carolina, Chapel Hill; 31 October. 

Ray S. Marsh, 79; professor emeritus 
of horticulture, West Virginia Univer- 
sity; 2 November. 

Robert E. McKechnie, 68; former 
chancellor, University of British Co- 
lumbia; 17 October. 

Imogene E. Okes, 52; education spe- 
cialist, U.S. Office of Education; 22 
October. 

James R. Patrick, 81; professor 
emeritus of psychology, Ohio Univer- 
sity; 3 August. 

William B. Snow, 79; retired pro- 
fessor of physical medicine, Columbia 
University; 16 November. 

Charles K. Trueblood, 81; former 
chairman, psychology department, 
American University; 1 November. 

Jerome P. Webster, 86; professor 
emeritus of clinical surgery, College 
of Physicians and Surgeons, Columbia 
University; 14 November. 

Howard B. White, 62; former dean, 
graduate faculty of political and social 
sciences, New School for Social Re- 
search; 4 November. 

Irvin G. Wyllie, 54; chancellor, Uni- 
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versity of Wisconsin-Parkside; 25 
October. 

Frederick F. Yonkman, 72; former 
chairman, pharmacology department, 
Wayne State University; 16 September. 
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RESEARCH NEWS 

(Continued from page 1185) 

now at Sloan-Kettering Memorial In- 
stitute, has purified two polypeptides, 
thymopoietin I and II (formerly called 
thymin I and II) from bovine thymus 
gland. The two polypeptides have very 
similar chemical and biological prop- 
erties. 

The precursors of T cells are formed 
in bone marrow. Gideon Goldstein and 
Ross Basch of New York University 
School of Medicine found that bone 
marrow cells rapidly acquire surface 
antigens characteristic of mature T 
cells when they are incubated with very 
low concentrations of thymopoietin I 
or II. As little as 2 nanograms of poly- 
peptide per milliliter of culture me- 
dium produces a maximal response. 
With David Schlesinger of Massachu- 
setts General Hospital, Gideon Gold- 
stein has now determined the amino acid 
sequence of thymopoietin II, which 
weighs 5550 daltons, and has syn- 
thesized a biologically active molecule. 

Nonspecific Thymic Polypeptide 

Gideon Goldstein, Edward Boyse, 
and their colleagues at Sloan-Kettering 
have isolated yet another thymic poly- 
peptide that induces T cell differentia- 
tion. This one, however, also induces 
B cell maturation and is found in every 
cell type, including plant cells and 
bacteria, that they have examined. The 
investigators have named the material 
ubiquitous immunopoietic polypeptide 
(UBIP). Because of its lack of speci- 
ficity and its presence in organisms that 
have no immune systems, they do not 
think that UBIP functions physiolog- 
ically in the differentiation of T cells. 
The capacity of this substance to stim- 
ulate T cell differentiation points up 
the caution that must be exercised in 

identifying physiological inducers of 
differentiation. 

Nevertheless, there is strong evidence 
that an endocrine deficiency-a lack 
of thymosin or other thymic hormones 
-contributes at least partially to the 
etiologies of immunodeficiency and 
autoimmune diseases, cancer, and even 
the degenerative changes of old age. 
All this raises the as yet unproven but 
still exciting possibility that hormonal 
replacement therapy can help control 
these diseases just as insulin controls 
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diabetes. It also means that the thymus 
gland, once thought to be about as use- 
ful as the human appendix, may well 
be the master gland of the immune sys- 
tem.-JEAN L. MARX 
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