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Laetrile and Schistosomiasis Laetrile and Schistosomiasis 

Perhaps one of the reasons for the 
impression that "Laetrile 'scientists' 
frequently do poor science" (1) is 
that the workers who failed to demon- 
strate therapeutic efficacy have tended 
to keep their findings to themselves- 
thereby greatly limiting the sample 
size on which the impression is based. 

It was predicted (2), on theoretical 
grounds, that Laetrile would be effec- 
tive in the treatment of schistosomiasis 
(one of the most important parasitic 
diseases of man), and some prelimi- 
nary claims were made for the efficacy 
of long-term Laetrile treatment in the 
clinic (3). I know of no published 
contrary evidence, and in view of the 
current resurgence of interest in 
Laetrile, perhaps I should here record 
an unpublished attempt in 1966 to 
demonstrate efficacy in schistosomiasis 
in mice (4). 

Albino mice infected with Schis- 
tosoma mansoni were treated with 
Laetrile at a time (day 28 of infec- 
tion) just prior to the expected onset 
of schistosome egg deposition. Groups 
of ten mice were subjected to one of 
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the following regimens: 100 mg/kg 
per day intravenously, 100 mg/kg per 
day intraperitoneally, 500 mg/kg per 
day intraperitoneally, 500 mg/kg 
per day subcutaneously, or 1000 
mg/kg per day intraperitoneally. In 
each instance the drug was given to 
the mice for 10 days, the days being 
consecutive except for the group 
treated intravenously, in which the 10 
injections were administered over a 
14-day period. A group of five mice 
was given potassium antimony tar- 
trate in the diet at a concentration of 
0.2 percent. Because the experiment was 
adjunctive to a larger trial, more than 
100 additional infected mice, from the 
same infection batch and similarly 
housed in groups of five to ten animals 
each, received either no treatment or 
treatment with drugs that had no anti- 
schistosomal action. At necropsy, 28 
days after the beginning of treatment, 
the status of infection was assessed 
with respect to the intensity of egg- 
induced granuloma formation in the 
liver and the presence of live schisto- 
somes in the mesenteric veins (5). 

the following regimens: 100 mg/kg 
per day intravenously, 100 mg/kg per 
day intraperitoneally, 500 mg/kg per 
day intraperitoneally, 500 mg/kg 
per day subcutaneously, or 1000 
mg/kg per day intraperitoneally. In 
each instance the drug was given to 
the mice for 10 days, the days being 
consecutive except for the group 
treated intravenously, in which the 10 
injections were administered over a 
14-day period. A group of five mice 
was given potassium antimony tar- 
trate in the diet at a concentration of 
0.2 percent. Because the experiment was 
adjunctive to a larger trial, more than 
100 additional infected mice, from the 
same infection batch and similarly 
housed in groups of five to ten animals 
each, received either no treatment or 
treatment with drugs that had no anti- 
schistosomal action. At necropsy, 28 
days after the beginning of treatment, 
the status of infection was assessed 
with respect to the intensity of egg- 
induced granuloma formation in the 
liver and the presence of live schisto- 
somes in the mesenteric veins (5). 

All mice treated with Laetrile, in 
any regimen, had infections that were 
indistinguishable from those of the un- 
treated mice or of the mice treated 
with nonantischistosomal drugs; that 
is, they had uniformly intense hepatic 
granuloma formation, the characteris- 
tic peripheral "dead worm lesions" of 
the liver were absent, and live worms 
were present in the veins. In contrast, 
all of the mice treated with the anti- 
monial drug were free of hepatic 
granulomata (no attempt was made 
to determine whether all of the worms 
had been killed). 

Thus Laetrile, as used in this experi- 
ment, neither killed the schistosomes 
nor suppressed their egg production 
(the latter usually being a sensitive 
indicator of antischistosomal activity). 
It is possible that the use of older in- 
fections or prolonged treatment would 
reveal an antischistosomal effect. Thus, 
although the therapeutic correlation 
between schistosomiasis in mouse and 
in man is quite good on a qualitative 
basis, these results do not rule out 
the possibility that Laetrile would be 
of value in the treatment of schisto- 
somiasis. 

WILLIAM C. CAMPBELL 
Merck Institute for Therapeutic 
Research, Rahway, New Jersey 07065 
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