
ing represented a major breakthrough. 
For Mexico, calculated social returns I 

on the investment of the Rockefeller 
Foundation in agricultural research 
there comes to an astounding 700 per- 
cent annually. But even more astonish- 
ing, the principal returns on this invest- 
ment are being realized outside Mexico: 
in India, Pakistan, Turkey, Afghanistan, 
and other countries. The acreage of 
Mexican wheat planted in Asia this year 
is several times that planted within Mex- 
ico, where virtually all wheatland is 
seeded to the high-yielding wheats. 
Perhaps even more important, the 
dwarf wheats became the new cereal 
prototype for the high-yielding rices 
which were to be developed at the In- 
ternational Rice Research Institute in 
the Philippines during the mid-1960's. 

Once it was discovered in the mid- 
1960's that the high-yielding Mexican 
wheats were adapted to growing con- 
ditions on the Indian-Pakistan subcon- 
tinent, the seeds were imported from 
Mexico in large quantities. Pakistan im- 
ported 42,000 tons of Mexican wheat 
for seed. This import, planted on 1.5 
million acres, yielded enough wheat to 
seed all of Pakistan's wheatland the 
following year. Thus Pakistan was able 
to telescope the many years normally 
required for the research, development, 
and multiplication of new seeds. Over 
the past 5 years, since the large-scale 
commercial introduction of the Mexi- 
can wheats into West Pakistan, where 
their impact has been particularly dra- 
matic, cereal production has nearly 
doubled. West Pakistan is now a net 
exporter of both wheat and rice. In- 
dia's wheat crop, totaling 12 million 
tons 5 years ago, reached 21 million 
tons in 1970, a 75 percent increase. 
Its overall cereal crop is now expand- 
ing more rapidly than population. 

The rapid spread of Borlaug's high- 
yielding wheats and the high-yielding 
dwarf rices modeled after them has not 
been without problems, as he himself 
has noted. But, for the most part, these 
are problems of success. Marketing sys- 
tems are overloaded by the dramatic in- 
creases in production and even more 
dramatic increases in the marketable 
surpluses. An Indian villager market- 
ing one-third of his wheat harvest with 
traditional varieties finds his yields dou- 
bled and his marketable surplus quad- 
rupled with Borlaug's new seeds. 
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acres in 1965 to more than 40 million 
acres in 1970, accounts for more than 
one-tenth of the more productive cereal 
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land in Asia. The further spread of the 
new seeds at this point is being con- 
strained in many areas by the lack of 
adequate water supplies. Farmers able 
to use the new seeds have increased 
their net incomes two-, three- or four- 
fold. But those unable to use the new 
seeds for lack of water or credit some- 
times find themselves trapped with tra- 
ditional technologies in a market de- 
pressed by the sharp increase in sup- 
plies. Distribution of the benefits thus 
becomes a major social and, increasing- 
ly, political issue. The threat of disease 
catching up with the exogenous varieties 
is very real, though often overrated. 

It has become fashionable to criticize 
the "Green Revolution." Those who 
are prone to focus only on the second 
generation problems associated with 
the introduction and spread of the new 
seeds sometimes create the impression 
that it would have been better had the 
Green Revolution never occurred. As- 
sessing the contribution of these new 
seeds is not that difficult. To appreciate 
the impact of the new seeds on the 
food supply one need only ask what 
would conditions be like in these coun- 
tries in the absence of the new seeds. 
One need only recall the close brush 
with famine on the Indian-Pakistan sub- 
continent in 1966 and 1967, a famine 
that was averted only by shipping one- 
fifth of the U.S. wheat crop to India, 
and the projections of massive famine 
in Asia in the 1970's, to realize that 
the new seeds are a godsend. 

Rapid increases in cereal production 
are but one aspect of the agricultural 
breakthrough. The new seeds are bring- 
ing far-reaching changes in every seg- 
ment of society. They may be to the. 
agricultural revolution in the poor 
countries what the steam engine was to 
the industrial revolution in Europe. 

The new wheats and the high-yield- 
ing rices developed at the International 
Rice Research Institute and modeled 
after them, may possibly affect the well- 
being of more people in a shorter pe- 
riod of time than any technological ad- 
vance in history. This is not to imply 
that the new seeds offer a solution to 
the food problem, but they do buy 
some precious time, perhaps an addi- 
tional 10 to 15 years in which to stabi- 
lize population growth. If within 15 
years we are not well on our way to 
stabilizing world population growth, 
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Dr. Borlaug's monumental contribution 
will have been in vain. Let it not be so. 
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NEWS IN BRIEF 
* METRIC CONVERT: The National 
Aeronautics and Space Agency (NASA) 
has become the first federal agency to 
convert to the metric system. As of 14 
November the agency will require all 
technical reports, notes and memo- 
randa, contractor reports, and special 
publications to use the system, form- 
ally known as the International Sys- 
tem of Units. NASA has been grad- 
ually adopting metric measurements 
since 1962. Of the world's industrial- 
ized nations, only the United States, 
Great Britain, Canada, Australia, and 
New Zealand use the English system; 
Britain is now changing over. The Bu- 
reau of Standards is studying the 
feasibility of expanding the use of the 
metric system in this country. 

* WEATHER'S NAME: The Weather 
Bureau changed its name to the Na- 
tional Weather Service as of 3 October. 
The title reflects the new dignity con- 
ferred on weather as it becomes part 
of the National Oceanic and Atmo- 
spheric Administration (NOAA), a new 
agency in the Commerce Department. 
While the Service's functions remain 
unchanged, the Commerce Department 
says that its new title more accurately 
conveys its role as the nation's "Num- 
ber 1 purveyor" of weather warnings 
and advice. 

* SCHOLAR FLOW: The number of 
foreigners who came to the United 
States to study in the 1969-70 aca- 
demic year increased by 11 percent 
over the previous year, while the num- 
ber of Americans studying abroad de- 
clined slightly. And incoming scholars, 
totaling 147,618 last year, outnumber 
U.S. scholars abroad almost 5 to 1, 
according to Open Doors, a yearly pub- 
lication of the Institute of International 
Education. President of IIE Kenneth 
Holland explains, "International edu- 
cation has lost its luster as a public and 
intellectual value," and notes that fed- 
eral purse tightening and changes in 
university scholarship priorities have 
kept more students at home. Open 
Doors, which contains statistical tables 
on origins, places and fields of study, 
and sources of financial support for 

NEWS IN BRIEF 
* METRIC CONVERT: The National 
Aeronautics and Space Agency (NASA) 
has become the first federal agency to 
convert to the metric system. As of 14 
November the agency will require all 
technical reports, notes and memo- 
randa, contractor reports, and special 
publications to use the system, form- 
ally known as the International Sys- 
tem of Units. NASA has been grad- 
ually adopting metric measurements 
since 1962. Of the world's industrial- 
ized nations, only the United States, 
Great Britain, Canada, Australia, and 
New Zealand use the English system; 
Britain is now changing over. The Bu- 
reau of Standards is studying the 
feasibility of expanding the use of the 
metric system in this country. 

* WEATHER'S NAME: The Weather 
Bureau changed its name to the Na- 
tional Weather Service as of 3 October. 
The title reflects the new dignity con- 
ferred on weather as it becomes part 
of the National Oceanic and Atmo- 
spheric Administration (NOAA), a new 
agency in the Commerce Department. 
While the Service's functions remain 
unchanged, the Commerce Department 
says that its new title more accurately 
conveys its role as the nation's "Num- 
ber 1 purveyor" of weather warnings 
and advice. 

* SCHOLAR FLOW: The number of 
foreigners who came to the United 
States to study in the 1969-70 aca- 
demic year increased by 11 percent 
over the previous year, while the num- 
ber of Americans studying abroad de- 
clined slightly. And incoming scholars, 
totaling 147,618 last year, outnumber 
U.S. scholars abroad almost 5 to 1, 
according to Open Doors, a yearly pub- 
lication of the Institute of International 
Education. President of IIE Kenneth 
Holland explains, "International edu- 
cation has lost its luster as a public and 
intellectual value," and notes that fed- 
eral purse tightening and changes in 
university scholarship priorities have 
kept more students at home. Open 
Doors, which contains statistical tables 
on origins, places and fields of study, 
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international scholars, can be obtained 
from IIE Publications Division, 809 
United Nations Plaza, New York City 
10017. The cost is $3 per copy, or 
$2.50 each for orders for ten or more. 
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