
ably be predicted that the matter will 
become a major political issue by the 
next presidential election. 

If a broader federally supported 
health program is established without 
greater support of medical education 
and research, the medical schools will 
be subjected to ever greater demands 
for service and the production of man- 
power and will find it even harder to 
meet these demands. 

Two reports released within the past 
month can fairly be regarded as har- 
bingers of National Health Insurance. 
The first, released in late June, came 
from a Task Force on Medicaid and 
Related Programs, appointed last year 
by then Secretary of the Department of 
Health, Education, and Welfare Robert 
H. Finch. The panel, headed by Walter 
McNerny, president of the Blue Cross 
Association, provided a critique of the 
existing program rather than a design 
for National Health Insurance, but it 
did warn that a major expansion of gov- 
ernment and private insurance payments 
for service without a reordering of pri- 
orities and an augmentation of re- 
sources would result in "a disastrous 
rise in the cost of services that are 
already scarce." 

The task force does favor group prac- 
tice, prepaid health plans, and some 
form of National Health Insurance but 
offered "no prescription for a new 
health care delivery system." 

Initiated by Reuther 

Last week, the Committee for Na- 
tional Health Insurance, a group re- 
cruited from among well-known private 
citizens and founded by the late Walter 
Reuther (Science, 28 November 1969), 
urged enactment of a universal health 
insurance program. Financing would 
follow the federal trust fund pattern, 
with the money coming from general 
revenues (40 percent), a tax on em- 
ployers' payrolls (35 percent), and in- 
dividual contributions (25 percent). Pre- 
ventive medicine would be emphasized 
in the program, and the prepayment 
principle would be implemented through 
federal contracts with providers of serv- 
ice such as physicians in group practice. 

The committee has put forward no 
blueprint for a medical care delivery 
system. Reuther himself was regarded 
as believing that only putting massive 
pressure on the system would cause it to 

ably be predicted that the matter will 
become a major political issue by the 
next presidential election. 

If a broader federally supported 
health program is established without 
greater support of medical education 
and research, the medical schools will 
be subjected to ever greater demands 
for service and the production of man- 
power and will find it even harder to 
meet these demands. 

Two reports released within the past 
month can fairly be regarded as har- 
bingers of National Health Insurance. 
The first, released in late June, came 
from a Task Force on Medicaid and 
Related Programs, appointed last year 
by then Secretary of the Department of 
Health, Education, and Welfare Robert 
H. Finch. The panel, headed by Walter 
McNerny, president of the Blue Cross 
Association, provided a critique of the 
existing program rather than a design 
for National Health Insurance, but it 
did warn that a major expansion of gov- 
ernment and private insurance payments 
for service without a reordering of pri- 
orities and an augmentation of re- 
sources would result in "a disastrous 
rise in the cost of services that are 
already scarce." 

The task force does favor group prac- 
tice, prepaid health plans, and some 
form of National Health Insurance but 
offered "no prescription for a new 
health care delivery system." 

Initiated by Reuther 

Last week, the Committee for Na- 
tional Health Insurance, a group re- 
cruited from among well-known private 
citizens and founded by the late Walter 
Reuther (Science, 28 November 1969), 
urged enactment of a universal health 
insurance program. Financing would 
follow the federal trust fund pattern, 
with the money coming from general 
revenues (40 percent), a tax on em- 
ployers' payrolls (35 percent), and in- 
dividual contributions (25 percent). Pre- 
ventive medicine would be emphasized 
in the program, and the prepayment 
principle would be implemented through 
federal contracts with providers of serv- 
ice such as physicians in group practice. 

The committee has put forward no 
blueprint for a medical care delivery 
system. Reuther himself was regarded 
as believing that only putting massive 
pressure on the system would cause it to 

ably be predicted that the matter will 
become a major political issue by the 
next presidential election. 

If a broader federally supported 
health program is established without 
greater support of medical education 
and research, the medical schools will 
be subjected to ever greater demands 
for service and the production of man- 
power and will find it even harder to 
meet these demands. 

Two reports released within the past 
month can fairly be regarded as har- 
bingers of National Health Insurance. 
The first, released in late June, came 
from a Task Force on Medicaid and 
Related Programs, appointed last year 
by then Secretary of the Department of 
Health, Education, and Welfare Robert 
H. Finch. The panel, headed by Walter 
McNerny, president of the Blue Cross 
Association, provided a critique of the 
existing program rather than a design 
for National Health Insurance, but it 
did warn that a major expansion of gov- 
ernment and private insurance payments 
for service without a reordering of pri- 
orities and an augmentation of re- 
sources would result in "a disastrous 
rise in the cost of services that are 
already scarce." 

The task force does favor group prac- 
tice, prepaid health plans, and some 
form of National Health Insurance but 
offered "no prescription for a new 
health care delivery system." 

Initiated by Reuther 

Last week, the Committee for Na- 
tional Health Insurance, a group re- 
cruited from among well-known private 
citizens and founded by the late Walter 
Reuther (Science, 28 November 1969), 
urged enactment of a universal health 
insurance program. Financing would 
follow the federal trust fund pattern, 
with the money coming from general 
revenues (40 percent), a tax on em- 
ployers' payrolls (35 percent), and in- 
dividual contributions (25 percent). Pre- 
ventive medicine would be emphasized 
in the program, and the prepayment 
principle would be implemented through 
federal contracts with providers of serv- 
ice such as physicians in group practice. 

The committee has put forward no 
blueprint for a medical care delivery 
system. Reuther himself was regarded 
as believing that only putting massive 
pressure on the system would cause it to 

ably be predicted that the matter will 
become a major political issue by the 
next presidential election. 

If a broader federally supported 
health program is established without 
greater support of medical education 
and research, the medical schools will 
be subjected to ever greater demands 
for service and the production of man- 
power and will find it even harder to 
meet these demands. 

Two reports released within the past 
month can fairly be regarded as har- 
bingers of National Health Insurance. 
The first, released in late June, came 
from a Task Force on Medicaid and 
Related Programs, appointed last year 
by then Secretary of the Department of 
Health, Education, and Welfare Robert 
H. Finch. The panel, headed by Walter 
McNerny, president of the Blue Cross 
Association, provided a critique of the 
existing program rather than a design 
for National Health Insurance, but it 
did warn that a major expansion of gov- 
ernment and private insurance payments 
for service without a reordering of pri- 
orities and an augmentation of re- 
sources would result in "a disastrous 
rise in the cost of services that are 
already scarce." 

The task force does favor group prac- 
tice, prepaid health plans, and some 
form of National Health Insurance but 
offered "no prescription for a new 
health care delivery system." 

Initiated by Reuther 

Last week, the Committee for Na- 
tional Health Insurance, a group re- 
cruited from among well-known private 
citizens and founded by the late Walter 
Reuther (Science, 28 November 1969), 
urged enactment of a universal health 
insurance program. Financing would 
follow the federal trust fund pattern, 
with the money coming from general 
revenues (40 percent), a tax on em- 
ployers' payrolls (35 percent), and in- 
dividual contributions (25 percent). Pre- 
ventive medicine would be emphasized 
in the program, and the prepayment 
principle would be implemented through 
federal contracts with providers of serv- 
ice such as physicians in group practice. 

The committee has put forward no 
blueprint for a medical care delivery 
system. Reuther himself was regarded 
as believing that only putting massive 
pressure on the system would cause it to 
change. 

For the medical schools, the major 
policy question raised by the approach 
of NHI is whether medical education 
and research in the academic medical 

268 

change. 
For the medical schools, the major 

policy question raised by the approach 
of NHI is whether medical education 
and research in the academic medical 

268 

change. 
For the medical schools, the major 

policy question raised by the approach 
of NHI is whether medical education 
and research in the academic medical 

268 

change. 
For the medical schools, the major 

policy question raised by the approach 
of NHI is whether medical education 
and research in the academic medical 

268 

center should be supported from service 
payments or should be financed 
separately. 

The financial difficulties of the typical 
academic medical center arise in part 
from the kind of medicine practiced 
there and the payment policies of fed- 
eral programs and private insurers. 
Medical centers attract a great majority 
of patients suffering from acute disease 
or undergoing complex surgery. This 
kind of service requires a large staff of 
highly specialized physicians and nurses, 
as well as a big supporting cast of 
ancillary health personnel. Such patients 
depend on the full resources of a medi- 
cal center-including its education and 
research resources-but in practice it is 
impossible to prorate the costs of medi- 
cal education, research, and service, 
and so patients' bills, in this sense, 
never reflect full costs. 

The provisions of Medicare and 
Medicaid were strongly influenced by 
physicians in private practice through 
the American Medical Association, and 
it appears that payment provisions come 
much closer to paying full costs of care 
in community hospitals, where patients 
tend to receive less sophisticated treat- 
ment and stay for shorter terms. 

Medical education historically has 
been partly subsidized through pay- 
ments for service, but several factors, 
primarily the increase in the costs in 
teaching hospitals, have put the squeeze 
on this subsidy. The bias against fed- 
eral support of medical education, bol- 
stered through the years by organized 
medicine, has been breached but still 
remains consequential. Grants for con- 
struction of educational facilities for 
training health professionals were first 
authorized in 1963, and in 1966 the first 
institutional grants were appropriated. 
Federal money for medical educa- 
tion is still concentrated in two pro- 
grams, a "basic" improvement grant 
program and a "special" improvement 
grant program. Both are designed to 
reinforce expansion of medical school 
class size, but the basic program is 
essentially a formula grant program in 
which all medical schools share. The 
special grant program, first funded in 
fiscal 1968, is biased in favor of schools 
which are in financial trouble or which 
are making serious efforts at curriculum 
innovation. 

By last year, funding for each pro- 
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as a rescue fund for schools in extremis. 
The financial troubles of the medical 

schools have been compounded by the 
practice of piggybacking medical educa- 
tion on federal research-project funds. 
The partial payment of faculty salaries 
with funds from federal research grants 
has been a common medical school 
practice. That practice, which really 
financed the growth of medical schools 
in the past 2 decades, is now beginning 
to boomerang, as research funds are 
cut and a kind of reverse multiplier 
effect begins to, work. The crisis in 
health care can be looked upon as a 
crisis in financing. The Social Security 
approach to the problem has been to 
provide money to pay the medical bills 
of specific groups of people and to ig- 
nore the health care system and the ef- 
fects of major federal programs on that 
system. Medical education has been 
subsidized by service and research, so 
that medical education is financially the 
weakest spot in the system. 

Help For Education and Research 

There is little hope that the medical 
care system will be successfully re- 
formed or even shored up unless ways 
are found to recognize the importance 
of medical education and research to 
the system and to support them ade- 
quately. But just as observers agree that 
improved cost and quality controls will 
have to be built into a reformed health 
care delivery system, so medical educa- 
tion and research will also be 
scrutinized for performance and pro- 
ductivity. Medical schools will probably 
have to explain, for example, why, al- 
though they have managed a respect- 
able increase in the size of entering 
classes, they have been increasing the 
size of faculty at a much greater rate. 

National Health Insurance looks like 
an idea whose time is coming soon. It 
will be unfortunate, perhaps disastrous, 
if NHI follows the path of least politi- 
cal resistance, as did Medicare and 
Medicaid. The case histories of the two 
programs should convince those in 
charge to get the diagnosis right before 
they up the medication.-JOHN WALSIS 

Erratum: In "Layered basic complex in 
oceanic crust, Romanche Fracture, equatorial 
Atlantic Ocean" by W. G. Melson and G. Thomp- 
son (p. 817, 15 May), the third centered head, 
in Table 2 should read "C.I.P.W. normative 
composition (percent by weight)." 

Erratum: In Table 1 of "Transplantation: 
Pairing of donor and recipient" by F. H. Bach 
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