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A Pseudo Experience in 

Parapsychology 

The popular literature of parapsy- 
chology abounds in stories of the fol- 
lowing kind: A person is dreaming of 
a friend he hasn't seen or thought of in 
30 years. He is awakened by a call 
from a telegraph operator, telling him 
of the death of that friend several 
thousand miles away. Most scientists 
attribute such pairs of events to pure 
coincidence, but they offer no com- 
parable stories to show that such ap- 
parently improbable coincidences do in 
fact occur. In the absence of such dem- 
onstrations, it is not surprising that the 

general public feels that there must be 
a causal relation between the two 
events, as, for example, by thought 
transference. 

On 16 May 1965, reading the San 
Francisco Sunday Chronicle I noticed 
an article on page 22 entitled "An- 
cient men on the Nile." In scanning 
this story, I saw the phrase ". . . the 

expert appraisal of Philadelphia anthro- 

pologist Dr. Carleton S. Coon." To 

anyone who had been an undergraduate 
student at the University of Chicago in 
the early 1930's, this unusual name 
would call up nostalgic memories of 
another Carleton Coon and his partner, 
Joe Sanders, whose popular Coon-San- 
ders dance band was then playing at 
the Blackhawk. So I found myself 
thinking ,about Joe Sanders, very prob- 
ably for the first time in 30 years. 

Less than five minutes later, having 
turned the pages of the paper to page 
33, I saw an obituary notice headed 
"Joe Sanders." It read, ". . . died Friday. 
. .. with the late Carleton Coon ... or- 
ganized the Coon-Sanders band." These 
two closely spaced recollections of a 
person forgotten for 30 years, with the 
second event involving a death notice, 
is in the classical pattern; but it is ob- 
vious that no causal relationship could 
have existed between the two events. 

The probability of a coincidental rec- 
ollection of a known person in a 5- 
minute period just before learning of 
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that person's death can easily be cal- 
culated, to within a factor of 10. Let 
us take a 30-year period, and assume 
that an average person would recognize 
the names of 3000 different people who 
might die in that period of time (3000 
is taken as a geometrical mean of 103 
and 104, the probable extremes of a 
population of "known persons"). We 
assume that our subject will learn of 
the death of each of these persons at 
some time in the 30 years. If we re- 
strict our attention to the time when 
our subject learns of the death of a par- 
ticular person, we can then ask how 
probable it is, that in the 5 minutes just 
preceding that exact time of learning 
of the death, an unrelated recollection 
that is unique to the 30-year period will 
occur. This probability, to within a fac- 
tor of 2, is the ratio of a 5-minute in- 
terval to a 30-year interval, or 3 X 
10-7. (It is clear that if one thinks of 
the particular person once a year rath- 
er than once every 30 years, the prob- 
ability will rise by a factor of 30, to 
about 10-5.) The probability that one 
will have such an experience when 
learning of the death of any one of 
the 3000 recognizable persons is clear- 
ly 10-3 in a 30-year period, or ap- 
proximately 3 X 100-5 per year. If we 
take the sample of 108 adults in the 
United States, 3 X 103 experiences of 
the sort related above should occur 
per year, or about 10 per day. (For 
the average person 3000 recognizable 
names is probably an overestimate, but 
the postulated single recollection in 30 
years is certainly much too low. These 
two departures from realistic assump- 
tions have opposite effects on the com- 
puted rate, so 10 per day is still a rea- 
sonable estimate.) With such a large 
sample to draw from, it is not surpris- 
ing that some exceedingly astonishing 
coincidences are reported in the para- 
psychological literature as proof of 
extrasensory perception in one form or 
another. 

LuIS W. ALVAREZ 
Physics Department, 
University of California, Berkeley 
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Elinor Langer's lucid report "Na- 
tional teach-in: Professors, debating 
Viet-Nam . . ." (21 May, p. 1075) 
incites the following comments: 

1) The "academic dissenters" should 
have recognized that a political ad- 
ministration cannot afford to enter into 
direct debate with any portion of the 
electorate, however high-minded, ex- 
cept as the forms and uses of govern- 
ment provide for debate-for instance, 
within the legislature or at specified 
times immediately preceding election. 
Any administration whose executive 
branch allows itself the luxury of direct 
debate outside of such constitutional 
and customary forms is inviting its own 
fragmentation and the dissolution of 
the two-party system. Therefore, to ask, 
to demand, that an administration do 
so is politically irrational. 

2) Bundy, or the administration, 
should of course have recognized this 
fact, ignored the provocation to direct 
debate, and kept his literate mouth 
shut. The quotations from his letters 
to the professors seem to show that 
his failure to deflect the challenge (not 
the arguments, which should be freely 
made and freely heard) from the execu- 
tive to the legislative branch and to 
the forum of public opinion was the 
result of a fatigue psychosis with its 
usual holier-than-thou attitude. Pressed 
by unbelievers, Bundy couldn't resist 
playing God. 

3) In short, both academia and gov- 
ernment lost their heads, which isn't 
surprising. Indeed, the republic has 
survived hysterical escalations of this 
kind since it began. But now we have 
The Button. If both these heads be 
lost, under whose finger, moved by 
what head, lies that Button, and the 
power to write "Mene, mene, tekel, 
upharsin"? 

MONTGOMERY HARE 

Cornwall Bridge, Connecticut 

Recording Lissajous Figures 

The graphical recording of Lissajous 
figures by mechanical means demon- 
strates the motion of a double pendulum. 
Wayne B. Hales reported on one such 
graphical method [J. Acoust. Soc. Am. 
16, 137 (1945)], and the beauty and 
design of his figures have inspired me 
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