
in this volume. Incidentally, the volume 
can boast of only an 18 percent reduc? 
tion when compared with its parent text, 
but that figure tells only a small part of 
the story. In reading the smaller volume 
one feels that the authors were strongly 
aware of the need for brevity and strove 
hard to compensate with a gain in 

punch and lucidity. The illustrations 
are definitely far more meaningful than 
in the larger text, and significant bits of 
new material have been added here and 

there, out of respect to their timeliness. 
I am particularly pleased to see that 

many of the historical references in the 
older text, which showed the stamp of 
19th century distortions, have been sig? 
nificantly mollified to bring them more 
in line with recent findings. The style is 

snappy and crisp. The placement of the 

questions and answers at the end of the 
book and the economical use of refer? 
ences will please both teachers and stu? 
dents. This book, more than any other 
in the field, may well be read with 

profit and pleasure by any literate man 
who wishes to know the alphabet and 

scope of modern physical science. 
A few general comments may not be 

out of place here. It is hard to conceive 
that any college student (or high-school 
senior), even those who are neither 

particularly interested nor gifted in 
scientific-mathematical discipline, can 
fail to be deeply stirred intellectually by 
a course which employs a volume such 
as this one and which has a teacher that 
can give the text its real meaning. Such 
a student is bound to be better informed 
in science than is the average con- 

temporary engineer in history, Ameri? 
can literature, or modern painting. 
There is hardly a chapter in this book 
that does not pry the mind loose, chal? 

lenge its latent powers to their limits, 
and enrich it with factual knowledge. 
Therefore, one cannot help being de- 

pressed by the post-Sputnik hysteria 
that erupted on several American cam- 

puses, one symptom of which was a 
blind rage against the general science 
courses and a demand for students, one 
and all, to return to the orthodox 
course of the 1920's. As a chemist on 
one campus put it: A year of real chem? 

istry with holes in one's pants from 
nitric acid will teach a fellow more 
science and logic than 10 general sci? 
ence courses. And a friendly botanist 
beside him chimed in: And get his 
hands dirty. 

How many people with holes in their 

pants and dirty hands, and feet too, 
learned little about science! No teacher 
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using this volume would want to teach 
its contents without exhaustive demon- 
strations and some meaningful labora? 

tory work. Moreover, on one campus it 
is a fact that, on senior college entry 
tests, nonscience students who had 
had the general science course (using 
the older Krauskopf text) did just 
as well as students who specialized 
in science, since, I presume, the tests 
dealt with general questions. Because 
the controversy is still dormant in many 
minds, it is a pleasure to see books such 
as the one under review, for their very 
existence speaks louder than words for 
the educational cause they serve. 

Mark Graubard 
Natural Science, Interdisciplinary 
Studies, University of Minnesota 
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