
physics of the University of Chicago 
and was an associate director of the 
Yerkes and McDonald observatories. 

Facilities 

The first major telescope to go into 
operation at Kitt Peak will be the 36-
inch reflector that has just been installed. 
Not large by modern standards, it is 
nevertheless of advanced design, for use 
primarily as a photoelectric instrument 
for measuring star brightness. It will be 
the forerunner of an 84-inch reflector 
to be completed in 1961 or 1962. 

The mirror blank for the 84-inch re­
flector has recently been delivered to 
the observatory from Corning Glass 
Works, Corning, N.Y. The final grind­
ing and polishing are being done by the 
observatory staff. 

Design of a large orbital (satellite) 
telescope is perhaps the most dramatic 
project now under way at the observa­
tory. Unlike the specialized, smaller 
orbital telescopes now being planned by 
other observatories, this is to be an 
instrument of high resolving power, to 
be turned into position on command 
from earth and to communicate its ob­
servations back to earth. An instrument 
of 50-inch aperture is at present under 
consideration. 

Construction of the orbital telescope 
is a long-range project, and it is ex­
pected that such a large, fully controlla­
ble instrument will not be put in orbit 
for several years. The project was placed 
under the direction of the Kitt Peak 
National Observatory both because the 
size of the effort would probably ex­
ceed the capacity of a single university 
and because it is planned that, once such 
a telescope is in orbit, it will be a part 
of the observatory's regular instrumenta­
tion and will be available, as are the 
observatory's other telescopes, to all 
qualified U.S. astronomers. 

The National Science Foundation 
and the observatory are cooperating 
with the National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration at all stages of 
planning and design of the instrument. 
Close coordination with NASA's pro­
gram of astronomy in space is being 
maintained. 

Also being planned is a new solar 
telescope that will be the world's largest. 
This instrument will have a parabolic 
mirror 60 inches in diameter with a 
focal length of 300 feet, which will pro­
duce a solar image several times larger 
and more brightly illuminated than that 
attainable by any other ground-based 
solar instrument. 
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Oceanographers Will Study 

Little-Known Swan Islands 

This month the Coast and Geodetic 
Survey's oceanographic research ship 
Explorer will visit one of America's 
smallest and least-known possessions, 
the Swan Islands, for a series of studies. 
The Swan Islands are two tiny strips of 
land in the Caribbean Sea, 97 miles 
northeast of Honduras. Thickly wooded 
Great Swan is about 2 miles long and 
V2 mile wide. Rocky, inaccessible Lit­
tle Swan is \V% miles long and V2 mile 
wide. Only the larger island is popu­
lated. 

Oceanographers are particularly in­
terested in the Swans because they lie 
near the precipitous depths of the Cay­
man Trough. Coast and Geodetic divers 
will explore the shelf and sea surround­
ing the islands. Photographs of animal 
and plant life will be made, sea water 
will be chemically tested, and samples 
of bottom sediment will be taken. 

Other Projects Planned 

Other projects will be carried out for 
various government agencies cooperat­
ing in the work. A geological survey is 
scheduled. Deep-sea creatures will be 
collected for the Fish and Wildlife Serv­
ice. Specimens of island mammals, rep­
tiles, and insects will be gathered for 
the Smithsonian Institution. (Some of 
the animals may go to the National 
Zoological Park for exhibit.) 

Wildlife on the Swans was described 
by a British archeologist-zoologist who 
visited the islands in 1938. On Little 
Swan he saw innumerable booby gan-
nets, so tame they pecked fearlessly at 
his legs. He also observed frigate birds, 
many iguanas, and the hutia—the 
strange, rabbit-sized rodent that nests 
in jagged rock fissures under prickly 
bushes. Of the insects, the ants were the 
worst pests, the Englishman wrote. He 
suffered some 300 bites that itched for 
weeks. 

Census To Be Taken 

Besides its scientific work, the current 
expedition will take a 1960 census of 
the Swans for the United States Census 
Bureau. The 1950 count was made by 
a member of the Civil Aeronautics Ad­
ministration on duty there. At the time, 
36 persons—mostly men but including 
a few women and children—were living 
on Great Swan. Twelve of these had 
been born in the United States. The 
others were from other Caribbean is­
lands and from Central America. 

The United States acquired sover­
eignty over the Swans in 1863. Since 
1857, when American firms first col­
lected guano for export under the 1856 
Guano Act, American interests and per­
sonnel manning navigation and com­
munication outposts have continuously 
used and accupied the islands. 

The U.S. Weather Bureau now main­
tains a meteorological station on Great 
Swan; the Civil Aeronautics Adminis­
tration maintains an airways beacon. 

President Names New Member of 

the Atomic Energy Commission 

Robert E. Wilson, chemical engineer 
who retired in 1958 as chief executive 
officer and chairman of the board of 
the Standard Oil Company of Indiana, 
has been named by President Eisen­
hower to be a member of the Atomic 
Energy Commission. He will fill the 
vacancy created in the five-man com­
mission by the death last August of 
Harold S. Vance. Wilson has been nomi­
nated to serve the 4 months remaining 
in Vance's term and a 5-year term of 
his own. 

The proposed new member has had 
considerable experience in the activities 
of the AEC, having served on the com­
mission's general advisory committee 
since shortly after the commission was 
created in 1947. Hearings on the nomi­
nation by the Joint Congressional Com­
mittee on Atomic Energy are expected 
to be held soon. 

With Republicans Wilson and chair­
man John A. McCone, the commission 
will have a political make-up of two 
Republicans, one Democrat (John S. 
Graham), and two independents (John 
F. Floberg and John H. Williams). The 
Atomic Energy Law sets no require­
ment for the political composition of 
the commission and, although the Joint 
Committee has a Democratic majority, 
appointments to the Atomic Energy 
Commission are traditionally apolitical. 
John McCone said recently: "The other 
commissioners and I are delighted that 
Dr. Wilson has accepted the President's 
nomination." 

Markle Scholars Named 

Twenty-five young medical scientists, 
all faculty members of medical schools 
in the United States and Canada, have 
been appointed Markle Scholars in 
Medical Science by the John and Mary 
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