
fabricating and processing techniques is 
given. The book is, however, by no means 

just a catalog or a handbook, for the 
relevant metallurgical factors responsible 
for the particular characteristics of this 
group of alloys are discussed in a com- 
petent and sophisticated manner. 

To question the usefulness to an 
American audience of a book on a class 
of alloys used primarily in Great Britain 
seems justifiable. Yet, although the prop- 
erties and treatments vary somewhat, 
there is much similarity between the 
nimonics and the inconel type of alloys 
so popular in this country. Thus, a per- 
son can find much information that is 
pertinent to all of the high-strength 
nickel-base alloys in this fine volume. 

ROBERT A. HUGGINS 
Department of Metallurgical 
Engineering, Stanford University 

Vascular Plants of the Pacific Northwest. 
Part 4, Ericaceae through Campanu- 
laceae. C. Leo Hitchock, Arthur Cron- 
quist, Marion Ownbey. University of 
Washington Press, Seattle, 1959. 510 
pp. Illus. $12. 

The fourth volume of this flora (the 
second to be published) covers the 
Gamopetalae, except the Compositae, of 
the region extending from southern 
British Columbia south to northern Ore- 
gon, to Idaho north of the Snake River 
plains, and to western Montana. The 
work wisely follows the Engler and 
Prantl system; the families from Erica- 
ceae through Cuscutaceae are presented 
by C. L. Hitchcock; the remainder, from 
Polemoniaceae through Campanulaceae, 
by Arthur Cronquist, except for Castil- 
leja, the second largest genus in the vol- 
ume (the largest being Penstemon), 
which has been prepared by Marion 
Ownbey. 

The book presents, on the whole, a 
conservative account of the families in- 
cluded, with keys, descriptions, full ref- 
erences (with citation of type collec- 
tions), ample synonymy, and a figure of 
each species. The keys and descriptions 
appear to be carefully worked out, and 
the illustrations, by Jeanne R. Janish, 
are of the high quality characteristic of 
the work of this artist. She possesses, to 
a rare degree, the ability to represent 
habital characters effectively, in com- 
paratively simple drawings; her figures 
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Dasynotus, the only genus of Boragin- 
aceae that is endemic in the area.) 

The treatment differs from that of all 
other floras of this type with which I 
am acquainted in the abundance of dis- 
cussion under the individual species. In 
this volume are given the range and dis- 
tinctive features of the fairly numerous 
infraspecific taxa recognized, together 
with the reasons for the reduction of 
the very numerous species and infraspe- 
cific forms that are placed in synonymy. 
It would seem that the bulk of this ma- 
terial could have been made available 
in preliminary publications, and that 
only the taxonomic conclusions need 
have been presented here; this would 
have saved space and would have made 
for greater clarity. Many of the species 
are under cultivation or are worthy of 
cultivation; and mention of this fact is 
almost always made under the generic 
descriptions-an unusual and commend- 
able feature in a floristic work. 

The book is lithographed from un- 
justified typescript and has the monoto- 
nous appearance characteristic of this 
style of reproduction. The information 
is there, but it has to be sought; even the 
names of species are in the same type as 
the rest. There appear to be very few 
typographical errors; the only one I de- 
tected was "Kuntze" for "Kunze," on 
page 90. A serious fault is the alpha- 
betical arrangement adopted for genera 
under the families and for species under 
the genera, without any number system. 
The only conceivable advantage of this 
method is that it cuts down the space 
required for the index; it is no easier, 
in fact it is more difficult, to find 
Penstemon nemorosus, for instance, in 
the 40-page alphabetical treatment of 
the genus Penstemon after one has 
reached it in the key than if it had been 
numbered and placed in its proper sys- 
tematic position. The characters used in 
the keys are often so artificial, or are so 
arranged, that they give no hint of taxo- 
nomic relationships; consequently there 
is little or no indication of the real 
affinities of the taxa dealt with. The ab- 
sence of a numbering system makes it 
impossible to ascertain how many spe- 
cies are given in each genus without 
counting them-surely a responsibility 
of the author rather than the reader. 
The alphabetical arrangement of spe- 
cies also makes it more difficult to com- 
pare descriptions of closely allied plants 
and usually requires that illustrations of 
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leja, with 41 species, contains about 16 
groups of two or three species each, but 
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in only one case (and then only for two 
out of three species) do two species of 
any one group appear on the same plate. 
Examination of the couplets and trip- 
lets in the Penstemon key shows a simi- 
lar situation. Surely any possible advan- 
tage of the alphabetical arrangement is 
not enough to offset these real draw- 
backs. 

In coverage the work overlaps L. R. 
Abrams' Illustrated Flora of the Pacific 
States, of which the fourth and final vol- 
ume is due to appear during the year. 
The geographical area of overlap is 
about 35 percent of the total covered 
in Abrams' flora and about 45 percent 
of that covered by Hitchcock et al., but 
the percentage of species common to 
the two works is very much greater. In 
this volume, out of approximately 671 
species included, only 84 are assigned a 
range that does not include at least one 
of the Pacific coast states-that is, ap- 
proximately 587 out of 671 species 
should also be described in Abrams' 
work-of course, often with a more or 
less different circumscription. Grateful 
as one should be for the fresh illustra- 
tions of these species and for the liberal 
discussion of their variation and affini- 
ties, it does seem that a financial bur- 
den is being placed upon the private 
botanists of Oregon and Washington if 
they are to be expected to obtain copies 
of both works; at the present rate of 
increase in prices, it appears certain that 
this will cost them over $120. 

S. F. BLAKE 
U.S. Agricultural Research Service, 
Beltsville, Maryland 

Medical Museum Technology. J. J. Ed- 
wards and M. J. Edwards. Oxford 
University Press, New York, 1959. 
x+ 172 pp. Illus. + plates. $3.40. 

This interesting little book is divided 
into three parts, the first two of which 
should be of particular value to the 
medical historian. The first part deals 
concisely with the history of the pres- 
ervation of anatomical specimens, from 
antiquity to the mid-19th century. The 
second part is concerned with the dis- 
covery and introduction of Formalin 
preservation. These historical portions 
occupy about one-half of the book and 
contain accounts of the principal con- 
tributors to medical museum technology. 
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preservation which are acceptable by 
modern standards of technology. These 
include fixation, with emphasis on Kai- 
serling's method, and techniques for 
common special situations. Gross stain- 
ing, mounting in liquid media, color 
injection, solid plastic and paper mount- 
ing, maceration, casts, and the prepara- 
tion of transparencies are adequately 
covered. The fabrication of plastic jars 
is illustrated. 

The book concludes with a discussion 
of the organization of the medical mu- 
seum, with hints on the structure, fit- 
tings, arrangement, and labeling and 
selection of specimens. 

An inexperienced person could not 
depend wholly on this book as a guide 
for preparing specimens or setting up a 
medical museum, for most of the in- 
structions are not sufficiently detailed. 
However, an experienced technologist 
could profitably use this work as a 
guide for training others. Or a person 
who has some experience with museum 
techniques could add to his effective- 
ness through judicious use of the hints 
and methods given. 

The principal difficulty facing the 
American reader of the book is its fre- 
quent use of British trade names of 
chemicals and materials. The book con- 
tains a list of suppliers of museum chem- 
icals and equipment, but these are al- 
most exclusively British. A glossary of 
American equivalents for these items, 
together with a list of suppliers, would 
be a valuable addition. 

FRANK B. JOHNSON 
Armed Forces Institute of Pathology, 
Walter Reed Army Medical Center 

The Study of Population. An appraisal 
and inventory. Philip M. Hauser and 
Otis D. Duncan, Eds. University of 
Chicago Press, Chicago, Ill., 1959. 
xvi + 864 pp. $15. 

Sponsored by the National Science 
Foundation, this book is designed to in- 
vestigate "the status of demography as 
a science." Whether or not the reader re- 
gards the objective as having been 
achieved will obviously depend both 
upon his definition of science and upon 
the criteria he regards as relevant in 
determining how far there is an "ordered 
body of knowledge" capable of produc- 
ing explanatory or predictive generali- 
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raphers will agree on these questions or 
will be satisfied with the statement by 
the editors--who have themselves con- 
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tributed the major introductory chap- 
ters-that "demography is a science 
because it embodies all the essential ele- 
ments of scientific outlook and method." 
But whatever controversy may develop 
here, the volume will certainly be wel- 
comed, for it constitutes the most com- 
prehensive survey of the field of demo- 
graphic study so far produced. The 
editors are to be congratulated not only 
for bringing together the results of very 
substantial expertise but also for desig- 
nating the most relevant areas and the 
broad lines of approach. 

The main content of the volume is 
presented in three large sections. The 
first covers the development of demog- 
raphy in a variety of countries and in 
addition, is introduced by a very infor- 
mative general survey (by Frank Lori- 
mer) of the history of the discipline. If it 
appears a little surprising that the gen- 
eral survey ends, in effect, with World 
War II, this is because the various chap- 
ters in the second large section, which 
is focused upon the major subjects of 
demographic analysis, give the more 
recent developments in ample detail. 
From that point of view, the chapters 
on fertility, mortality, and international 
migration-to cite just a few examples 
-are model surveys. The third and final 
main section deals with the relation- 
ship between demography and other dis- 
ciplines, such as genetics, ecology, phys- 
ical anthropology, and economics. 

The book is not always easy reading; 
not even the graduate student will be 
able to use it as an intellectual "night- 
cap." In some cases, as in the chapter 
on physical anthropology, the treatment 
is necessarily technical, while in others, 
as in the chapter on fertility, the lan- 
guage is rather opaque. What the reader 
derives from the volume will, of course, 
depend upon his particular interests: I 
found Ryder's chapter on fertility and 
Moore's chapter on sociology and dem- 
ography the most stimulating. But the 
symposium as a whole is very reward- 
ing. Those nonspecialists who are pre- 
pared to take the trouble will discover 
what demographers are really doing. 
And the specialists themselves will see, 
probably more clearly than ever before, 
the need for closer links with the other 
social sciences, if demography is to con- 
tinue to develop fruitfully. The Study of 
Population does far more than describe 
a discipline; it sets out the lines for fu- 
ture growth. 
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In this successor to In Search of 
Adam, Herbert Wendt has written, to 
use his own words, not just a sober fac- 
tual account of the animal world, but a 
kind of novel of the animal world-a 
novel with many chapters, which are 
only superficially disjointed. This is a 
fair description of the book, for it takes 
up, division by division, each section of 
the animal kingdom and portrays each 
class and phylum in an informal and 
more-or-less intimate way, so that the 
reader (who may not know much zool- 
ogy to begin with) is left with some real 
appreciation of each group as it now is 
and some understanding of how it has 
come to be. Excellent photographs 
throughout the book enhance its appear- 
ance and augment the effect. 

Much of the story may seem to be 
by-the-way, for the road to man, as 
presented here, is not a one-track drive 
toward human emergence but a broad 
adventurous journey of all animal life, 
step by step, from unicellar forms to the 
specialized, climactic remnants of each 
time and type that still survive in the 
contemporary world. The emphasis, in 
other words, is on living creatures, but 
with indication of their role in the 
scheme of things past as well as present. 
Eventually, and more from the nature 
of the evolutionary course than from any 
preoccupation with human beings on the 
part of the author, the anthropoids and 
man find their place. With the aid of ex- 
cerpts from the writings of contempo- 
rary naturalists, Wendt portrays lives 
and communities for their owvn sake, 
with genuine interest, whether they re- 
late to human existence or not. Both 
love and sorrow are reflected between 
the lines: a reverence for life similar to 
Schweitzer's and an expressed grief and 
subdued anger at the impending doom 
of the world of great mammals, which 
are still to be seen on the plains of Africa 
but are unlikely to survive the present 
century. Wendt fully recognizes the as- 
cendancy of man and the dramatic na- 
ture of Man's evolution, but at the same 
time he faces the fact that this ascend- 
ancy is bringing the age of mammals to 
an end in our own time, and that we can 
do little more than prolong the agony. 
His book is one to enjoy for its detail 
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