
mous approval of the study, the Senate 
allocated $60,000 and gave the com- 
mittee until the end of January 1960 to 
complete its report. More money and 
an extension of time to June or July of 
next year will probably be requested by 
the subcommittee. 

Jackson's group will work with rep- 
resentatives of the National Security 
Council in conducting the study. The 
issue, the men, and the cooperation of 
the President, observers suggest, indi- 
cate that the committee's work will 
lead to important legislation. 

"Most Scientific" Satellite 

Put in Orbit 7 August 

A 142-pound satellite, designed to 
conduct 15 experiments during its year 
of life, has been placed in a highly ellip- 
tical orbit around the earth by the Na- 
tional Aeronautics and Space Adminis- 
tration. The launching vehicle, a three- 
stage Thor-Able rocket, left the pad at 
Cape Canaveral at 10:23 A.M. on 7 Au- 
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gust after one short delay in the count- 
down. 

The satellite, which has an apogee of 
26,400 miles and a perigee of 156, has 
the following devices and experiments: 
three devices to map the radiation belt 
ringing the earth with each of the instru- 
ments concentrating on a specific radia- 
tion energy level; a 2/2-pound scanning 
device which is designed to relay a crude 
picture of the earth's cloud cover; 8000 
solar cells, 1000 on each side of the four 
vanes, to generate current to recharge 
the satellite's chemical batteries; a mi- 
crometeorite detector to gauge the size 
and speed of meteoric particles hitting 
the satellite; two types of magnetometers 
to map the earth's magnetic field; and 
four experiments to study the behavior 
of radio waves, all aimed at finding out 
more about deep space communications. 
According to a NASA spokesman, all of 
the devices in the satellite were operat- 
ing properly 3 days after the launching. 
Because of the four vanes, or "paddle 
wheels," projecting from its body, the 
new satellite is unusual in appearance. 
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Second Bill to Spur Private 
Philanthropy Given No More 
Chance than the First 

A proposal to stimulate private phi- 
lanthropy for education, embodying 
ideas recently put forth by Clifford C. 
Furnas, chancellor of the University of 
Buffalo, has been introduced in the 
House of Representatives. This is the 
second measure with this aim now be- 
fore Congress. Earlier this year, Repre- 
sentative Frank Thompson, Jr., (D-N.J.) 
and Senator James E. Murray (D-Mont.) 
introduced identical bills providing all 
taxpayers with the same tax benefits for 
philanthropy that are now allowed per- 
sons in the top-income brackets. These 
bills, which reflected the conclusions of 
the AAAS-sponsored study "Stimulating 
Voluntary Giving to Higher Education 
and Other Programs," are before the 
House Ways and Means Committee 
and the Senate Finance Committee. 

The new measure, which was intro- 
duced 23 July by Representative Harris 
B. McDowell, Jr., (D-Del.), allows $1 of 
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tax credit for every $1 given to institu- 
tions of higher learning by individuals 
and corporations. In the case of an in- 
dividual, this credit would be limited to 
10 percent of his adjusted gross income 
if he takes the standard deduction or 
uses the short form for his tax return, or 
30 percent if he itemizes his deductions; 
in the case of a corporation the limit 
would be 5 percent of taxable income. 
Within these limits it would, in effect, 
cost the taxpayer nothing to contribute 
to education. Chancellor Furnas esti- 
mates that a plan such as that proposed 
by Congressman McDowell will yield 
approximately $2 billion for higher edu- 
cation. 

Under provisions of the bills intro- 
duced earlier this year by Thompson 
and Murray, the flow of funds to edu- 
cation would be increased by allowing 
all taxpayers to subtract from their tax 
payments 91 percent (.52 percent for 
corporations) of the amount they had 
contributed to institutions of higher edu- 
cation within an upper limit of 15 per- 
cent (10 percent for corporations) of 
their adjusted gross income. 

Administration Opposed 

Reports on the bills from the govern- 
mental departments will almost without 
question be unfavorable. Previously pro- 
posed legislation, particularly that con- 
cerned with tax credits for college tu- 
ition, has revealed the Administration's 
position on such measures. The Depart- 
ment of Health, Education, and Wel- 
fare has opposed such tax credit meas- 
ures on the grounds that they are incon- 
sistent with good public policy. In the 
department's view, support of bills such 
as the McDowell and Thompson pro- 
posals would constitute an abdication of 
responsibility. Public funds, the depart- 
ment feels, should be disbursed by the 
elected representatives of the people- 
the Congress-on the basis of criteria 
set up to meet the educational needs of 
the country as a whole. Otherwise, in 
the administration's view, there would 
be no guarantee that particularly needy 
educational institutions would receive 
the support they require. Tax revenues 
that are now being used to support such 
nationwide programs as that set up 
through the National Defense Educa- 
tional Act would, the department feels, 
be donated to institutions preferred by 
the individual taxpayer. 

The Treasury Department opposes tax 
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gests, a bill based on his proposals will 
bring in $2 billion to educational insti- 
tutions, it will also divert that much 
revenue from the government. 

Opposition on these grounds, which 
apply equally to the McDowell and 
Thompson bills, will probably result in 
strongly unfavorable reports from the 
departments. How will these reports in- 
fluence the two committees to which the 
bills have been referred? To judge from 
past response to measures of this nature, 
only a heavy and concerted drive in 
Congress could make the current bills 
into law. There is little evidence that 
such a drive is in preparation. 

Committees Named for Science 

Writing Awards 

Ten represenatives from the fields of 
journalism, science, and education have 
been named to administer the recently 
established AAAS-Westinghouse Science 
Writing Awards. The ten, who will com- 
pose the screening and judging commit- 
tees, will select the best science writing, 
exclusive of that in medicine, to appear 
in the nation's newspapers and general 
magazines during the current contest 
year; The writer of the best science story 
in each of the two types of publications 
will be awarded $1000. The awards will 
be presented at the annual meeting of 
the AAAS in Chicago in December. 

The judges are: Graham DuShane, 
editor of Science; Earl English, dean of 
the school of journalism at the Univer- 
sity of Missouri; Caryl Haskins, presi- 
dent of the Carnegie Institution of 
Washington; James A. Linen, publisher 
of Time; Morris Meister, president of 
Bronx Community College; Alan T. 
Waterman, director of the National Sci- 
ence Foundation; and J. Russell Wig- 
gins, vice president and executive edi- 
tor, Washington Post and Times Her- 
ald, and president of the American So- 
ciety of Newspaper Editors. 

The screening committe has the fol- 
lowing members: Hillier Kriegbaum, 
department of journalism, New York 
University; Sidney Negus, department 
of biochemistry, Medical College of Vir- 
ginia; and James Stokley, school of 
journalism, Michigan State University. 

The AAAS-Westinghouse Science 
Writing Awards were established to give 
recognition and encouragement to out- 
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The AAAS, the National Association of 
Science Writers, and Westinghouse co- 
operated in setting up the awards, which 
are supported by a grant from the West- 
inghouse Educational Foundation. 

Entries in the newspaper competition 
must have been published between 1 Oc- 
tober 1958 and 30 September 1959; in 
the magazine competition, entries must 
have appeared in editions dated between 
October 1958 and September 1959 in- 
clusive. To be eligible, all entries must 
be posted before midnight, 10 October 
1959, and must have been published in 
a newspaper or magazine within the 
United States. 

Inquiries about the competition and 
requests for entry blanks by entrants 
or their editors should be addressed 
to: Graham DuShane, Administrator, 
AAAS-Westinghouse Science Writing 
Awards, 1515 Massachusetts Ave., NW, 
WVashington 5, D.C. 

"Takuyo Mlaru," Another 

"Lucky Dragon"? 

Last July tile Japanese Coast Guard 
vessel Takuyo Maru abandoned a scien- 
tific survey in the South Pacific after 
encountering radioactive rain 186 miles 
outside the danger zone for the United 
States Eniwetok nuclear test area. Now 
Hirokicho Nagano, 34, chief engineer of 
the survey ship, has died of leukemia. 
The Associated Press quotes Japanese 
officials as having said on 5 August: 

"We cannot announce thce :sse of 
death now because it is a very delicate 
matter that could cause international Ic- 
percussions. There will be an announce- 
ment later." 

A spokesman for the Atomic Energy 
Commission reports that the medical 
question of whether or not the leukemia 
can be traced to the incident is under 
investigation. At the time of the acci- 
dent, American and Japanese physicians 
examined the crew and found no evi- 
dence of harmful radiation, although 
some of the men had suffered a decrease 
in white blood corpuscles. Nagano was 
one of these. 

There have been no continuing medi- 
cal studies because the levels of exposure 
were considered to have been very low. 
However, a definite figure is not avail- 
able since the Takuyo Maru did not 
carry instruments for measuring radio- 
activity. In fact, last summer Japanese 
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newspapers were sharply critical be- 
cause the vessel had been sent into the 
area without a Geiger counter. 

Nagano's death may well grow into 
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