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Here's a new line of needle valve ware 
with stems twice as heavy. 

This new design means greater strength 
and longer life in your ware. 

NEW LARGE 
4.7MM VALVE 

Now available as well as the customary 
2mm. 

PYREX Needle Valve Ware gives you 
these other advantages, too. 

Ground flanges. ALL PYREX flange 
faces are finely ground to assure a better 
seal, particularly under pressure. 

Non-contaminating.You get the chem- 
ical stability of chemical glass No. 7740 
in this new ware. Valve body and re- 
tainer rings are pure TEFLON*. 

Complete Line. This new PYREX line 
includes the valves, ground joint connec- 
tions, burettes, distilling heads, funnels, 
chromatographic tubes and stopcocks. 

Check your PYREX Laboratory Glass- 
ware Catalog, LG-1, for sizes and prices. 
*T.M. for Du Pont Tetrafluoroethylene Resin. 

* CORNING GLASS WORKS 
34-12 Crystal Street, Corning, N. Y. 
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Letters 
Initial Modesty 

Authors "who believe that the use of 
I or we is immodest" were gently chided 
for their false modesty in the lead edi- 
torial, "Passive voice," in Science for 22 
March 1957 [125, 529 (1957)]. But au- 
thors who prefer not to write in the first 
person are much more honest than those, 
like the author of the editorial in ques- 
tion, who write in the first person with- 
out signing their names. 

An editorial, report, or article whose 
author is identified only by initials has 
an anomalous status. Does it represent 
the view or opinion of the editorial 
board, as competently expressed by one 
member? Or does the use of initials im- 
ply a disclaimer by the board as a whole, 
so that only the owner of the initials is 
to be held responsible? 

If cryptic initials are used only for in- 
ternal identification, they should be 
much less obtrusive-perhaps in 6-point 
type, or in the form of a code number or 
of initials run together without periods, 
even in reverse order. As used, full size, in 
Science, initials usually can be matched 
up with one of the names in the mast- 
head, so they offer little anonymity. The 
editorial in question was signed"R.V.O." 
-presumably Robert V. Ormes, a mem- 
ber of the editorial staff. Was Ormes so 
ashamed of his editorial that he did not 
wish his full name attached to it? 

(Perhaps he should be ashamed. For 
an essay on grammatical purity, its own 
purity leaves something to be desired. I 
was particularly set on edge by the sen- 
tence: "In the editorial office we still 
see gerunds and participles used in this 
manner, and it is discouraging." Is the 
manner discouraging?) 

In addition to making an unclaimed 
orphan out of an editorial or note, the 
use of initials, rather than an honest 
name, imposes an unwarranted burden 
on the poor bibliographer. Forever more, 
this editorial must be listed as: "R(ob- 
ert?) V. O(rmes?): Passive Voice," or 
"R.V.O. (Robert V. Ormes?): Passive 
Voice." Bibliographers should not be 
forced to pay thus for an unsure author's 
false modesty. 
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Radiation Hazards 

In the article entitled, "Mice, men, 
and fallout" [Science 128, 637 (1958)], 
M. P. Finkel presents some interesting 
results regarding the effects of low doses 
of Sr90 on mammalian life expectancy 
and incidence of certain tumors. How- 
ever, in discussing these results, the au- 
thor draws far-reaching conclusions re- 
lating to the danger to man (or rather 
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lack of it) from present Sr90 fallout. The 
concluding sentence states, "the present 
contamination with strontium-90 from 
fallout is ... extremely unlikely to induce 
even one bone tumor or one case of leu- 
kemia." I would like to raise the follow- 
ing points with regard to this conclusion. 

1) In the data presented, the uncer- 
tainty was such that a 7-percent shorten- 
ing of life span in an experimental group 
did not represent a statistically signifi- 
cant deviation from the control, nor did 
a threefold increase in the incidence of 
osteogenic sarcomas. Yet the above 
statement refers to effects on the world's 
population which would amount to a 
small fraction of 1 percent. 

2) No statistically justifiable extrap- 
olation for determination of "threshold 
doses," or even demonstration that there 
is a threshold different from zero, seems 
possible from the data as presented. In 
fact, these data appear to indicate that 
the experimental design used is inade- 
quate for this purpose. 

3) At the present time, sober and ac- 
curate evaluations of the effects of 
chronic low-level irradiation of human 
populations, from internal and external 
radioisotopes, are essential for the for- 
mulation of safe and wise national and 
international policies regarding the test- 
ing of nuclear weapons and the develop- 
ment of nuclear power. It is unfortunate 
that at this time a statement such as that 
quoted above is published with the im- 
plication that it is based on experimental 
evidence, when actually it appears to be 
without objective, logical support. Un- 
founded statements minimizing radiation 
hazards can be especially harmful if they 
turn out later to have been false. 

A more appropriate conclusion from 
the data would seem to be that drawn by 
Austin M. Brues from a discussion of 
other data relating to carcinogenesis 
[Science 128, 693 (1958) ]-namely, that 
a linear dose-effect relation is less prob- 
able than a nonlinear relation, and that 
a threshold might occur. 

CARL Moos 
College of Medicine, 
University of Illinois, Chicago 

I should like to comment on the article 
by Miriam P. Finkel. First of all, it is 
difficult to tell whether this article should 
be considered as an editorial or as a 
strictly scientific paper. If the latter is 
the case, I should like to strenuously ob- 
ject to the opening paragraph, which in 
a back-handed kind of way casts dis- 
repute on some of the most eminent sci- 
entists of our time who have been con- 
cerned with the effects of fallout on 
human beings. 

Aside from this, I particularly wish to 
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Aside from this, I particularly wish to 
criticize some of the scientific conclu- 
sions. The type of effect that one is look- 
ing for with respect to the action of 
fallout on man is such that it has been 
predicted that several tens of thousands 
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