
great attention being paid to the prepa- 
ration of specialists in the technical 
fields. These comprise approximately 
one-third of all postgraduate students. 
Second place goes to representatives of 
the physico-mathematical sciences and 
third, to the agricultural sciences." 

Growth of scientific potential. "Dur- 
ing the years of Soviet power the army 
of scientists has grown 24-fold and today 
comprises 240,000 people, more than 
95,000 of whom have masters' or doc- 
tors' degrees. In 1956 alone the number 
of scientific workers increased by more 
than 15 percent. With each passing year 
the number of scientific establishments 
increases, and today there are some 
3,000 of them." 

Geographic distribution of establish- 
ments. "When we say that science in the 
USSR is developing on a broad scale, 
we have in mind not only the ultimate 
results but also the geographic distribu- 
tion of scientific establishments. In Uz- 
bekistan, for example, where before the 
Revolution only two percent of the 
population were literate, today there are 
150,000 specialists with secondary tech- 
nical or higher education. The republic 
has an Academy of Sciences and several 
scientific institutes which employ some 
6,500 scientific workers. Before the Revo- 
lution there was practically no intelli- 
gentsia in the Kazakh Soviet Socialist 
Republic, whereas today there are more 
than 230,000 specialists with secondary 
technical or higher education in the re- 
public, more than 5,000 of whom are 
employed by the republic's Academy of 
Sciences and various scientific and edu- 
cational establishments." 

New Standard of Length 

The Advisory Committee for the Defi- 
nition of the Metre, chaired by L. E. 
Howlett, director of the Division of Ap- 
plied Physics, National Research Council 
of Canada, has unanimously agreed on 
a new standard of length-a wavelength 
of light-to be used instead of the plati- 
num-iridium bar kept at Sevres, France. 
The leading contenders as the source for 
light for the standard have been the fol- 
lowing isotopes: mercury-198, krypton- 
84, krypton-86, and cadmium-114. One 
of the wavelengths of orange light 
emitted by krypton-86 has been selected 
as the standard, and the international 
meter will be defined as 1,650,763.73 
times this wavelength. The resulting 
standard will be more than 100 times 
as precise as the present international 
meter. 

Although in practice the new standard 
is already in use, several steps remain 
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the International Committee of Weights 
and Measures for consideration at its 
meeting in October 1958; when approved 
there, the recommendation will be pre- 
sented to the International Conference 
on Weights and Measures, which will 
meet in 1960; at that time the standard 
will become the legal international 
standard. 

Biological Science in Indonesia 

The Gustavus and Louise Pfeiffer Re- 
search Foundation has recently made a 
grant to the department of biological 
sciences at the University of Indonesia 
in Jakarta. According to Gilbert Church, 
visiting chairman of the department who 
was sent to Indonesia as part of the Uni- 
versity of California School of Medi- 
cine's Indonesia Project in Medical Edu- 
cation, the money will be used to en- 
courage Indonesian students to continue 
their research in the various fields of the 
biological sciences, and for special equip- 
ment and supplies that may be needed 
but are not available in Indonesia. The 
research program in progress at the 
University of Indonesia is of special sig- 
nificance because heretofore almost no 
zoological research has been done in 
Indonesia. 

IGY Meteorological Data 

The World Meteorological Organiza- 
tion has announced the availability of 
microcards of International Geophysical 
Year meteorological data. The data re- 
corded during the 18 months of the IGY 
will be published on approximately 18,- 
500 microcards that will ultimately be 
sold in complete sets, partial sets, or in- 
dividually at a price to be determined 
by the number of complete sets ordered. 
At present the estimated price for a com- 
plete set is $5990. All orders should be 
placed with the World Meteorological 
Organization, IGY Meteorological Data 
Centre, 1 Avenue de la Paix, Geneva, 
Switzerland. 

Shortage of Engineers? 

Fourteen young engineers recently took 
a room at the Statler Hotel in New York 
so that they could be available for em- 
ployment interviews by members of the 
American Society of Mechanical Engi- 
neers. The society was holding its an- 
nual meeting at the Statler and at the 
nearby Sheraton-McAlpin Hotel. 

The men, 30 to 40 years old, were laid 
off a month ago when the turbomotor 
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nual meeting at the Statler and at the 
nearby Sheraton-McAlpin Hotel. 
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had ranged from $9000 to $15,000 an- 
nually. 

S. Barron, a chemical engineer and 
spokesman for the group, reported that 
the group had received six or eight tele- 
phone calls a day. Some callers asked 
for more information, some asked for 
resumes, and some arranged interviews. 
However, no one was hired. When news 
of the employment predicament became 
known, the press commented on the sharp 
change in trend that it seemed to indi- 
cate and suggested that perhaps the cur- 
rent concern over a shortage of scientists 
and engineers was being exaggerated. 

Proton Beam Brought 
Outside Accelerator 

The University of Chicago's Enrico 
Fermi Institute for Nuclear Studies has 
announced that it has increased the re- 
search value of its 450-Mev synchrocy- 
clotron by bringing a proton beam out- 
side the accelerator and into a newly 
constructed underground experimental 
room. The beam, one of the most intense 
in the world and the first to have been 
brought outside an American accelera- 
tor, will permit use of the university's 
machine for physical and biological re- 
search not previously possible. 

A meson beam, lighter and less power- 
ful, was extracted from the atom smasher 
when it was first operated in 1951, but 
until recently studies of proton bombard- 
ment were limited to the 9-foot-square, 
2-foot-thick vacuum chamber inside the 
cyclotron in which the protons are ac- 
celerated. With the new external beam, 
targets can easily be put in position and 
surrounded by the necessary detecting 
and recording equipment. 

AAAS-Campbell Award 

The first AAAS-Campbell award for 
Vegetable Research was given at the 
AAAS Indianapolis meeting to S. H. 
Wittwer and F. G. Teubner, Michigan 
State University horticulturists, for their 
joint work on flower formation and fruit- 
ing in the tomato. The award, which con- 
sists of $1500 and a bronze medal, was 
established in 1957 by the Campbell 
Soup Company. It is given for "an out- 
standing single research contribution, of 
either fundamental or practical signifi- 
cance, relative to the production of vege- 
tables, including mushrooms, for process- 
ing purposes, in the fields of horticulture, 
genetics, soil science, plant physiology, 
entomology, plant pathology, or other 
appropriate scientific areas." 
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