
Scientific Meetings 


Preliminary Announcement of the 

Seventh New York Meeting 
Since its founding more than a cen-

tury ago, the American Association for 
the Advancement of Science has held 
122 national meetings. One of the funda- 
mental purposes for which the associa- 
tion was founded, in September 1848, 
still endures: ". . . by periodical and 
migratory meetings to promote inter-
course between those who are cultivating 
science. . . ." I n  recent years the associa- 
tion has alc;o increasingly recognized its 
rec;ponsibility to inform the general pub- 
lic on scientific developments and itc; 
obligation to assist all organizations con- 
cerned in the encouragement of qualified 
young people to prepare for, and enter, 
careers in science. All of these objectives 
will influence the programs this year. 

For its 123rd meeting-the annual 
meeting of 1956, 26-31 Dec.-the asc;o-
ciation will return to New York, for 
the seventh time, and after an interval 
of 7 years. As in 1949, this large as-
semblage of research scientists, teach-
ers, research directors, university presi- 
dents, engineers, and other science-
minded professional men and women 
will occupy the five hotels closely 
grouped around the Pennsylvania Rail- 
road Station. The Statler and New 
Yorker are among the largest in the na- 
tion; there are available, with the Shera- 
ton-McAlpin, Governor Clinton, and 
Martinique, 6700 rooms for transient 
guests and an exceptional number and 
variety of session rooms, all of them 
committed to the use of the AAAS and 
the participating societies. Since these 
five hotels are such close neighbors-
interconnected by tunnels in three in-
stances-a particularly unified, conven-
ient, and time-saving meeting is assured. 

Center of the group, the Hotel Statler 
will be AAAS Headquarters and site of 
all general events and the large-scale ex- 
hibits. The  mezzanine of the Statler not 
only has a large ballroom (capacity 
1800) and other session rooms, but it 
can also accommodate the AAAS Main 
Registration-Information Center, AAAS 
Office, AAAS Press Room, AAAS Sci- 
ence Theatre, Zoologists' Lounge, and 
the Annual Exposition of Science and 
Industry, sponsored by the association 
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for the 33rd time. These exhibits of the 
latest in the materials and tools that 
scientists use-and of the technical ac- 
complishments of large industries-will 
occupy the Ivy Suite, Foyer, and Geor- 
gian Room just opposite the ballroom. 
With so many session rooms in one hotel 
-most of them on the mezzanine level 
-and all the hotels so near one another, 
the exhibits can be visited repeatedly, 
during any spare moment, and with a 
maximum of convenience. Exhibitors 
have already recognized this fact and, 
at  this time, more than 6 months in ad- 
vance of the meeting, most of the avail- 
able boothsoace has been rented. 

Among the general e-vents scheduled 
for the ballroom and adjacent areas are 
the AAAS Prec;idential Address and Re- 
ception on the evening of 28 Dec. At 
thic; event, Paul B. Sears will preside, 
and George W. Beadle will give hic; re- 
tiring address. The  distinguic;hed eve-
ning lectures of RESA, Sigma Xi, and 
the United Chapterc; of Phi Beta Kappa, 
as well as the AAAS Smoker on the eve- 
ning of 29 Dec., are all scheduled for 
the ballroom or adjacent Keystone 
Room. The two afternoons of 27 and 28 
Dec. have been set aside for the two 
partc; of the AAAS General Symposium, 
"Moving frontiers of science," organized 
by the Committee on AAAS Meetings. 
Becauc;e of the general interest of this 
program, the details of which wi.11 be 
announced later in a c;pecial release, all 
AAAS sections and moc;t of the partici- 
pating societies have not scheduled any 
wssions concurrent with it. This sym-
posium will be in the Statler ballroom. 

The  tenth annual Junior Scientists Ac;- 
sembly, sponsored by the asc;ociation's 
Academy Conference, a full afternoon 
program exclusively for high-school stu- 
dents interested in careers in science, 
will be held in the large auditorium of 
the American Museum of Natural His- 
tory on 27 Dec. Following the pattern of 
the Berkeley meeting's assembly, with 
the theme this year, "What makes a sci- 
entist," there will be an appropriate ad- 
dress, an industrial science show, a panel, 
and a concluding illustrated lecture. 
Program chairman is Zachariah Subar-
sky of the Bronx High School of Science. 

Those concerned with various aspects 
of communications will find much to 

interest them in the six sesc;ions of the 
fifth Conference on Scientific Editorial 
Problems, arranged by a committee 
headed by J. G. Adashko, Ford Instru- 
ment Company, and in the national 
meeting of the American Documentation 
1nc;titute. I t  is probable that these pro- 
grams will be cosponsored by one or 
more of the relatively new societies on 
technical writing. An interec;ting exhibit 
of the latest equipment for the storaqe 
and retrieval of information will be 
jointly sponc;ored by the AD1 and the 
National Bureau of Standards. A note- 
worthy event of this year'c; program in 
chemistry will be the c;ilver anniversary 
of the AAAS-Gordon Research Confer-
ences, culminating in a dinner at which 
Glenn T. Seaborg, 1951 Kobe1 prize 
winner, %ill $peak. 

Ac; the following synopc;is of program3 
indicatec;, there will be interec;ting and 
important programs in all principal 
fields of science. In  addition to the set;-

sionc; for contributed papers that meet 
the needs of specialistc;, there will be a 
rich variety of symposia, and among 
these sympoc;ia there will be a number 
that are interdisciplinary and explore 
relatively neglected scientific area$-a 
type of program especially appropriate 
for an asc;ociation of 264 affiliates and 
well over 50,000 individual members. 

I t  is already apparent that the 123rd 
meeting will be one of the most c;ignifi- 
cant in the long annals of the 108-year- 
old AAAS-and the attendance will be 
commensurate. The  18 sections of the 
association by themselves assure a large 
and diversified meeting but, in addition, 
some 40 societiec; and organizations are 
arranging programs of their own, and 
more than 50 others are participating 
as cosponc;ors. Fortunately, the session 
roomc; of the Penn Zone hotels are suffi- 
cient in number to house nearly all the 
sessions and large enough to minimize 
crowding The Hotel Ne\+ Yorker will be 
headquarters for the Entomological So-
ciety of America; the Sheraton-McAlpin 
will house the science teaching societies; 
and the History of Science Society will 
be based at the Hotel Governor Clinton. 
All hotel headquarter3 assignments will 
be announced in the association's jour- 
nals in July, at  which time the advertic;- 
ing pages will begin to carry housing 
reservation and advance registration 
couponc;. As in recent years, advance 
registrants will receive the book-size Gen- 
eral Program-Directory early in Decern- 
ber by first-class mail. 

A synopsis of programs follows. The  
names given within parenthec;es are pro- 
gram chairmen. 

Mathematics ( A )  

The  Association for Computing Ma-
chinery (J. P. Nash, University of 11-
linoic;) ic; planning c;everal sesslons and 
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the Society for Indristrial and Applied 
Mathematics (Donald L. Thon~sen, In- 
ternational Business Machines) is ar-
ranging a program of invited papers. 
Both organizations are meeting with the 
AAAS for the first time, and dctails arc 
not yet available. I t  is anticipated that 
Section A (Rudolph E. Langer, Univer- 
sity of TVisconsin) will cosponsor one or 
more of these sessions and will schedule 
a vice-presidential address. 

Physics ( B )  

Section B (J.  Ho~vard McMillen, Na- 
tional Science Foundation) is organizing 
symposia on "Optics and oriented nuclei" 
(IYilliam B. Hawkins, Jr., Yale Univer- 
sity), "Optical absorption in solids" 
(William F. Meggers, National Bureau 
of Standards), "Diffusion in solids" ( H .  
B. Huntington, Rensselaer Polytechnic 
Institute), and "Crystal growth (Nicho- 
las Cabrera, University of Virginia); a 
fifth symposium on biophysics is under 
con~ideration. The  Physicists' Dinner 
will be cosponsored by Sigma Pi Sigma, 
and the retiring vice-presidential address 
of Section B will be given by Alan T. 
Waternlan of thc National Science Foun- 
dation. 

The American Meteorological Society 
(Kenneth Spengler, AMS) will cospon- 
sor the Association of American Geog-
raphers' invited papers on climatology 
and other appropriate sessions. 

Chemistry ( C )  

Section C's (Ed.  F. Degering, Quar- 
termaster Research and Development 
Laboratories, Natick, Mass.) full pro-
gram includes sessions for contributed 
papers and symposia (Karl  Folkers, 
Merck, & C o . ) ,  the cosponsorship of 
Section Nd's svmoosium on "Antien-, . 
zymes," and a vice-presidential address 
by Folkers. The symposia are on "Sub-
stances with selective toxicity" (IYerncr 
Braun, Rutgers University), 27 Dec.; 
"Steroids" (Boyd Woodruff, Merck & 
Co.) ,  28 Dec.; and "Organic chem-
istry" (Ellis Brown, Seton Hall Univer- 
sity), 29 Dec. As mentioned earlier, the 
AAAS-Gorclan Research Conferences 
will celebrate their silver anniverc;ary 
with a dinner on 27 Dec., at  which Glenn 
T .  Seaborg will $peak. Alpha Ch i  Sigma 
( H .  G. Seavey, secretary of the S e w  
York Profec;sional Chapter) is planning 
a mcal function for all chemists. 

Astronomy ( D) 

The  American As t~onomical  Society 
(J. Allcn Hynck, Ohio Statc University), 
for the first timc in many years, will 
schedule its national meeting with the 
AAAS. T h e  Hayden Planctarium of the 
American hIuseum of Natural History 
is cooperating. The  Helcn Warner p r i ~ c  
lccture will be given by Harold Johnson 
of the Lo~vcll Observatory. With the 
AAS providing a full program of session3 

for contributed papers and other events, 
Section D's program will be restricted 
to cosponsorship of the AAS program 
and the retiring vice-presidential addrcss 
of Seth B. Nicholson of the Mount Itril- 
son Observatory. 

Geology and Geography (E)  

Section E (Robert L. Nichols, Tufts 
University) will have sessio~ls for con-
tributed papers in geology; a four-ses-
sion symposium, "Geochronometry" (J. 
Laurence Kulp, Columbia University), 
one session of which, on "Carbon dat-
ing," will be cosponsored by Section F; 
"Ground \vatern (A. Nelson Sayre, U.S. 
Geological Survey) ; and "Appalachian 
structure and stratigraphy" (Kurt  E. 
Lowe, City College, New York)-all co-
sponsored by thc Geological Society of 
America. Symposia on "Carbonate 
sedimentation" and "Uranium geology," 
as well as a panel on the International 
Geophysical Year, are being consid-
ered. Section E will cosponsor the 
sessions of the special meeting of the 
Association of American Geographers 
(Peter M. Stern, Conservation Founda- 
t ion),  with the New York Metropolitan 
Division as host, which will include ses-
sions for contributed papers in geography 
and invited papers on climatology. Sec- 
tion E's customary Geologists' Smoker 
will include the retiring vice-presidential 
address of Carl Tolman. The National 
Geographic Society will have its usual 
excellent lecture and accompanying film 
-one of the special evening sessions- 
and the National Speleological Society 
(Brother G. Nicholas, Cumberland, 
Md.)  again will hold a general session 
for contributed papers and a social hour. 

Zoological Sciences ( F )  

The  program of Section F ( H .  H. 
Plough, Amherst College) includes a 
symposium on "Museum techniques" co-
sponsored by the American Museum of 
Natural History (Gordon Reekie, man-
ager of exhibition and construction, 
American Museum of Natural History); 
cosponsorship of the two-session sym-
posium, "Communication in the social 
insects," of the International Union for 
the Study of Social Insects; a sympo-
sium, "Problems of aging" (Howard J. 
Curtis, Brookhaven National Labora-
tory) -topics : "Aging in lower organ-
isms," "Physiological aspects of aging in 
mammals," "Aging in populations," and 
"Radiation-induced aging"; a sympo-
sium, "The biochemistry of the cell 
nuclcus" (A. W. Pollister, Columbia 
University), jointly with the Genetics 
Society of America-topics and spcak- 
crs arc "Introduction," A. Mr. Pol-
lister: "The correlation of nucleic acid 
content with rhromosomc complcmcnt," 
Cccilie Leuchtcnbergcr; "The time of 
synthcsis of dcsoxyribose nucleic acid," 
J. Herbert Taylor; "Changes in the inter- 

phase nucleus with cellular function," 

Max Alfert; and "Chemical studies of 

the giant chromosomes of Diptera," 

George T .  Rudkin. Section F will co-

sponsor "Carbon dating," part I1  of Sec- 

tion E's symposium on "Geochronom-

etry" (J. Laurence Kulp, Columbia 

University); the joint symposium of the 

N e w  York  Zoological Society and the 

N e w  York  Academy of Sciences (Ross 

F. Nigrelli, S e w  York Zoological So-
cicty); the synlposiunl of the American 
Society of Zoologists (Rudolph T. 
Kempton, Vassar College); and a sym-
posium, jointly with Section G,  on "Prob- 
lems of aging in plants and animals." T h e  
Zoologists' Luncheon for all zoologists 
will feature the vice-presidential address 
of Bentley Glass. Contributed papers 
submitted to Section F will be joint with 
the societies just mentioned or immedi- 
ately following. 

The 4 davs of concurrent sessions of 
the annual national meeting of thc En-
tomological Society of America (P .  W .  
Oman, Plant Industry Station, Beltsville, 
Md. ) ,  which last met with the associa- 
tion in 1947, are scheduled for 27-30 
Dcc., inclusive, at  the I-Iotcl S e w  Yorker. 
The  Herpetologists League (James A. 
Fowler, Academy of Natural Sciences of 
Philadelphia) is planning a regional 
meeting of contributed papcrs. The  In-
ternational Vn ion  for the S tudy  of So-
cial Insects, Nor th  American Section 
(T. C. Schneirla, American Museum of 
Xatural History), in addition to the sym- 
posium on "Communication in the social 
insectsn-part I ,  "Perspectives on fact 
and theory for the principal social in- 
sects" and part 11, "Special problems 
concerning techniques, modalities and 
potentialitiesx-~vi11 sponsor a sympo-
sium, "The effects of radiation on in-
sects" (Orlando Park, North~vestern 
University), jointly with the Ecological 
Society of America. The  national annual 
meeting of the Society of Systematic 
Zoology ( R .  E. Blackwelder) ~vill  f o l l o ~ ~  
the pattern of former meetings with the 
association, with sessions for contributed 
papers, one or more panels or symposia 
-one of them jointly with the Ento-
mological Society of America-evening 
lectures, and a business meeting. A fea- 
ture will be the annual SSZ Library and 
Lounge for ail zoologists. 

The  New York Zoological Park 
(Bronx Zoo) will sponsor a daily guided 
tour throughout the mceting period, 27- 
31 Dec., beginning at the administration 
building at 11 A.W. (John Tce-Van, 
dircctor) . 
Biological Sciences (FG) 

T h c  Ecological Society of Ainerica 
(Murray F. Buell, Rutgers Univcrsity) 
will have sessions for contributed papcrs, 
two sessions of invited papers, "Ecology 
in the Northcast and its applications," 
and a group of papers on animal behav- 
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ior and sociobiology (J. P. Scott, Jackson 
Memorial Laboratory) ; the symposium, 
"The cffccts of radiation on insects," of 
the International Union for the Study of 
Social Insccts and thc grassland ccology 
part of Scction 0 ' s  symposium on grass- 
lands will be cosponsored. The  sympo- 
sium of the Genetics Society of America 
has been mentioned under Section F. 

The  Society fot the S tudy  of Evolu-
tion (Harlan Lewis, Univcrsity of Cali-
fornia at Los Angeles), which last met 
v i t h  the AAAS in 1949, in addition to 
sessions for contributed papers and a 
business meeting, will have a symposium, 
"Biotic communities in the past and to- 
day," with Jens C. Clauscn as chairman. 
Titles of papcrs and speakers arc "Genic 
variability in relation to environment," 
J. C. Clausen; "Migration of Ceno7oic 
forest communities in North America," 
Erling Dorf; "Rise of the grass-cating 
mammals," Joseph T. Gregory; and 
"Man changing the environment"; this 
program will be cosponsorcd by the So-
ciety of Vertebrate Zoology and othcr 
societies. 

I t  is cxpected that the American So- 
ciety of Naturalists (Bruce Wallace, 
Cold Spring Harbor, N.Y.) will either 
arrangc a symposium or cosponsor one 
in the F, FG, or G scries. 

The  annual national mceting of the 
National Association of Biology Teach-  
ers (John Breukelman, State Teachers 
College, Emporia, Kan.)  will begin with 
a business meeting, 26 Dcc. I t  \vill in- 
cludc three general programs, a lunch-
eon on 27 Dcc., a joint scssion with the 
other science teaching societies, and a 
session at the American Museum of Nat- 
ural History. A field trip with the Amcri- 
can Nature Study Society on 30 Dec. 
will conclude thc meeting. Thc  Society 
o f  General Physiologists (Abraham 
Shancs, National Institutes of Health) 
plans a symposium and onc or more scs- 
sions for contributed papers. 

Botanical Sciences (G)  

Section G (Barry Commoner, IYash- 
ington University) will havc a t\vo-scs-
sion symposium, "Problems of aging in 
plants and animals" (Paul J. Kramcr, 
Duke University) jointly with Section F; 
and a second symposium, "Some un-
solved problems in biologyx-for exam-
ple, thc chemistry of inheritance, mecha- 
nisms of growth and dcvclopment-
(Barry Commoner) cosponsored by Scc- 
tion F and various societies including thc 
Botanical Society of America and com- 
memorating this society's golden anni-
versary. Section G will cosponsor Section 
8 ' s  grassland symposium. The  vicc-prcsi- 
dential addrcss by Paul J. Kramcr will 
follow the Botanists' Dinner, 27 Dec., a 
special occasion further celebrating the 
50th anniversary of the Botanical So-
ciety of Amcrica. Sessions for contributcd 
papcrs in plant ecology, plant physiol- 

ogy, and gcncral botany will be held 
jointly with the Ecological Society of 
Amcrica and tho Tor t ey  Botanical Club 
(David Keck, New York Botanical Gar- 
den) .  The  Torrcy Botanical Club ~vill  
also arrange a program, probably in the 
field of plant taxonomy. 

Anthropology (H) 

The  full program of Section H (Ga-
briel Laskcr, IVayne Univcrsity College 
of RIcdicine) includes sessions for con-
tributcd papers; a symposium to com-
memorate the 100th anniversary of the 
discovery of the Xeanderthal man (Loren 
C. Eiseley, University of Pennsylvania, 
and IVilliam L. Straus, Jr., Johns Hop- 
kins University), sponsored jointly with 
the American Institute of Human  Pa-
laeontology; a t\vo-session symposium, 
"Man in the tropics" (Vera Rubin, 
Columbia University), with speakers 
from both thc Unitcd Statcs and Carib- 
bean arcas; an Anthropologists' Dinncr 
with one or more addresses by JV. RIon-
tague Cobb and perhaps othcr recent 
vice prcsidents of Scction H.  Section 
Xd's symposium, "Forensic dentistry," 
will be cosponsored. 

Psychology ( I )  

Section I (Conrad G. Muellcr, Co-
lumbia University) has arranged sessions 
for six groups of invited papers, four of 
which are "Experimcntal psychopathol- 
ogy," "Physiological mechanisms of mo-
tivation and rcward," "Scnsorl func-
tions," and "The place of cxpcrimental 
psychology in anthropological ficld 
mork." I t  is anticipated that therc nil1 
be scssions for contributcd papcrs and 
that Scction I mill cosponsor parts of 
Scction N's symposium, "Evolution of 
nervous control from amoeba to man." 
Thc  vice-prcsidcntial address will be 
given by Clarence H.  Graham of Co-
lumbia Univcrsity. 

Social and Economic Sciences (K)  

Scction K's symposium, "The impact 
of the natural scienccs on the social sci- 
ences: an intcrprctation" (Donald P. 
Ray, Georgc IYashington University), 
will be of general intercst. I t  is cospon- 
sored by the Ametican Political Science 
Association and thc American Sociolog- 
ical Society. Section K will cosponsor the 
symposium, "Science and national se-
curity" (Benjamin H .  IVilliams, Indus- 
trial Collcge of the Armcd Forccs), of 
the National Academy of Economics 
and Political Sczence with the collabora- 
tion of Pi G a m m a  M u .  the national 
honorary society in the social scicnccs, 
which, it is anticipated, will have a din- 
ner for the speakers of Scction K. 

History and Philosophy of Science (L) 

Thc  program of Scction L (Jane M. 
Oppcnheimcr, Bryn Mawr College) 
comprises t\vo sessions for contributcd 

paperc, a joint session and dinner ~v i th  
the History of Science Society, a business 
meeting, the vice-prcsidcntial address of 
Henry Guerlac, and a t\vo-session sym- 
posium, "Science and ethics" (Joseph 
Maycr, Miami University, Ohio) ,  prob- 
ably cosponsorcd by the Philosophy of 
Science Association, \vhich plans five ses- 
sions on mcasurcmcnt. Section L will 
cosponsor the special mccting of the 
American Philoso fjhical Association, 
Eastern Division (John Wild, Harvard 
University) commemorating the 100th 
anniversary of thc birth of Sigmund 
Freud. 

The  annual national meeting of the 
History of Science Society (Pearl Kibre, 
Huntcr Collcgc) bcgins with busincss 
mectings on 27 Dcc.; includcs the sym- 
posium, "The intcraction of scicncc and 
technology," joint with Scction L, and a 
lunchcon and rcport on the intcrnational 
conference, 28 Dcc.; and concludcs, 29 
Dcc., \vith t\vo symposia, "Thc impact of 
ancient scicnce on the Middle Ages" and 
"Thc history of mcdicinc: interprcta-
tions and advocates." The  Society for 
the Advancement of General Systems 
Theory  (Lud\vig von Bcrtalanffy, Mt. 
Sinai Hospital, Los Angeles) will have a 
business meeting and a scscion for con-
tributed papcrs, 29 Dec., and a sympo-
sium, 30 Dec. 

Engineering (M) 

Section M (Clarencc E. Davies, 
ASRIE) has set up  a program committce 
to plan and implement a three-session 
symposium (Irving P. Orcns, Nenark 
College of Enginecring) cntitlcd "hIan 
and his physical environmcnt,'' scheduled 
for 26 and 27 Dec. Part I will deal with 
"Thc prcsent intcgration of man and ma- 
chines"; Part 11, "Thc future integration 
and neccssity for ncw machines"; and 
part 111, "hIachincs and progress in the 
mechanical translation of languages." 
The  Engineeting iMarlpore et Commzsszon 
will cosponsor the sessions of thc Con- 
ference on Scicntific Manpower. 

Medical Sciences (N) 
As in previous ycars, Section N will 

have a four-session symposium, the par- 
ticipants of which come from all parts 
of the continent. This symposium is 
scheduled for 29 and 30 Dec. This 
year's subject "Evolution of nervous con- 
trol from amoeba to man'' (Bernard B. 
Brodic, Sational Institutes of Heal th) ,  
will range from thc rudiments of in-
traccllular phenomena in protozoans 
through intercellular communication 
and ncurohumors in both invertebrates 
and vcrtcbrates to thc basic actions of 
drugs on animal and human behavior; 
included will be the vice-presidential ad- 
dress of Irvine H.  Page, and thc an-
nouncements of the 12th Theobald Smith 
award, given by Eli Lilly and Company, 
and the second AAAS-Anne Frankrl 



Rosenthal Memorial Award in Cancer 
Research. Part of this symposium may 
be cosponsored by the Society of General 
Physiologists and Section I. Section N 
will cosponsor a variety of appropriate 
programs. 

Alpha Epsilon Delta (Maurice L. 
Moore, national secretary) will have its 
customary annual luncheon and a speaker 
of prominence. Details of the special 
programs of the American Association of 
Hospital Consultants (E. Dwight Bar-
nett, Columbia University), the Ameri­
can Psychiatric Association (Benjamin 
Pasamanick, Ohio State University 
Health Center) , and the American 
Physiological Society (Fred A. Hitch­
cock, Ohio State University) are not yet 
available. 

Dentistry (Nd) 

On 28 D e c , Section Nd (George C. 
PafTenbarger, American Dental Associa­
tion Research Fellowship, National Bu­
reau of Standards) will have sessions for 
contributed and invited papers, "Contri­
butions of science to everyday practice." 
O n 29 D e c , there will be a symposium, 
"Forensic dentistry" (W. M. Krogman, 
University of Pennsylvania), cospon­
sored by Sections H and N; a luncheon; 
a second symposium, "Antienzymes," co-
sponsored by Sections C, N, and N p ; 
and a business meeting. The entire pro­
gram of the section will be cosponsored 
by the American College of Dentists, the 
American Dental Association, and the 
International Association for Dental 
Research, North American Division. 

Pharmacy (Np) 

The full program of Section Np (John 
E. Christian, School of Pharmacy, Pur­
due University) begins 26 Dec. with an 
evening session for contributed papers 
and continues 27 Dec. with the vice-pres­
idential address of Rudolph H. Blythe, 
contributed papers, arid a symposium, 
"The significance of cosmetics in medi­
cal practice," cosponsored by the Com­
mittee on Cosmetics of the American 
Medical Association. O n 28 D e c there 
will be a symposium, "Tablet manufac­
ture," and papers, and, on 29 D e c , the 
Hospital Pharmacy program and Sec­
tion Nd's "Antienzymes." Section Np's 
entire program will be cosponsored by 
the American Association of Colleges 
of Pharmacy, the American College of 
Apothecaries, the American Pharmaceu­
tical Association, Scientific Section, and 
the American Society of Hospital Phar­
macists. 

Agriculture (O) 

Section O (H. B. Sprague, Pennsyl­
vania State University) will have a four-
session symposium, "Grasslands in our 
national life," 29 and 30 Dec. Part I 
deals with "Forage utilization and re-
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lated animal nutrition problems"; part 
I I , "Forage production in humid re­
gions"; part I I I , "Applications of plant 
sciences to grasslands"; and part IV, 
"Grassland machinery, equipment, and 
irrigation systems." Among the many 
organizations expected to cosponsor ap­
propriate portions of this symposium are 
Section G, American Dairy Science As­
sociation, American Institute of Nu­
trition, American Phytopathological So­
ciety, American Society of Agricultural 
Engineers, American Society of Agron­
omy, American Society of Animal Pro­
duction, American Society of Biological 
Chemists, American Society of Plant 
Physiologists, American Veterinary Med­
ical Association, Botanical Society of 
America, Ecological Society of America, 
Entomological Society of America, 
Farm Equipment Institute of America, 
Genetics Society of America, Soil Con­
servation Society of America, and Soil 
Science Society of America. 

Industrial Science (P) 

Section P (Allen T . Bonnell, Drexel 
Institute of Technology) will hold a 
two-session symposium and a luncheon 
session at which Earle L. Rauber of the 
Atlanta Federal Reserve Bank will give 
the vice-presidential address. 

Education (Q) 

The program of Section Q (Herbert 
A. Smith, University of Kansas) includes 
two sessions joint with the International 
Council for Exceptional Children, 26 
D e c ; two sessions joint with the Ameri­
can Educational Research Association, 
29 D e c ; some four sessions for contrib­
uted papers, 29-31 D e c ; a business 
meeting, 30 D e c ; and the vice-presiden­
tial address of Dean A. Worcester. This 
section will cosponsor appropriate ses­
sions of the programs of the science 
teaching societies—all of which (J. Dar-
rell Barnard, New York University, 
Washington Square) are cosponsoring 
the AAAS General Symposium, "Mov­
ing frontiers of science," holding a joint 
mixer the evening of 26 D e c and a joint 
session the evening of 27 Dec. 

Additional sessions of the regional 
meeting of the National Science Teach­
ers Association (Alfred D. Beck, New 
York Board of Education) are tours, 26 
D e c ; a Business-Industry Luncheon, 27 
D e c ; and concurrent sessions, 28 and 29 
Dec. The National Association for Re­
search in Science Teaching (Nathan 
Washton, Queens College) will meet on 
27 Dec. and will also participate in the 
joint session of the science teaching so­
cieties that evening. The AAAS Cooper­
ative Committee on the Teaching of 
Science and Mathematics (Morris Meis-
ter, Bronx High School of Science) will 
probably hold a panel discussion on the 
proposed extension of the Smith-Hughes 

Act, which would provide federal sub­
sidies for science and mathematics 
teachers; and it will cosponsor the Junior 
Scientists Assembly of the Academy 
Conference. 

Science in General (X) 

The Annual Academy Conference 
(Leland H. Taylor, West Virginia Uni­
versity), composed of delegates and 
other members of the 41 academies af­
filiated with the association, will hold a 
day of sessions, 29 D e c , and will sponsor 
the tenth annual Junior Scientists 
Assembly. 

Details of the annual national meet­
ing of the American Documentation In­
stitute (James W. Perry, Western Re­
serve University), which is meeting with 
the AAAS for the first time, are not yet 
available; one feature, however, will be 
an exhibit of the latest equipment for 
the storage and retrieval of data, jointly 
sponsored by the ADI and the National 
Bureau of Standards. The American 
Geophysical Union (Waldo E. Smith, 
A G U ) probably will cosponsor the ses­
sion on climatology of the Association of 
American Geographers and other appro­
priate programs within the wide range 
of the interests of its membership. 

The annual national meeting of the 
American Nature Study Society (Rich­
ard L. Weaver, University of Michigan) 
includes an opening session on the after­
noon of 26 Dec. and the joint mixer that 
evening; the-joint session of the science 
teaching societies, 27 D e c ; a session, 28 
D e c ; and, with NABT a joint session, 
29 D e c , and a joint field trip, 30 D e c 
T h e ANSS banquet and showing of 
kodachromes is scheduled for the eve­
ning of 29 D e c 

The fifth Conference on Scientific Edi­
torial Problems (J. G. Adashko, Ford In­
strument Company) will hold six fnon-
concurrent) sessions on various aspects 
of scientific and technical writing, edit­
ing, and publishing; it is expected that 
one of these sessions will be concerned 
with foreign translation problems. T h e 
program will be coordinated with the 
sessions of the American Documentation 
Institute so that potential conflicts are 
eliminated or minimized. 

The recurrent Conference on Scien­
tific Manpower (Thomas J. Mills, Na­
tional Science Foundation) is scheduled 
for 4 P.M. , 26 Dec. As in previous years, 
it will be cosponsored by the Engineering 
Manpower Commission, the Scientific 
Manpower Commission, the National 
Academy of Sciences-National Research 
Council, and the National Science Foun­
dation. 

The national meeting of Sigma Delta 
Epsilon, graduate women's science fra­
ternity (Clyde Chandler, Boyce Thomp­
son Insti tute) , begins with a business 
meeting, 26 Dec. and includes the annual 
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dinner and grand chapter meeting on 27 
Dec., a luncheon for all women in sci- 

TRADE-MARK 
- 7 I ence on 29 Dec., ancl probably a tea on 

30 Dec. A headquarters room will be
LABORATORY REAGENTS maintained throughout the meeting 

period. 

CUBFERRON The  National Association of Science 
Writers (Roland H .  Berg, Look Maga-(A.C.S. Reagent, for Uranium Assay) 
zine) will have its annual symposium 

POTASSlUM and a business meeting with the AAAS. 

METAPERIODATE The annual address and award of the 

(A.C.S. Reagent) 	 William Proctcr prize of the Scientific 
Research Society of America is sched- 

SODIUM uled for the evening of 26 Dcc., prcccd- 
METAPERIODATE ing the society's joint luncheon with the 

(A.C.S. Reagent, also meets AOCS Society of the Sigma Xi and the annual 
specs. for glycerol determination) convention of RESA on 27 Dec. The  

P annual address of the Society of the
THIOACETAMIDE Sigma X i  ~vill be held the evening of 27 
(Reagent Grade, for sulfide Dec., following the 57th annual conven-precipitations)- tion of the society on that day. T h e  17th 

"VitaStain" annual lecture of the United Chapters 

(Triphenyltetrazolium CI.-Red) of Phi Beta Kappa is scheduled for the 
evening of 27 Dec. 

"ZEREWITINOFF" Societies and organizations participat- 
REAGENT ing in the AAAS meeting arc as follows. 

(MeMgI  in purified butyl ether) National annual meetings: Academy 
Conference; American Astro~lomical So- 
ciety; American Documc~ltatio~lInsti-

Data -Prices -Samples - tute; 	 American Nature Study Society; 
Dept. ''0" 

Conference on Scientific Editorial Prob- 
lems; Conference on Scientific Man-
power; Entomological Society of Amer- 
ica; History of Science Society; National 
Association of Biology Teachers; Scien- 
tific Research Society of America; 
Sigma Delta Epsilon; Society for the 
Advancement of General Systems The- 
ory; Society of the Sigma Xi; Society ADVANCES I N  EXPERIMENTAL 	 for the Study of Evolution; Society of 
Systematic Zoology. 

Spccial or regional meetings, with
AAAS SYMPOSIUM VOLUME programs : AAAS Cooperative Commit- 

June 1955 tee on the Teaching of Science and 
lfathcmatics; AAAS-Gordon Research

246 pp., 6" x 9", 49 illus., index, clothbound Conferences; Alpha Chi Sigma; Alpha 

Price $6.75; cash order price for Epsilon Delta; American Association of 

AAAS members $5.75 Hospital Consultants; American Philo-
sophical Association, Eastern Divisio11; 

". . . This is a real contribution American Psychiatric Association; Amer- 
to dental science. It is the most ican Society of Zoologists; Association of 
comprehensive review of animal ex- American Geographers; Association for 
perimentation on caries ever at- Computing Machinery; Ecological So-
tempted. The format and reproduc- ciety of America; Genetics Society of 
tion of illustrations are excellent. America; Herpetologists League; Inter-

"This compilation of research find- national Union for the Study of Social 

ings should have wide circulation Insects, North American Section; Na-
tional Acaderny of Economics and Politi- 

and should be a storehouse of infor- cal Science; National Association for Re- 
mation for all those who are inves- search in Science Teaching; National
tigating the problem of dental Association of Science Writers; National caries. It should serve to clarify the 	 Geographic Society; National Science
thinking and prevent useless dupli- Teachers Association; National Spele-
cation in future studies. . . ." ological Society; New York Academy of 

Russell W, Bunting, School of Sciences; New York Zoological Park; 
Dentistry, University of Michigan. New York Zoological Society; Pi Gamma 

Mu; Society of General Physiologists; 
AAAS, 15 15 Mass. Ave., NW, Society for Industrial and Applied Math- 

ematics; Torrey Botanical Club; United Washington 5, D.C. 
Chapters of Phi Beta Kappa. 

, Cosponsors: American Association of 

Colleges of Pharmacy; American College 
of Apothecaries; American College of 
Dentists; American Dairy Science Asso- 
ciation; American Dental Association; 
American Educational Research Asso-
ciation; American Geophl-sical Union; 
American Institute of Human Palaeon- 
tology; American Institute of hTutrition; 
American Medical Association, Commit- 
tee on Cosmetics; American Meteorolog- 
ical Society; Amrrican Museum of Nat- 
ural History; American Pharmaceutical 
Association, Scientific Section; Ameri-
can Physiological Society; American 
Phytopathological Socirtl-; American 
Political Science Association; Amel-ican 
Society of Agricultural Engineers; 
Amrrican Socirty of Agronomy; Ameri- 
can Society of Animal Productio11: 
American Socictl- of Biological Chrm-
ists; American Society of Hospital Phar- 
macists; Arnerican Society of Natu-
ralists; American Society of Plant 
Physiologists; American Sociological So- 
ciety; American Vctrrinary Medical 
Association; Botanical Socicty of Amcr- 
ica; Engineering Manpower Commis-
sion; Farm Equipment Institutr; Geo-
logical Society of America; International 
Association for Dental Rrsearch, North 
American Division; International Coun-
cil for Exceptional Children; National 
Academy of Sciences-Natio~lal Research 
Council; National Bureau of Standards; 
National Science Foundation; Philos-
ophy of Science Association; Scientific 
Manpower Commission; Sigma Pi 
Sigma; Society of l'ertebratc Zoology; 
Soil Conservation Socicty of America; 
Soil Science Society of America. 

R A Y L ~ O N D  TAYT.ORL. 
Associate Adntinistratiic 
Secretary, A A A S  

Meetings Notes 

.A conference on the ?rIanagemc~lt of 
Industrial Research will be held 11-15 
June under the auspices of Columbia 
University at its 100-acre Harriman 
Campus in Harriman, N.Y. Director of 
the conference will be Robert T .  Living- 
ston, ~rofessor of industrial and manage- 
ment engineering at Columbia and a 
former director of research at the Lo~lg 
Island Lighting Company. 

The conference will study methods for 
the design of research programs from 
the viewpoint of integrating them with 
other aspects of company operations. 
Two special panel discussions have been 
planned: "Human relations in research," 
moderated by Lyman Bryson, professor 
emeritus of education at Columbia uni- 
versity Teachers College; ancl "Opera- 
tions research does a job on industrial 
research," moderated by David B. Hertz, 
director of operations research for Popu- 
lar Merchandise, Inc. 

In considering the design of research 
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programs, participants and speakers will 
discuss methods of research, problem 
formulation and analysis, the translation 
of results into operation, and the coordi- 
nation of research efforts to aid manage- 
ment in making effective decisions. In 
addition to formal presentations, clinic 
sessions will be held at which partici- 
pants will pose and solve their own prob- 
lems under the direction of trained group 
leaders. 

Principal speakers will include C. C. 
Furnas, Assistant Secretary of Defense 
for Research and Development; Rear 
Admiral Rawson Bennett, chief of Naval 
Research; T. F. Davies Haines, presi- 
dent of Ciba Pharmaceutical Products, 
Inc.; Irving Wolff, vice president in 
charge of research, R.C.A. Laboratories; 
and J. J. Healy, assistant to the vice 
president for research, development, and 
engineering, Monsanto Chemical Com- 
pany. The conference proceedings will 
be published by King's Crown Press, 
Columbia University. 

.More than 1000 chemical engineers 
gathered recently in New Orleans to at- 
tend the national meeting of the Ameri- 
can Institute of Chemical Engineers. The 
program included five symposia and 28 
technical papers. Great interest centered 
around a panel discussion on "Effective 
financial aid to the colleges from indus- 
try," which was led by Kenneth 0. 
Beatty, Jr., of North Carolina State Col- 
lege. 

C. W. Humphreys, manager of Shell 
Chemical Corporation, New York, pre- 
sided over a symposium on "Foreign 
chemical developments and their effect 
on the U.S. chemical industry," and 
Walter G. Whitman, president of the in- 
stitute, and secretary-general of last surn- 
mer's International Conference on the 
Peaceful Uses of Atomic Energy, par- 
ticipated in a specially televised pro- 
gram that stressed the shortage of sci- 
entific and engineering graduates and 
dramatized the advantages of choosing a 
scientific career. . Fisk University is sponsoring its seventh 
annual Infrared Spectroscopy Institute 
27-31 Aug. The Fisk institutes serve to 
introduce chemists, biologists, physicists, 
and engineers to infrared spectroscopy 
and its use in industry, in research, and 
in teaching. Participants will have op- 
portunities during the week to discuss 
problems of their own particular interest 
with the institute faculty. Further infor- 
mation and application forms may be 
obtained by writing to Nelson Fuson, 
Infrared Spectroscopy Institute, Fisk 
University, Nashville, Tenn. 

The second congress of the World Con- 
federation for Physical Therapy will open 
in New York on 18 June. Jonas E. Salk 
will take part in a panel discussion on 
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physical therapists', role in evaluation 
studies following fiefd trials of the polio-
myelitis vaccine. Ofher participants will 
be Thomas Francis, Jr., University of 
Michigan, who directed the evaluation of 
field tests; Lucy Blair, American Physi-
cal Therapy Association; and Miriam 
Jacobs, Watson School of Psychiatrics, 
Leetsdale, Pa. More than 2000 physical 
therapists and health specialists from 
the United States and some 20 other 
countries are expected to attend the 
5-day congress. 

Forthcoming Events 
June 

25-27. Symposium on Uses of High 
Temperatures in Science and Industry, 
Berkeley, Calif. (N.K. Hiester, Stanford 
Research Inst., Menlo Park, Cud.) 

25-29. American Soc. for Engineering 
Education, annual, Ames, Iowa. (W. 

Leighton Collins, Univ. of Illinois, Ur-
bana. ) 

25-29. Afnericin Inst. of Electrical En-
gineers, Summer and Pacific General, San 
Francisco, Calif. (N. S. Hibshman, AIEE, 
33 W. 39 St., New York 18.) 

25-29, Alpha Chi Sigma Fratunity, 
biennial convention, Univenity Park, Pa. 
(J. R. Kuebler, 5503 E. Washington St., 
Indianapolis 19, Ind. ) 

25-29. International Cong. on Physio-
Pathology of Animal Reproduction and 
of Artificial Insemination, 3d, Cambridge, 
England. (J. Edwards, Production Div., 
Milk Marketing Board, Thames Ditton, 
Surrey, England.) 

25-29. Ship Behavior at Sea, seminar, 
Hoboken, N.J. (Experimental Towing 
Tank Laboratory, Stevens Inst. of Tech-
nology, 711 Hudson St., Hoboken.) 

25-30. International Assoc. for Bridge 
and Structural Engineering, 5th cong., 
Lisbon, Portugal. (M. L. Gretner, Swiss 
Federal Inst. 'of Technology, Zurich, 
Switzerland.) 
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26-28. Entomological Soc. of America, 
Pacific Branch, Berkeley, Calif. (L. M. 
Smith, Dept. of Entomology, Univ. of 
California, Davis.) 

26-29. American Home Economicr As-
roc., annual, Washington, D.C. (MiuM. 
Horton, AHEA, 1600 20 St., NW,Waah-
ington 9.) 

28-1. International Scientific Conf. of 
Rheumatism, Aix-les-Bairn, France. (M. 
Graber-Duvernay, 6, rue de Liege, Aix-
les-Bains. ) 

11-15. Conf. on Industrial Research, 
7th annual, Harriman, N.Y. (R. T. Liv-
ingston, 409 Engineering, Columbia Univ., 
New York 27.) 

28-1. Symposium on Comparative Biol-
ogy of Aquatic Species, Roscoff, Brittany, 
France. (G. Montalenti, Instituto di Ge-
netica, Naples, Italy.) 

July 
1-7. International Conf. on Nuclear 

Reactions, Amsterdam, Netherlands. (S. 
A. Wouthuysen, Zeeman Laboratorium, 
P1. Muidergracht 4, Amsterdam (C) .) 

1-7. National Education Asaoc., Port-
land, Oreg. (W. G. Carr, NEA, 1201 16 
St., NW, Washington, D.C.) 

2. Astronomical League, Miami, Fla. 
(W. A. Cherup, 4 Klopfer St., Millvale, 
Pittsburgh 9, Pa.) 

2. Gamma Sigma Delta Biennial Con-
clave, Ames, Iowa. (J. A. Johnson, Dept. 
of Flour and Feed Milling Induatry, Kan-
sas State College, Manhattan.) 

2-3. National Science Teachers Assoc., 
Corvallis, Oreg. (R. H. Carleton, NSTA, 
1201 16 St., NW, Washington 6.) 

2-7. Brazilian Soc. for the Progress of 
Science, 8th annual, Ouro Preto, Minas 
Gerais. (Sociedade Brasileira para o Pro-
gresso da Ciencia, Caixa Postal 2926, SHo 
Paulo, Brazil.) 

6-14. International Union of Forestry 
Research Organizations, 12th cong., Ox-
ford, England. (Secretariat of Union, 
Vide delle Terme di Caracalla, Rome, 
Italy.) 

9-11. Symposium on Chemical Addi-
tives in Foods, 2nd of 5 symposiums, 
Amsterdam, Netherlands. (H. F. DuPont, 
International Bureau of Analytical 
Chemistry, 18 Ave. de Villars, Paris 7, 
France.) 

11-14. American Malacological Union, 
annual, San Diego, Calif. (Mrs. M. C. 
Teskey, P.O. Box 238, Marinette, Wis.) 

12-1 4. International Astrophysical Sym-
posium on Molecules in Cosmic Sources, 
7th, Liege, Belgium. (H. C. Urey, Inst. 
for Nuclear Studies, Univ. of Chicago, 
Chicago 37, Ill.) 

16-17. Symposium on Synthetic Poly-
mer Chemistry, N~treDame,Ind. (G. F. 
D'Alelio, Dept. of Chemistry, Univ. of 
Notre Dame, Notre Dame.) 

16-21. French Assoc. for the Advance-
ment of Science, Dijon, France. (Mlle. 
Henri-Martin, Secretary, 28, rue Serpente, 
Paris 6~) 

17-26. International Soc. of Photogram-
metry, 8th cong., Stockholm, Sweden. (P. 
0.Fagerholm, Bragevlgen 8, Stockholm.) 

18-20. Soc. for the Study of Develop-
ment and Growth, annual, Providence, 
R.I. (M. V. Edds, Jr., Brown Univ., 
Providence 12.) 

(See issue of 18 May for comprehensive list) 

SCIENCE, VOL. 123 


