
nlc~iii l l  integrating medical schools with 
m i \  erjities on the theory that segregated 
liledical schools organized primarily to 
produce practitioners may not produce 
the best medical training" (p.  275). 

'I'he second volume turns from the 
general to the specific. Nine major baf- 
fling subjects are reviewed in detail and 
~vi tha surprising virtuosity : background, 
present state, and anticipations. Investi- 
gators are in general curious about the 
statt~b in fields other than their own, but 
oftcu fil~d reviews in other fields lvritten 
by investigators for investigators some-
what incomprehcnsible. The discussions 
in this volume will be helpful and orient- 
ing to them and also to many others who 
arc interested in health problems, in 
foundaiion work, and in the work of gov- 
crnment agencies. 

The nine problems are covered in sec- 
tions of perhaps 50 pages each, which are 
ill the main comwosed as annotated com- 
pilations of the literature rather than as 
hiqhly original interpretations. 

The first section, cancer, slights 
licither fundamental problems in growth, 
nor, at the other extreme, chemotherapy, 
and it places the emphasis of the latter 
properly at  preponderantly a preclinical 
level of development. The next section, 
on infertility, hardly discusses the prob- 
leln of fertility, surely a basic problem in 
t l ~ e  world today. The problem of how to 
adjust populations to resources by better 
nwans than war, plague, and even im-
proved production and distribution 
presses for an answer. Arteriosclerosis, 
hypcrtrnsion, and the rheumatic syn-
dromes. thc next three sections. skirt the 
problem of aging, another fundamental. 

The two sections on tuberculosis and 
virus diseases exemplify the present state 
of infectious diseases : tuberculosis, the 
bacterial representative, still a problem 
but well on the way to solution; and thc 
glnaller virus diseases, which are as yet 
beyond chemotherapy. No one knoct-s the 
fundamental difficulty in treating virus 
infections. I t  is probably not simply the 
intracellular position of the invader; 
more likely it lies in the fact that the 
virus particle possesses life only when it 
can borrow the enzyme systems of the 
host cell, and thus is inseparable from 
the cell. Perhaps one must sacrifice the 
cell if one is to kill the virus during its 
intracellular period. 

The last two sections, alcol~olism and 
schizophrenia, are intensely interesting. 
Next to the problem of fertility and 
population, mental troubles head the list 
of human disabilities. We are all con-
scious of the present hints of biochemi- 
cal as lvell as the more traditional psy- 
chopatholo~ical mechanisms in the mind, 
and these are well touched upon: 

"The present intensified interest in the 
effects of drugs in schizophrenia or other 
forms of mental illness is due, in part, to 
immediate therapeutic hope, and, in 

27 APRIL 1956 

greater part, to the promise which solne 
of these drugs seem to offer of sheddii~g 
light on the biochemical mechanisms ill- 
volved in mental disorder" (p.  650). 

After a reviewer states what is in a 
book, he should say how good it is, what 
its uses may be, and what are its faults. 
The subjects are excellently presented, 
truly a major accomplishment. The 
book's usefulness is obvious, both as a 
source of thoughtful pleasure ant1 of 
fact. The faults I do not find seiiou5 
enough to mention. 

WINDSORCUTTING 
School of Medicine, Stanford Univer~i t ! '  

Shock and Circulatory Homeostasis. 
Transactions of the fourth conferencc 
6-8 Dec. 1954, Princeton, N.J. Harold 
D. Green, Ed. Josiah Macy, Jr., Foun- 
dation, New York, 1955. 291 pp. Illus. 
$5. 

The chapters included in this report 
are "Action of epinephrine in man," by 
Heriry Barcroft; "The circulation in the 
periphery," by Hugh Montgomery; 
"Mesenteric lymphatic dynamics in the 
rat," by Silvio Baez; "The circulation in 
the splanchnic area," by J. D. Myers; 
"The pulmonary circulation," by Andri. 
Cournand; "The pulmonary circulation 
in hemorrhagic shock," by J. E. Merri-
man; and "The aortic and coronary 
blood Ao\\ ," by Donald E. Grclgg. 

Social Sciences 

Research Frontiers in Politics and Gov- 
ernment. Brookings lectures, 1955. 
Stephen K. Bailey, Herbert A. Simon, 
Robert A. Dahl, Richard C. Snyder, 
Alfred de Grazia, Malcolm Moos, 
Paul T. David, and Donald B. Tru-
man. Brookings Institution, Washing- 
ton, I955 vii t 240 pp. $2.75. 

This small volume surveys the new re- 
search techniques and theoretical devel- 
opments important to the extension of 
knowledge of politics and government. 
The specialist will find this a convenient 
summary, and the layman will gct an 
insight into the vast regearch area bear- 
ing directly and indirectly on politics, 
government, and political behavior. Thc 
professional will find some gaps, the lay- 
man some confusion, and both enough 
interest to warrant the reading of the 
1955 Brookings series. 

Like most frontiers, those surveycd in 
Research Frontiers are often not well-
marked. As a result, the sound of bordcr 
warfare comes from its pages. While all 
eight contributors are political scientists, 
much of the research into political be- 
havior bears little resemblance to the 
traditions of the field. Indeed, I felt 
some concern lest my colleagues in po- 

litical science find t11r:rn:;clves oc:cupa- 
tionally displaced by the psychologists, 
social anthropologists, atld sociologists. 
But the final contributor, David R. Tru-
man, effectively restored the balance. 

Stephen K. Bailey of Princeton opens 
the series by surveying familiar ground- 
the relationships between academicians 
and operators and the approaches to re- 
search in politics and government. In his 
contribution, "Recent advances in organ- 
ization theory," Herbert A. Simon of the 
Carncgie Institute distinguishes between 
programed and nonprogran~ed decision- 
making. The object is tc~ devise organi- 
z;itional structures to get the right de-
cisions. Experiments alortg this line are 
surveyed, all of which might suggest to 
the layman both the danger of over-or-
ganizatiorl and the advantage of ineffi-
ciency that might make it tolerable, 

Decision-making, the meaning, and the 
distribution of power are considered on 
a far grander scale by Robert A. Dahl 
of Yale in his "Hierarchy, democracy, 
ant1 bargaining in politics and econom-
ics." These control systems, together with 
the price system, are viebved as comple- 
mentary and not ;is exclusive powcr ar-
rangements or s o ~ i a l  techniques. Reality 
is mixed; all techniques 01 control are 
u5ed. This is true enough, but stressing 
thia obvious point too much has its d m -  
gers. 'The pure models excluded comple- 
mentarity, but stressing the mixture 
tends to obscure the vast differences in 
control systems. 

Ncw frontiers are surveyed by Richard 
C. Snyder of Northwestern Uiliversity in 
his "Game theory and the analysis of 
political behavior." The practical poli- 
tician and the professional bureaucrat 
"play the game" instinctively. Game the- 
ory promises to sharpen instinct and even 
to corrcct it. Now even the scholar might 
play the great game of politics vicari- 
ously. Snyder is modest in his claims. 
Game theory has yet to prove its utility. 
He suggests some interesting applications 
in international politics where the theory 
might throw some light on situations that 
are shrouded by security regulations. 
Moreover, in conflict situations with 
varying stratcgies available to both sides, 
with a range of possible outcomes de-
pending on the pairing of strategies, and 
a range of pay-off values, policy makers 
might become more explicit and less 
vulnerable to surprisc by the application 
of game theory. 

Alfred de Grazia of Stanford, in "Re- 
search on voters and elections." survevs 
the techniques of probing voter behavior. 
This interesting contribution closes with 
the disquieting observation that "Tradi- 
tional democracy is being slowly cru~hed 
in the gigantic pincers of depolitization 
and totalitarianism." But this feeling is 
partly offset by Malcolm Moos of Johns 
Hopkins who, in "New light on the 
nominating process," gives a reagoned 



dciense of the convention system as an 
expression of democratic forces. Paul T. 
David of Brookings surveys recent re-
search at the state level in his "Com-
pra t ive  state politics and the problem 
of party realignment." David B. Trunian 
of Columbia presents an interesting con- 
cluding paper, "The impact on political 
science of the revolution in the behav- 
ioral sciences," that rescues political sci- 
ence from the psychologists, social an-
thropologists, and sociologists. 

This small volume covers much 
ground. A short review can do scarcely 
more than point to the chapter headings. 
The papers give much emphasis to voter 
behavior and administrative practices. 
But little attention seems to be given to 
the political forces behind the voter and 
the bureaucrat. Nor is attention given 
to the absorbing problem of the bureau- 
crat and the political administration. 
Who really runs the show? The relation- 
ships between the Congress and the bu- 
reaucracy afford another avenue of fruit- 
ful research that is not mentioned here. 
Some things must be dropped in any 
short serips of lectures, and this one did 
not drop as rrlany as might be expected. 

ARTHURE. BURNS 
Depaltment of Economics, 
George TVashington University 

A 	Solomon Island Society. Kinship and 
leadership among the Siuai of Bou-
gainville. Douglas L. Oliver. EIarvard 
University Press, Cambridge, Mass., 
1955. xxii c 535 pp. Illus. -tplates. $10. 

'The Siuai are Melanesian peopl(1 ~ v h o  
live in southwestern Bougainville in the 
Solomons. They constitute a discrete and 
self-conscious social agyegate sharing 
common linguistic and general cultural 
features, but they lack any formal organi- 
zation; that is, there is no Siuai political 
group. In 1938-39 there were 4658 Siuai, 
and for 18 months during that period 
Dol~glas Oliver and Eleanor Schirmer 
Oliver lived among them and collected 
the data, some of which were presented 
as "Studies in the culture of Bougain-
ville" [Papers of tlze Peabody Museum 
of Arclzeology and Etlznology 29 (1949)], 
but most of which have bccn cast illto 
the present volume, a supcrb ethnogra- 

phy. 
Olivcr's objectives in writing A Solo-

m o n  Island Society were threefold: to 
summarize the whole culture of Siuai; to 
fill a pedagogic need for reliable ethno- 
graphic descriptions of whole cultures; 
and to prescnt much-needed sul-~stantive 
material on the subject of political in~ l i -  
tutions in statclcss society. 1 am not rx- 
pert in Oceanian culturc, but I bel~rve 
that Oliver h8s brilliantly achieved his 
goals. Furthcrmor~, the modesty and 

honesty of Oliver's presentation and ,the 
demonstration in other publications of 
the author's expertness in things Oceanic 
lead to the conclusion that the previous 
judgment will be confirmed by specialist 
colleagues. 

The present study of Siuai describei 
the society that existed in southwestern 
Bougainville a t  the time of investigation. 
The author, lacking firsthand observa- 
tion of this culture since the war ("JVhat 
if anything remains of the Siuai culture 
. . . I do not know") wisely refrains from 
comment on the more recent period. He 
does, however, set Siuai into the frame- 
work of expanding European influence 
in Melanesia. I t  is, he tells us, in the sec- 
ond stage of Westernization. The first 
stage, which lasted until 1915, saw 
ephemeral contacts with white traders; 
the second, much more significant, was 
dominated by the imposition and main- 
tenance of peace by the Australian gov- 
ernment ( a  cosmic irony in view of the 
events of 1942-43 in the Solomons). 
This pax Australianus is regarded by 
Oliver as one of the most potent forcrs 
that subverted the older Siuai polity and 
led to the emergence of the system he 
portrays. 

Siuai subsistence is based on taro, 
which furnishes 80 percent of the diet 
and which demands more Siuai labor 
than any other occupation. The Siuai 
cultivate a field once, then allow it to lie 
fallow for a minimum of 5 years. There 
are several alternative designs to the pat- 
tern of shifting fields, but even under the 
most ideal system known to the Siuai at 
least five units of land not under imme- 
diate cultivation must exist for every unit 
in operation, or there is danger of fam- 
ine. Oliver makes it clear that popula- 
tion in this area is far from the saturation 
point in terms of the productive capacity 
of native agriculture, but food shortages 
can occur locally. If the reader is puzzled 
at the seeming contradiction, he is urged 
to read Oliver's brief account of the labor 
involved in clearing virgin ground-it 
will thcn bccome quite clear why the 
Siuai men prefer to return to previously 
used land. 

As a matter of fact, the field-clearing 
job done by the Siuai men was much 
more onerous and time consuming before 
their contact with Europeans. The differ-
ence can be laid to the greater efficiency 
of the new mctal tools. This change, in 
combination with the cffects of the pax 
A~istralianus,is said bv Olivcr to be re- 
sponsible for the major changes that he 
believes have occurred within Siuai so- 
ciety in rhe past several decades. But 
before Oliver permits himself such gen- 
eralizations and conclusions, he has taken 
us through a detailed and very neatly or- 
ganizcd treatment of the major aspects 
of Siuai culture. 

'The book begins with a gcnrral orien- 

tation-a concise treatment of the eco-
logical background, followed by an efFcc- 
tive picture of the world as it is sccn, 
more or less, by a Siuai. This is managed 
by a clever manipulation of native myth- 
ology and genealogy against a back-
ground of analytic insights provided by 
the anthropologist. 

The author then turns to the social or- 
ganization, bringing the material to the 
reader through ever-widening frames of 
reference, households, hamlets, larger 
kinship groups, and, finally, associations. 
Next, he returns to Siuai economy and 
lays the basis for an extensive treatment 
of leadership, its structure and functions. 
The book concludes with general state- 
ments and conclusions of several differ- 
ent types, only one of which is repre- 
sented by the foregoing remarks. 

Among Oliver's most interesting gen- 
eralizations is his thematic analysis of 
Siuai, which, despite merely tangential 
reference to Morris Opler, is strongly 
reminiscent of that author's treatment of 
Chiricahua Apache. There is an impor- 
tant difference, however, in Oliver's di- 
vision of Siuai ideology into four distinc- 
tive and fairly discrete sets of th~nies  
dealing with kinship, ranking, Austra-
lian-derived administration, and "mis-
sion ideology." These different sets of 
themes may conflict, and, indeed, Oliver 
indicates that acculturation may be in 
part described in terms of thc shifting 
significance of the various sets of themes. 
I-Ir does not, however, see these ideologics 
as motive forces. Two of them, the ad- 
ministrative and mission ones, are ob-
vioiisly externally derived and histori-
cally late; they may be the shape of the 
future but they are not yet (1939) domi- 
nant or even particularly ascendant. As 
for the remaining two, Oliver makes the 
hypothesis that a major technologic 
change (metal tools for clearing gardens, 
page 470) and a major alteration in pol- 
ity (the substitution of the pax Brita~lnica 
for indigenous warfare, pnge 423) pro- 
duced a trend "away from other systems 
towards a more elaborate, a more time- 
occupying, and a more potent decision- 
influencing rank system" (page 466). 

After this brief sketch of the contents 
of Oliver's book, which gives only the 
smallest clue to its breadth of treatment 
and treasury of detail, it may come as a 
surprise to the reader that Oliver, in his 
preface, regards his own work rather nar- 
rowly as descriptive and only in the most 
peripheral sense thcoretical or "related 
to theory formation." I may be reading 
things into this book that the author 
~vould reject, but I believe that his for- 
mulation of the different and somewhat 
competing ideologies and his attempt 
to tie them to underlying conditions 
of technology and social organization 
represent a high level of theoretical ac- 
tivity. 
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