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ancl M. College, Still~vater. Incluiries re- 
garding the institute at the University of 
Wisconsin should be addressed to Prof. 
Harvey Sorum, Department of Chemis- 
try, LTni\,crsity of IVisconsin, Madison. 

HARRYC. KEILY 

ATational Sciencc Foundation, 
l17ashington 25, D.C. 

N e w  A A A S  Associate Society 

The  Council of American Bioanalysts 
\vas formed \\.it11 the primary purpose of 
bringing together people who direct, per- 
form, or teach analyses as they are ap- 
plied to medical laboratory procedure 
or related fields. T h e  term bioanalyst 
\vas coined from the prefix bio and the 
\\orcl analzsst to describe an individual 
who by training and competence is cap- 
able of directing or teaching analytical 
procedure inl,ol\,ing the biological sci-
ences. 

IVhile the first members were clra~vn 
from state clinical laboratory associa-
tions, provision for membership was 
made for other scientific ~vorkers with 
identical interest. Accordingly, labora-
tory officers in the armed forces, tech- 
nical laboratorians from public health 
laboratoriec, and university professors 
teaching curricula in these areas have 
become members. 

T h e  administrative organization con-
sists of a national board of directors and 
five regional boards. T h e  officers serve" 
in dual capacities as national and rc-
gional representatives. Scientific activi- 
ties of the society are concentrated in an 
internal council knoxvn as the scientific 
council. Officers to staff this are elected, 
and some of them serve simultaneously 
on the national board. All meetings, 
evaluation studies, publication of scicn- 
tific journals, aild studies of the utility 
of cour,es offered for academic instruc- 
lion are governed through this council. 

1 he most important project under-
taken so far has been a general evalua- 
tion of laboratory routine and methods. 
The  program is divided into t\\ o general 
categories; one conrists of 25 laboratories 
selected on the basis of previous per-
formance; the sccoilcl consists of a n  in- 
cletcrminate number of laboratories .that 
accept specimens to check routine pro- 
cedures within their institutions. The  
first group acts as a control unit for the 
preparation of samples issued to the 
A -
second, ancl in addition conclucts evalu- 
ation of specific methods or technics. 
This entire program has been under the 
direction of Ncll Hollingcr, an associate 
professor in the School of Public Health 
at the University of California, Berkeley. 

Publication of a quarterly journal, 
Abstracts of Bioanal~t ic  Technology,  has 
provided coverage of technical, bioana- 
lytical literature in a manner not previ- 

ously offered by other publications. 
Under the editorial direction of H .  E. 
MacDaniels of the Illinois State Depart- 
ment of Public Health, a group of edi- 
tors scattered throughout the United 
States scan and select a,rticles. These are 
professionally abstracted by the Crerar 
Library staff in Chicago and published 
~vithin3 months of their original appear- 
ance. 

Emphasis has been placed on regional 
meetings ~vithin a geographic area small 
enough to  allow the greatest number to 
participate. T h e  society has established 
a policy of inviting the attendance a t  
meetings of members of all other scicn- 
tific societies ~vithin the area concerned. 
National meetings are usually held in 
conjunction with one of the regional 
meetings. 

The  past t~vo  presidents have been 
Donald Abel of Chicago and William 
Reich of JValnut Creek, Calif. The  pres- 
ent president is Marion Dooley, dire( tor 
of a clinical laboratory in Dallas, Tcx. 
The  president-elect is Thomas S. Hosty, 
director of the Alabama State Dcpart- 
ment of Public I-Iealth Laboratory a t  
Montgomery. 

I n  a special tribute Margaret Beattie, 
an outstanding educator and a professor 
in the School of I'ublic Health at the 
L'niversity of California, Berkeley, was 
made an honorary member of the coun- 
cil. A lecture series named in her honor, 
the Margaret Beattie lecture, was created 
as an annual evcnt. Tlie inaugural paper 
\\-as presented in January 1955 by Rlax- 
\\-ell S. Wintrobe, professor of medicine 
of the University of Utah. The  second 
~vill  be delivered on 4 Fcb. in San Fran- 
cisco, by 1,inus Pauling, Xobel laureate 
in chemistry and professor of chemistry 
at California Institute of Technology. 

The  council ellgages in a ~lurnber of 
other programs designed for the benefit 
of its members. Notable among these is 
an insurance program for those in ap- 
plied bioanalysis that provides malprac- 
tice coverage. Another is the preparation 
of a series of handbooks that are being 
assembled for future publication under 
the general title "The handbsok of bio- 
analytic technology." Still a~lothcr is a 
program of impro1,ing educational facili- 
ties for present and future members. 

LUCIEND. HF,RTF.R.~ 
E.xucutive Secrctai-y 

490 Post St., San Francisco 2, Calif. 

Radioisotope Dis t r ibut ion 

T h e  Atomic Energy Commission an-
ilounced issuance on 11 Jan, of a revised 
regulation, "Licensing of byproduct ma- 
tcrial," that removes certain restrictions 
on the sale of radioisotopes abroad and 
simplifies procedures governing domestic 
distribution. T h e  regulation is effective 

cn 10 Feb.; it replaces the existing radin- 
isotopes-distribution regulation, which 
was first issued in 195 1. 

T h e  revised regulation makes more 
conveniently available to scientists in 
other countries radioactive materials for 
use in medicine, agriculture, industry, 
and the physical sciences. Iiesr~arch 
groups abroad may now deal directly 
with production and distribution centers 
in this country. In  the United States ihe 
revision will help American research 
~vorkers and the gro'rving body of raclio- 
isotope users by raising the limit on 
quantities of radioactive materials avail- 
able to each user under general license. 

In  issuing the revised rrgulation, .the 
AEC said that its usual practice of p u l ~  
lishing a proposed regulation and invit- 
in^ comment xvas not follo~t-ed because u 

the revisions made arc for the most part 
designed to remove certain existing rc-
strictions ancl to clarify prcscnt provi-
sions. and not to imaose additional 1e- 
quiremcnts on licensees or applicants. 
I n  connection with consideration of 
further amendments, interested persons 
rnay submit \\litten comments and sug- 
gestions to the U.S. Atomic Energy Com- 
mission, Washington 25, D.C., attcn-
tion the Director, Di1,ision of Civilian 
Application. 

Sa lk  Vacc ine  in Massachuset ts  

P A  re.port on the effectivcness of the 
Salk 1,accine in last summer's polio-
niyelitis epidemic in hlassachusetts has 
been compiled by the Massachusetts De- 
partment of Public Health under a 
grant from the National Foundation for 
Infantile Paralysis. T h e  report appeared 
in the 19 Jan. issue of the Nuzu England 
Jonrnal of Medicine. I t  states that onc 
injection \\-as 60 percent effective against 
all paralytic poliomyelitis, 66 percent cf- 
fpcti\,e against bulbospinal poliornyelitis, 
and 65 percent effective against bulbar 
poliomyelitis. 

(1% U.S. Public Health Service analy- 
sis of paralytic poliornyelitis in 11 other 
states, made on 15 Xov., showed vaccine 
effectiveness levels for 1955 ranging 
from 55 to 91 percent, and avcraging 76 
percent. Last April's report by Thomas 
Francis, Jr., on the vaccine used in the 
1951 field trials gave an effectivcncss of 
from 60 to 90 percent for children who 
had received three injections in a 5-week 
period.) 

T h e  Massachusetts report said that 
"no conclusions should be dra\vnX from 
the figures on results of more than one 
injection ol accime, because relatively 
feu cases were tabulated. But the cffec- 
tivcncss for t u o  or more shots was esti- 
mated at 69 percent against all paralytic 
poliomyelitis. 

This means that 157 paralytic cases 
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