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The Science of Politics 

T HE recent publication of a five-volume report on 
Presidential Nominating Politics in 1952, pre- 

pared under the auspices of the American Political 
Science Association, affords an appropriate occasion 
for remarking on the status of the science of politics. 
It was in a spirit of bravery, if not of bravado, that 
the American Political Science Association was 
formed 50 years ago. Scientific research in the field 
of politics was to be the true hallmark of the profes- 
sion. But in the intervening years, many other activi- 
ties have been allowed to pass as political science that 
are much less strenuous and much less dangerous. 
The recent project was an attempt, among other 
things, to bring renewed attention to a central area of 
professional concern. 

The project started modestly emugh as an effort 
to learn something currently about how the delegates 
to the national political conventions were being se- 
lected in the spring of 1952 in about 15 states. A re- 
markable outpouring and mobilization of voluntary 
efforts eventually produced reports for all 48 states. 
These reports covered not only the methods of selec- 
tion but also the composition of the delegations, their 
instructions, their voting behavior a t  the conventions, 
and what happened to them after they went home. 

This observational material has been sifted, organ- 
ized, edited, surrounded by an apparatus of general 
reference material on politics in the 48 states, and 
published in the four regional volumes of the report. 
Volume I of the report contains historical, analytical, 
and theoretical approaches to the problem. The report 
as a whole is probably the most elaborate effort to de- 
scribe and analyze a complicated phenomenon on a 
48-state basis that has ever been completed. 

Participants would, nevertheless, be the first to ad- 
mit that the effort represents no more than an appli- 
cation of rudimentary types of scientific method. The 
only excuse is the fact that there is no part  of the 
American political system that is more mysterious, 
more bewildering, or more chaotic. I f  Ostrogorski's 
description of the national political conventions, writ- 
ten a half-century ago as an eyewitness account and 
still widely quoted in the textbooks, is to be regarded 
as a first approximation, the present effort is not much 
more than a second. There is need for a third approxi- 
mation that will get closer to an adequate description 
of those elements of reality that may be found to have 
some continuing importance. 

As political science moves into its second half-cen- 
tury as an organized profession, i t  can be hoped that 
there will be many future projects that will undertake 
to observe and describe the phenomena of politics and 
to develop the necessary techniques of classification 
and analysis. The social sciences have recently been en- 
riched by many advances in methodology that are per- 
tinent to scientific research in politics. What is needed 
increasingly i s  some plan or system for the conduct 
of research in politics that will utilize the more ad- 
vanced methodologies while also applying them in 
simultaneous field research throughout the country. 
This is not an easy goal to achieve, but progress in 
that direction can be anticipated. 

P A U L  T. DAVID 
Editor-in-Chief 
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