
Council, chairman; Lt.-Col. I<. S. Maclachlan, acting 
deputy minister (Naval and Air),  Department of 
National Defence; Colonel H.  Des Rosiers, acting 
deputy minister (Militia), Department of National 
Defence; W. R. Campbell, chairman, W a r  Supply 
Board. S. J. Cook, officer-in-charge, Research Plans 
and Publications Section, the National Research Coun- 
cil, has been named secretary of the board. 

The Inventions Board has made all its appointments 
from among the members of the Public Service in 
Canada. This has been done partly a s  a measure of 
economy, but more particularly because officials of 
the National Research Council and of the various gov- 
ernment departments are well qualified to serve as 
members of a committee to examine inventions and 
ideas and to segregate those which offer promise of 
useful application from those which are technically 
unsound. The secretary of the board and the mem- 
bers of the examining committee have been chosen 
from the staff of the National Research Council. The 
members of the consulting panel, to whom doubtful 
questions will be referred, include the four directors 
of the laboratory divisions of the National Research 
Council, representatives from each of the three Ser- 
vices (Savy, Militia and Air),  of the Department of 
National Defence, and appointees from the staffs of 
the W a r  Supply Board and the Patent Office. 

All proposals received will be considered in the first 
instance by the examining conmlittee. Those which 
offer promise will be reviewed by members of the con- 
sulting panel, and the proposals which meet with the 
approval of these two groups will then be considered 
by the board. 

EXPEDITION T O  T H E  CARIBBEAN 

Two members of the expedition to the Caribbean 
of the Field Museum-Rudyerd Boulton, Jr. ,  curator 
of birds, and D. Dwight Davis, assistant curator of 
anatomy and osteology-have returned to Chicago. 
The expedition was led by Leon Mandel, a Chicago 
merchant, on his yacht Buccaneer. 

Since the first of January the Buccalteer has been 
pi.loted between and around the coral reefs and 
through remote and tortuous channels, purposely seek- 
ing out all the spots which the navigators of most 
vessels try to avoid. 

The places vkited-Cuba, Honduras, Mexico and 
British Honduras, some of them scarcely a square 
mile in extent-are of great interest biologically. 
The collections include approximately 150 exotic birds, 
350 reptiles and amphibians, 500 specimens of fishes, 
many of them vari-colored and strange in form and 
quantities of mollusks, marine invertebrates, micro-
scopic creatures accumulated in masses known as 
plankton and other minute organisms. I n  most of 
these places little or no scientific collecting had been 
done before. 
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At Half Moon Cay, British Honduras, after mate- 
rial had been collectjed for  exhibits representing a 
great colony of red-footed boobies which live there, a 
storm of hurricane force suddenly struck the Bucca-
neer, causing the breakage and loss of heavy chains 
and anchors and a hurried departure out to sea for  
safety. 

The most isolated of the islands visited was Swan 
Island, which consists of two mile-square specks of 
land belonging to the United Sta.tes. I t  lies almost 
midway between Cuba, Honduras and the Yucatan 
Peninsula. There the expedition obtained specimens 
of h'elson's yellow warbler and a species of palm 
lizard, both of which are  hermit-like creatures, inhab- 
iting, so f a r  as is known, no other place. Also col- 
lected there were representatives of a nesting colony 
of brown boobies and various sea birds. 

What is perhaps the largest colony of sea birds in  
the West Indies was found on Mujeres, Cancun and 
Contoy Islands off the coast of Yucatan. So f a r  as 
known, no other ornithologists have reached these 
spots before. There collections were made of pelicans, 
co~morants, frigate and other birds, including, on 
Contoy, a specimen of the great white heron. 

I n  the Bay Islands, belonging to the Republic of 
Honduras, the expedition obtained snakes and lizards 
by the hundreds. Off Glover's Reef, British Hon- 
duras, using a special small motor cruiser carried 
aboard the larger vessel, the principal fish collections 
were obtained in the waters over a coral reef, fifteen 
miles long and five miles wide, which represents the 
ultimate development of coral reefs .to be found in the 
West Indies. I n  the clear water, fish could be seen to 
depths of about 100 feet, swimming among the coral 
"trees" as much as thirty to forty feet in height. 

Other places in which collections were made are 
Xisteriosio Bank, Rio Encancada (Enchanted River) 
in the Zapata Swamp of Cuba and Turneffe Cay. The 
primary objectives of the expedition were to make an 
assay of the wild life of these little known places, and 
to obtain f o r  the museum exhibits and study collec- 
tions a representation of the faunas of such circum- 
scribed ranges fo r  comparison with other faunas 
which usually range for  thousands of miles. 

TIMEPIECES O F  T H E  JAMES ARTHUR 

COLLECTION AT NEW YORK 


UNIVERSITY 


THE James Arthur Collection of Clocks and Watches 
at  New York University, already one of the largest in 
the world, recently was augmented by the acquisition 
of 275 antique timepieces, comprising the entire col- 
lection of the late John Arthur, of Brooklyn. I t  has 
also been increased by the acquisition of a number of 
rare early American and English c!ocks, including 
works of Simon Willard, David Rittenhonse, Theodore 
R. Timby and John Arnold. The watches, dating back 


