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sects but also timber damage caused by borers and 
other insects which caused reduced timber values, 
affected chances of forest reproduction and impeded 
the growth of trees. A large amount of timber 
damaged by insects lends itself to salvaging opera- 
tions. 

The annual loss by decay has been estimated to 
be 300,000,000,000 board feet. Timber losses caused 
by erosion of soil are small, since the presence of tree 
stands are a protection against erosion, except in 
small areas, such as the banks of streams. 

Although timber is being cut from some land to 
permit extension of farm areas, the amount of land 
formerly used for farming and allowed to revert to 
classification as "forest land" is larger. Any losses 
of timber resources that otherwise might take place 
are thus offset. 

The Forest Service is now making a survey of 
forests in the United States which will require several 
years for completion. Survey work already has ad- 
vanced in the Pacific Northwest region and in some 
other sections. 

THE FIELD MUSEUM OF NATURAL 

HISTORY 


THE annual report of Mr. Stephen C. Simms, the 
director of the Field Museum of Natural History, 
a book of 256 pages with twenty photogravure illus- 
trations, has been issued. The museum was the re- 
cipient of a number of noteworthy benefactions 
during the year. Gifts received for various purposes 
include $154,547 from Mr. Stanley Field, president 
of the institution; and $166,000 from Mr. Marshall 
Field, of New York, a trustee. 

After allocation of all contributions, and all income 
from the museum's endowments and other sources, 
the museum ended the year with an unprovided for 
operating deficit of $114,898. Total expenditures for 
the year, including general operating expenses, pur- 
chases of collections, cost of expeditions (excluding 
those privately financed for the museum by various 
sponsors), equipment, the N. W. Harris Public 
&hool ~ x t e n i i o i  of the Museum, and the James 
Nelson and Anna Louise Raymond Foundation for  
Public School and Children's Lectures, amounted to 
$920,110. Mr. George A. Richardson was elected a 
trustee to fill the vacancy on the board caused by 
the death of Chauncey Keep. 

Mr. Simms reports that the museum received 
1,322,799 visitors during the year, and in addition, 
outside activities conducted by its units known as the 
N. W. Harris Public School Extension, and the 
James Nelson and Anna Louise Raymond Founda- 
tion, reached approximately 716,000 children in the 
schools, a t  camps, community centers and elsewhere. 

The report gives detailed accounts of the work of 
seventeen expeditions which the museum had in 
operation both in this country and in distant parts 
of the world during 1930. Most important of these 
were the Vernay-Lang Kalahari Expedition, the Field 
Museum Archeological Expedition to the Southwest 
(financed from a fund established by Julius Rosen- 
wald and the late Augusta N. Rosenwald), the two 
Chancellor-Stuart-Field Museum Expeditions to the 
South Pacific and to Aitutaki (Cook Islands), an ex- 
pedition to Africa sponsored and led by Captain 
Harold A. White, of New York, and Major John 
Coats, of London; an expedition to India sponsored 
and led by C. Suydam Cutting, the Field Museum- 
Oxford University Joint Expedition to Kish, Meso- 
potamia, the Frederick H. Rawson-Field Museum 
Ethnological Expedition to West Africa and the Mar- 
shall Field Botanical Expedition to the Amazon. 

A new exhibition hall devoted to marine mammals 
was opened, and throughout the museum a large 
number of new exhibits illustrating anthropological, 
botanical, geological and zoological subjects mere in- 
stalled. Work mas begun on preparation of two new 
halls which will be devoted to comprehensive exhibits 
relating to prehistoric man and to physical anthro- 
pology. Hundreds of gifts of material for  addition 
to exhibits and study collections were received from 
donors located in all parts of the United States and 
many foreign countries. 

THE AMERICAN PHILOSOPHICAL SOCIETY 
THE American Philosophical Society, Philadelphia, 

will hold its annual meeting on April 23, 24 and 25. 
The president, Dr. Francis X. Dercum, and the vice- 
president, Dr. Henry Norris Russell, of Princeton 
University, will preside over the session. Dr. Russell 
will give the evening lecture on "The Chemistry of the 
Stars." The annual dinner will be given a t  the Belle- 
vue-Stratford Hotel on Saturday evening. A large 
number of papers will be presented on the opening 
day and a symposium has been arranged on "The 
Changing World," which is as follows : 

SECTIONI. IN THE NATURALTENDENCIES 
SCIENCES 

"The Astronomer 's Goal ": Frank Schlesinger, director 
of the Yale University Observatory. 

"The Assault on Atoms and Molecules": Arthur H. 
Compton, professor of physics, University of Chi-
cago. 

"Hopes in the Biological Sciences' ': William Morton 
Wheeler, professor of ent,omology and dean of the 
Bussey Institution for Research in Applied Biology, 
Harvard University. 

('Lengthening the Span of Life": Lee K. Frankel, sec- 
ond vice-president of the Metropolitan Life Insur- 
ance Company. (Introduced by Dr. I-Iuebner.) 



336 XCIENCE VOL. 73, NO. 1891 

"Technology and Material Progress ": Dr. Willis R. 
Whitney, director of the Research Laboratory of the 
General Electric Company, Schenectady. (Intro-
duced by Dr. Rice.) 

SECTION11. TENDENCIESTHE FIELDOF TREIN 

SOCIALSCIENCES 
"Economic Adjustment in a Machine Age": Ernest M. 

Patterson, professor and head of the Department of 
Economics, University of Pennsylvania. (Intro-
duced by Dr. Johnson.) 

"Communications and World Peace": Speaker to be 
announced. 

"Unemployment and Its Social Significance": Arthur 
Woods, chairman of President Hoover's Emergency 
Committee for Employment. (Introduced by Presi- 
dent Dercum.) 

"Thou Shalt Not": James M. Beck, Member of Con- 
gress.

'( Scientific Knowledge and Human Conduct ": Speaker 
to be announced. 

SECTION111. THE CBANGING WORLD 
"Round Table Discussion and Recommendations": 

Edwin G. Conklin, professor of biology, Princeton 
University. 

SCIENTIFIC NOTES AND NEWS 

THE Executive Committee of the American Associa- 

tion for the Advancement of Science will hold its reg- 
ular spring meeting a t  the Cosmos Club in Washing- 
ton on Sunday, April 26, with a forenoon and an 
afternoon session. Business to come before the com- 
mittee a t  this meeting should be in the permanent 
secretary's office, Smithsonian Institution Building, 
Xiashington, D. C., by April 20. 

MAJOR GENERAL A. W. GREELY will observe his 
eighty-seventh birthday on March 27. 

DR. ALEXIS CARREL, of the Rockefeller Institute for 
Medical Research, has been chosen as recipient of the 
Dr. Sofie A. Nordhoff-Jung prize for 1930 for his 
outstanding work in the field of cancer. Dr. Carrel 
will receive the diploma and a check for $1,000 from 
Dr. Nordhoff-Jung a t  ceremonies at Georgetown Uni- 
versity on March 28. Ambassador von Prittwitz, of 
Germany, will read the diploma. Ambassador Claudel, 
of France, Dr. Carrel's native land, will attend, and 
Dr. W. Coleman Nevils, president of Georgetown 
University, will preside. The citation reads : 'LDr. 
Carrel has added new laurels to his great achieve- 
ments in surgery by expanding the method of tissue 
culture, and by its objective application he has vastly 
aided in the elucidation of fundamental questions re- 
lating to morbid growth, especially the development 
of malignant tumors." 

ON the occasion of the seventy-sixth birthday of Mr. 
Andrew W. Mellon, Secretary of the Treasury, on 
March 24, the American Institute of Chemists an-
nounced the award of its medal jointly to Xr.  -4ndrew 
W. Mellon and Bfr. Richard B. &[ellon for &tin- 
guished service to the science and profession of chem- 
istry. Dr. Frederick E. Breithut, president of the 
American Institute of Chemists and head of the de- 
partment of chemistry a t  the Brooklyn College, in 
making the announcement, said: "The institute medal 
is awarded annually for distinguished and outstanding 

Mr. Andrew W. &Iellon and Mr. Richard B. Mellon 
have contributed to the advancement of chemistry in 
its broadest aspects and have fostered the progress of 
industry by their far-seeing and unselfish efforts. 
Through the agency of the Mellon Institute of Indus- 
trial Research they have been leaders in the great for- 
ward march of the American chemical industry. This 
medal is awarded annually and usually to someone 
outside the chemical profession itself. I n  1929, the 
award was made to Mr. and Mrs. Francis P. Carvan; 
in 1930, to Mr. George Eastman." 

SIR JAMESHOPWOODJEANS, will receive who a 
Franklin Medal from the Franklin Institute, Phila- 
delphia, on May 20, will afterwards spend two weeks 
at the Mount Wilson Observatory. 

DR. J. PLAYFAIR professor emeritus MCMURRICH, 
of anatomy a t  the University of Toronto, has been 
appointed a corresponding member of t,he Cornit4 
Internationale dyHistoire des Sciences of Paris. 

DR. KONRADE. BIRUHAUG,associate professor of 
bacteriology a t  the University of Rochester School 
of Medicine and Dentistry, has been elected a member 
of the Norwegian Academy of Sciences. 

DR. ALBRECHT PENCK,of the University of Berlin, 
has been elected a corresponding member of the Geo- 
logical Society of America. 

DR. HANS WINKLER, professor of botany at Ham- 
burg, has been elected a member of the Swedish 
Academy of Sciences. 

DR. CARL CORRENS, professor of genetics a t  the 
University of Berlin, has been elected a member of 
the Academy of Sciences a t  U~sa la .  

THE National Geographical Society of Cuba, a t  its 
annual meeting on March 17, awarded its gold medal 
to M. Georges Claude, a member of the Paris Acad- 
emy of Sciences, who has been using the waters of 
Matanzas Bay to generate electric current from 

services to the science and profession of chemistry.therma1 differences. 


