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Dunbar, of Yale, R. T. Chamberlin, of Chicago, 
Branson and Mehl, of Missouri, and Bridge, of the 
Missouri School of Mines. I n  addition there were 
more than twenty petroleum geologists from Kansas 
and Oklahoma. To L. W. ICesler, of Wichita, presi- 
dent of the Kansas Geological Society, is due much 
of the credit for the success of the conference. 

THE COMMITTEE ON SEISMOLOGY OF THE 
BRITISH ASSOCIATION 

FORthirty-one years a committee appointed by the 
British Association has published an annual report 
on seismological investigation. Under the chairman- 
ship of Professor H. H. Turner, it works in close asso- 
ciation with an international body which with financial 
help from the Royal Society is trying to bring up to 
date summaries of the observed details of earthquakes 
all over the world. Summaries up to the end of 1923 
have been issued, and those for the greater part of 
1924 are well in hand. From these exact knowledge 
of the transmission of earthquake shocks is gradually 
being obttlined, and the existence of anomalous cases 
is being verified. 

When it happens that there are a number of good 
recording stations reasonably near the center of an 
earthquake, special information can be derived from 
their records as to the nature of the upper layers of 
the earth's crust. The Jersey and Hereford earth- 
quakes of 1926 yielded specially useful results in that 
respect. British earthquakes have been rare, but in 
August, 1926, there was one at Hereford and Ludlow, 
on January 24, 1927, one'in Scotland and on 3'ebl-u- 
ary 17 last one in Jersey. Yorkshire appears to have 
had an earthqualie a t  Tadcaster on a recent eve-
ning, but seismological apparatus is not of a kind 
that can be carried about, and the members of the 
committee in their report to the section were reticent 
as to this manifestation. 

The committee reported that the Palestine earth- 
quake of July 11,although serious and causing much 
local injury and many deaths, was not of unusual vio- 
lence. The intensify of its indications on the Oxford 
seismograms was much less than in the case of the 
earthquake in China on May 22, although the latter 
was a t  a much greater distance. 

The University of Oxford has sanctioned the exten- 
sion of the university observatory to provide a home 
for two Milne-Shaw pendulums, and a bequest of 
£1,000 from.the late Professor John Milne, one of the 
chief founders of seismology, has been put in a trust 
fund, the income to be at the disposal of the chairman 
for the time being of the seismological committee of 
the British Association. 

THE NATIONAL ARBORETUM 
PLANSfor the, establishment of the National Ar- 

boretum, authorized by the last congress, have been 
discussed, according to The Zzcseuna News, at  informal 
meetings of the newly appointed advisory council. 
With the probability that an appropriation for the 
purchase of land will be passed at the next session, 
a!ong with the deficiency bill, of which it forms a part, 
various phases of the project are now receiving con- 
sideration. 

The Department of Agriculture has estimated that 
about a year will be necessary, in which to acquire 
land, before the actual laying out of the grounds can 
begin. In  the plans already discussed, emphasis has 
been laid upon the research features, which are to be 
somewhat subordinated to recreational aspects. 

The site, which has been tentatively selected, lies 
upon the Anacostia River, within four miles of the 
center of Washington. Part of the land is now under 
government ownership, and is being reclaimed from 
its original swamp condition. The location of the ar- 
boretum at this point means that eventually it will 
lie along or near the proposed new parkway entrance 
to the city. A new boulevard, which will connect 
Washington with the northern and eastern cities will, 
at some future time, be opened up along the Ana- 
costia valley, in which the arboretum site is also 
located. 

It is pointed out by officials of the Department of 
Agriculture that the selection of Washington for the 
site of an arboretum will secure an average climatic 
condition about midway between that of the extreme 
northern states and those along the southern border. 
They also predict that there will be very close co-
operation between the various institutional herbaria, 
city and state botanical gardens and the various propa- 
gating stations operated by the federal govei-nment in 
California, Florida, Georgia, Maryland and other 
states. The work of introducing foreign plants will 
be greatly facilitated thereby and the agricultural 
explorations of the government will also assist in the 
building u p  of the herbarium. 

BIOLOGY AT THE CALIFORNIA INSTITUTE 
OF TECHNOLOGY 

THE trustees of the California Institute of Tech-
nology have voted to establish a department of 
biology and to erect a t  once biological laboratories; 
so that the institute may, in the autumn of 1928, 
initiate major lines of research and offer courses of 
study, both graduate and undergraduate, in that sci- 
ence. Professor Thomas H. Morgan, now professor 
of experimental zoology a t  Columbia University, has 
accepted the position of chairman of the new divi-


