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THE STRUCTURE OF ATOMS AND THE 

EVOLUTION OF THE ELEMENTS 


AS RELATED TO THE COM-

POSITION OF THE 


NUCLEI OF 

ATOMS. 


I1 

The elements have thus been found to 

fall into two series :first, those of even, and 
second, those of odd, atomic number. Now, 
if'the theory presented for the structure of 
the atoms is correct, then it should be pos- 
sible to k d  some difference between the 
two series with reference to their proper- 
ties. Since, however, this part of the 
theory refers specifically to the structure 
of the nuclei of the atoms, and not to the 
arrangement of the external or non-nu-
clear electrons, it is evident that this dif- 
ference should not be found in those prop- 
erties due to the external electrons, that is 
in the chemical or physical properties. On 
the other hand, the difference should be 
found in any properties inherent in the 
nucleus, and the only property, aside from 
mass and weight (from which our system 
has been devdloped), which has thus far 
been discovered, and which is due to the 
structure of the nucleus of the atom, is that 
of atomic stability. Thus, if an atom loses 
outer electrons, it does not change its 
atomic number, and therefore does not 
change to another element, but if it loses 
nuclear electrons, i t  does change its nu-
cleus, its atomic number is changed, and 
the atom is said to disintegrate-that is, i t  
changes into the atom of another element. 

Our theory therefore indicatss a prob-
able general difference in stability between 
the even- and odd-numbered elements. A 


