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THE SOURCES OF NERVOUS ACTIVITY1 
I CAN not proceed with what I have to 

say withouk speaking first a word of con-
gratulation and thanks to those whose ma- 
terial and intellectual resources have made 
the Scripps Institution for Biological Re- 
search an actuality. Biologists the world 
over are coming to be more and more de- 
pendent for their training and inspiration 
upon just such establishments as thik. The 
introduction into our institutions of learn- 
ing of the laboratory with its unique and 
novel educational methods was indeed a 
vast step in modern progress, but i t  can be 
said in no sense to have rendered super- 
,fluous the laboratory designed for pure re- 
search. This, from the time of Davy and 
Faraday, has retained its original function 
unimpaired and has been the JIIeans of di- 
recting mankind to many of his most profit- 
table lines of endeavor. Such research in- 
stitutions, which by a happy concurrence of 
events have been much on the increase of 
recent years, must always remain the higli- 
est shrines of science. They originate, they 
conserve, they hand on ;'and all this is done 
without the interference of the pedagogue; 
in other words, their scholarship, to use 
that term in its best sense, is of the highest 
order. In  them the true spirit of science is 
better exemplified than in any other type 
of institution that we possess. I t  is there- 
fore a time for congratulation when the 
Scripps Laboratory can open its doors more 
widely than ever before to those who have 
reason to make use of its abundance. 

It has been in such institutions as this 
1 A dedicatory address delivered August 9, 1916, 

at the scripps institution for ~ i ~ l ~ ~ i ~ ~ l~~~~~~~h 

of tho University of California. 



